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INTRODUCTION:  
READING KENNAN IN 
THE 21ST CENTURY

George F. Kennan has achieved enduring distinction as an Amer-
ican diplomat, interpreter of international affairs, and occasion-

al prophet. Inside government, he enjoyed remarkable influence, 
though his policy proposals had consequences he sometimes did 
not intend, and which he even opposed. Outside of government, 
Kennan earned the stature of an accomplished scholar, educating 
and persuading wide audiences through his books and his lectures. 
More than half a century since the peak period of his government 
service, and more than a decade since his passing in 2005, Kennan’s 
legacy continues to resonate.

Kennan was a point of reference in the debates about Russia that 
began in 2014, when some diagnosed the return of a Cold War and 
when many wondered openly about how best to engage Moscow, 
looking back to the elaborate diplomatic maneuvers that defined the 
Cold War as much as outright confrontation ever had. Never purely 
a hawk or a dove, Kennan spoke to the imperatives of confrontation 
and engagement. His was the art of combination, even of contradic-
tion. He could loathe the Soviet government while loving the Russian 
people, and he served the U.S. government while harboring serious 
reservations about democracy and the American people.1

A young diplomat in the 1930s, Kennan eschewed appeasement. A 
careful student of the First World War, he disdained brinksmanship 
and the severing of military from diplomatic action. The author of 



2

containment, he was famously a critic of the Vietnam War. Kennan 
matters today not for any doctrine or static body of ideas but for the 
variety, depth, and the complexity of his formidable legacy.

THE LONG CAREER

Born in 1904, Kennan’s working life ran from the 1920s into the 
21st century. He joined the State Department as a Foreign Service 
officer, which led him to study Russia and the Soviet Union. For this 
purpose, he was sent to Germany, where his first direct Russian 
contacts were with White émigrés, and where he imbibed language, 
literature, and history in the University of Berlin’s Oriental Institute. 
In 1931, he joined the U.S. legation in Riga, Latvia, then an outpost 
for regional diplomacy and for watching the Soviet Union. When 
diplomatic relations were reestablished, he helped set up the U.S. 
Embassy in Moscow, and was the author in the mid-1940s of two 
seminal texts, “The Long Telegram” and the X article.

At the State Department, Secretary George Marshall tasked him 
with creating the Office of Policy Planning, which Kennan did in 1947. 
Only he could have been its first director. At the Office of Policy 
Planning, Kennan helped to conceptualize the Marshall Plan and to 
articulate an American strategy for the Cold War. Kennan would peri-
odically return to the diplomatic life, serving as the U.S. ambassador 
to the Soviet Union (1951–52) and to Yugoslavia (1961–63); but from 
1950 on, his intellect belonged to the public sphere, which Kennan 
sought to educate. 

He remained a bold, prolific voice for as long as he was alive, offer-
ing up his critiques of NATO enlargement and of German unification 
in the 1990s and of the Iraq and Afghanistan wars in the early 21st 
century. Posthumously published diaries revealed something of the 
private Kennan. In all of his writings a distinctive voice is audible: 
historically informed, erudite, literary, wistful, critical, pessimistic, 
analytical, lyrical, acerbic, constructive, and challenging, simultane-
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ously committed to American stewardship in international affairs and 
skeptical that the United States had the wherewithal, the patience, 
and the virtue to be a good steward. Kennan did not think or argue in 
straight lines.

Kennan’s best-known contributions to American foreign policy are in 
the government work he did from 1946 to 1950. He was perfectly 
prepared to guide the early Cold War policy debate. His command 
of the Russian language, of Russian culture and history, coupled 
with an understanding of Soviet high politics gained from living in 
Moscow, were precious commodities in pre-1946 Washington. After 
1946, these skills made Kennan invaluable. He became a celebrity of 
sorts when the poorly hidden secret of his being Mr. X was revealed. 

He had a gift for projecting ideas out from Washington and into the 
bloodstream of national debate and discussion. In the late 1940s, 
Kennan’s temperament contributed to his prowess. He loved defying 
conventional wisdom. He had intellectual élan and excelled at the 
grand sweep of a big idea, the novelty of which he could temper 
with historical example and analogy. His tone was serious and wor-
ried when seriousness and worry were prized, in the anxious years 
between the end of the Second World War and the onset of the Cold 
War. Kennan was also quick-witted and self-aware, a superb public 
speaker, and a superlative writer: he shrewdly anticipated his reading 
audience and took it by the hand to unexpected conclusions. A dra-
matist rather than a simplifier, Kennan’s writing was neither bureau-
cratic nor journalistic. Instead, it was analytical and prescriptive. He 
interpreted the world while proposing ways of changing it.

Kennan did not exactly make policy or even plan policy, despite the 
mark he left on the Office of Policy Planning. His ideas tended to 
crystallize into archetypes, which then had lives of their own. The 
most obvious example is containment, a word that will forever be 
attached to Kennan’s name. Kennan understood containment as the 
opposite of passivity, as an active set of policies that would hem in 
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the Soviet Union, build up the democratic reserves of the United 
States and Western Europe, and hasten or at least capitalize on the 
Soviet Union’s eventual decline. Kennan pegged containment to the 
inherent (long-term) weakness of totalitarian governance. He thought 
the Soviets were exploiting an ideology unpalatable to many Rus-
sians and out of sync with Russian culture. In Kennan’s view, con-
tainment devolved into a global strategy of confronting communism 
by military and covert means. 

Kennan’s response was to differ with a strategic posture that many 
took to be his signature creation and to differ vigorously. Kennan 
also pursued the origins of the misunderstanding in his historical 
research, decrying a legalistic-moralistic impulse in American foreign 
policy, of which Woodrow Wilson was the patron saint.2 Time and 
again, Kennan asked whether the democratic energies of Ameri-
can politics were an obstacle to careful foreign-policy formation. A 
democratic polity could understand and get behind a crusade, and 
it gladly turned the Cold War into one—in the name of containment. 
Thus was containment corrupted, to the detriment of the American 
national interest and of U.S.-Soviet relations. The policy’s corruption 
had historical pedigree, and so a policy problem was transformed, in 
Kennan’s hands, into a scholar’s conundrum.

George F. Kennan and members of the  
Policy Planning Staff, June 1948
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The regretful architect of containment, and the misunderstood 
philosopher of American diplomacy, left no school and no disciples. 
From the beginning, he felt himself to be an outsider, as a Midwest-
erner from a family of relatively modest means, arriving at Princeton 
to begin his higher education. That pedigree and his diplomatic ca-
reer launched him to insider status for a while, but there was some-
thing about government work and something about elite circles in 
Washington that did not suit Kennan. Or perhaps it was he who was 
not suited to government work and to the proverbial Georgetown 
dinner party. 

Whether an insider or an outsider, his writing quickly resonated in 
government. “The trouble with George,” Dean Acheson once said, 
“is that he writes so beautifully, he can convince you of anything.”3 
Yet persuasive as he was on the page, Kennan was not an easy col-
league. He was too tortured, too intimidating, too much the natural 
dissenter—and never one beguiled by creating bureaucratic consen-
sus behind a cherished idea. To Kennan’s credit, he did not skew his 
public writings to mythologize his own government career, to rewrite 
the record, or to avoid responsibility for mishaps. In fact, he focused 
in on the mishaps, speculating about how often he and his country 
fell short of the mark.4 His melancholy was both stylized and sincere, 
his ambition and even his success seemingly a burden to him.

He had to take his ambition away from the capital city, to the Princ-
eton Institute of Advanced Studies and to his house in the Penn-
sylvania countryside. Kennan hardly knew many of the illustrious 
foreign-policy personages who came to Washington after he had 
removed himself to Princeton. He was not a mentor to Henry Kissinger 
or Zbigniew Brzezinski or Richard Holbrooke.5  When the Cold War 
ended, it was the misapplication of containment that continued to 
preoccupy Kennan, the stubborn crusading impulse, and not some 
effort to gather his suggestions from the 1940s into a lasting founda-
tion for a post-Cold War American foreign policy.
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Kennan’s later-in-life isolation from Washington mirrored his lifelong 
alienation from modern America. In his autobiography Vixi, the his-
torian and Sovietologist Richard Pipes offers a memorable, if unflat-
tering, portrait of Kennan. This is Kennan the reactionary, someone 
who “fancied himself an eighteenth-century aristocrat… [and who] 
believed that the eighteenth century was the apex of Western civili-
zation, a civilization that collapsed under the onslaught of the Indus-
trial Revolution… He felt disgusted with the United States as it was 
and resented the influence on it of immigrants.”6 

A paradox shadows Kennan’s diplomatic and scholarly career. There 
was his razor-sharp assessment of the Soviet system, Kennan’s intui-
tive feel for the antipathy many Russians had for Soviet-style mod-
ernization and his belief that Soviet rule would give way to some-
thing more culturally traditional. Then there was his incomprehension 
of the country into which he himself had been born, his pining for 
the lost pre-industrial Protestant village. 

By disposition, Kennan was the least American of modern American 
diplomats. The many 20th century revolutions in technology, in the 
United States and elsewhere, may have disgusted Kennan, but they 
did not much interest him, and yet he was an authority on interna-
tional affairs precisely because he had a knack for peering into the fu-
ture. In this Kennan resembled the historian Henry Adams, grandson 
of John Quincy Adams and great-grandson of John Adams, whose 
elitist rejection of the modern world and of modern America did not 
stop him from making interesting and at times accurate predictions 
about the future. Like Kennan, Adams got much wrong. A few big 
things, such as the destructive potential of modern warfare, Adams 
got all too right (well before World War I). Both Adams and Kennan 
gladly wore the mantle of the anti-modern prophet.7

Perhaps it was Kennan’s reservations about modern times that pre-
vented him from celebrating the end of the Cold War. He did not see 
the collapse of the Soviet Union as a resolution to Europe’s age-old 
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security dilemmas. Nor did he see the arrival of a unified Germany in 
NATO as a spectacular breakthrough for American foreign policy, as 
did much of the American foreign-policy establishment in the 1990s.8 
Kennan emphasized two problems with the international scene 
after the Cold War. One was that Germany might come to dominate 
Europe—not militarily but economically and politically. Kennan even 
proposed developing the once divided city of Berlin into a Europe-
an capital on European rather than German soil. A salutary conse-
quence of doing so, when Kennan floated this idea in 1998, was that 
it would prevent Germany from fully unifying and therefore from 
upsetting the balance of power within Europe.9 

Kennan’s other worry concerned Russia and the security architecture 
that the Clinton administration had devised for Europe, namely the 
enlargement of NATO to include former Soviet satellite states in 
Central and Eastern Europe. Kennan’s strongest statements about 
NATO enlargement appeared in a 1998 New York Times column, 
written by Thomas Friedman. “I think it is the beginning of a new 
cold war,” Kennan declared. “‘I think the Russians will gradually react 
quite adversely and it will affect their policies. I think it is a tragic 
mistake. There was no reason for this whatsoever. No one was 
threatening anybody else. This expansion would make the Founding 
Fathers of this country turn over in their graves. We have signed up 
to protect a whole series of countries, even though we have neither 
the resources nor the intention to do so in any serious way.”10

Referring to the Senate debate on NATO enlargement, Kennan de-
clared that he “was particularly bothered by the references to Russia 
as a country dying to attack Western Europe. Don’t people under-
stand? Our differences in the cold war were with the Soviet Commu-
nist regime. And now we are turning our backs on the very people 
who mounted the greatest bloodless revolution in history to remove 
that Soviet regime.” To this Kennan added that the enlargement of 
NATO “shows so little understanding of Russian history and Soviet 



8

history. Of course there is going to be a bad reaction from Russia, 
and then [advocates of NATO enlargement] will say that we always 
told you that is how the Russians are—but this is just wrong.”11

The father of containment unhappily likened NATO enlargement to 
the restoration of containment—that is, to containment miscon-
strued. He deemed American policy toward post-communist Russia 
a catalogue of errors. In a 1999 interview, he admonished Washing-
ton for heedlessly leaving Crimea attached to Ukraine: “in the case 
of Ukraine, in particular, there was the thoughtless tossing into that 
country, upon the collapse of Russian communism, of the totally un-
Ukrainian Crimean peninsula, together with one of the three greatest 
Russian bases [Sevastopol]. For that we, too, must accept a share of 
the blame.”12 

Worst of all, Kennan worried, the State Department and White 
House had signed on to the cause of promoting democracy within 
Russia. Private citizens might justifiably choose to do this. Non-gov-
ernmental organizations might boldly wave the banner of democracy 
in Moscow, but the form of government in Russia was for Russians 
to determine. “I would urge far greater detachment, on our govern-
ment’s part, from their [Russians’] domestic affairs. I would like to 
see our government gradually withdraw from its public advocacy of 
democratic and human rights.”13 

Kennan applied the same reasoning to U.S.-China relations that he 
did to U.S.-Russian relations. Democracy promotion from abroad 
could not be done and attempting it would poison the healthy course 
of diplomatic interaction. With consistency and impressive vigor for a 
nonagenarian, he decried the legalistic-moralistic strain, the crusad-
ing Wilsonian impulse driving 21st-century American foreign policy 
and inverting the national interest. By Kennan’s lights, a cautiously 
plotted foreign policy grounded in self-awareness and self-criticism 
was as elusive as ever, even or especially after the end of the Cold 
War.
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Kennan lived long enough to see the September 11 attacks. From 
his perspective, the Iraq War demonstrated how little he had taught 
the makers of American foreign policy and how thin his influence 
on the general public had ultimately proven to be. For Kennan, this 
was a far-away war activated by the crusading impulse, the resurrect-
ed dream of making the world safe for democracy, confused in the 
arguments Washington made to the American public and even more 
confused about the cultures and civilizations into which American 
soldiers were being sent.14 

History, Kennan believed, was the necessary guide, the natural com-
panion in the calculation of policy, the roadmap to the territory. History 
could not guarantee outcomes, but it could serve as a measurement 
of what was likely to happen. If there was a historical paradigm into 
which the Iraq War fit, it was the dismal precedent of the colonial war. 
Powerful as the American military would undoubtedly prove, Wash-
ington’s capacity to establish new and viable political structures was, 
nonetheless, miniscule at best. In the Middle East, Americans would 
be perceived as invaders and occupiers, as had been the case in Viet-
nam. Predictably, Kennan was not shy about assaulting the conven-
tional wisdom in Washington circa 2002. This would be the last of the 
great American ventures he found it his duty to oppose. 

LEGACY

Kennan’s legacy cannot be separated from his expertise on Russia 
and his lifelong engagement in U.S.-Russian relations. Nor should it 
be. But immersed as Kennan was in Russian questions, his legacy 
also contributes to our understanding of three much broader ave-
nues of government work and of national life: the craft of diploma-
cy; the relationship between domestic and foreign affairs; and the 
formulation of effective foreign policy. 

For Kennan at mid-century, Russia was patently Soviet, previously 
non-Soviet, and potentially post-Soviet. The Soviet Union inherited 
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imperial Russia’s foreign policy in all the ways that history, geogra-
phy, ethnography, and culture dictate. It was an immense Northern 
territory with uncertain, difficult to defend borders. Kennan did not 
consider either imperial Russia or the Soviet Union to be the West, 
and this distinction was a key to Soviet foreign policy, which Stalin 
based on fear, paranoia, and antipathy toward the West. Marxism-Le-
ninism was merely the vocabulary of his paranoia and antipathy. 
Yet Russia’s non-Western civilization was extraordinary, in Kennan’s 
view, and not to be faulted for being non-Western. Even the despot-
ic Soviet Union could not erase the treasures of Russian language, 
literature, and art, artifacts of a spiritual intensity and creativity that 
Kennan considered both beautiful and indigenously Russian.15 

The West’s challenge, in dealing with Russia, was to contend with 
Soviet hostility, to acknowledge the sources of this hostility—the 
sources of Soviet conduct, as it were—and to know them without il-
lusion and naiveté. The Soviet threat had to be faced squarely, but an 
intelligent threat assessment would not confuse the government’s 
malice with the popular will, and it would be alive to Russia’s distinc-
tive, complicated, and beguiling history and culture. Russia and the 
West, these were Kennan’s preferred categories, and he often paired 
them in his writing. The goal was a relationship that worked rather 
than a civilizational and strategic convergence that would never 
happen.16 

Kennan’s strategic thinking flowed from his image of Russia within 
the Soviet Union and from the fact that Marxism-Leninism “does 
not represent the natural outlook of Russian people,” as he put it in 
“The Long Telegram.” Because Stalin was a monstrous tyrant and 
because his rule relied on violence and deceit, conventional diploma-
cy was impossible. No treaty could be signed that would resolve the 
differences between the United States and Stalin’s or Khrushchev’s 
Soviet Union. Containment was therefore the system of pressure 
that Soviet motives and conduct demanded. Ideally, the pressure 
would hinder the Soviet Union from taking the initiative in Europe 



11

and elsewhere. It would command a chastened Moscow’s respect, 
and the ensuing stalemate would be the cause of the Soviet Union’s 
internal stagnation. 

Because the Soviet government under Stalin and later Soviet lead-
ers was illegitimate, because it had been coercively imposed and 
perpetuated, because it rested on an ideology that was fanatically 
embraced as well as cynically betrayed by the Soviet leadership, 
because the Soviet ideology militated against Russian culture at so 
many points, containment could be shorthand for patience and in 
this sense the opposite of waging war. A militant West, reminiscent 
of Napoleon’s France or Hitler’s Germany, would only serve the inter-
ests of the existing Soviet leadership. If containment could be a tool 
of moderation and restraint, it would subtly underscore the tension 
between the Russian people and the Soviet government. Contain-
ment could discipline the regime-strengthening contest between the 
Soviet Union and the West. In his own mind, Kennan’s containment 
was as much a pro-Russian as it was an anti-Soviet strategy.

The Soviet-Russian differences Kennan embedded in containment 
were the differences only a certain kind of diplomat could see. Since 
diplomacy entails relations among states, a preoccupation with 
governments is the diplomat’s occupational hazard; but the aspiring 
diplomat needs to go beyond states and governments. To do this, 
a diplomat should cultivate extensive area expertise, which begins 
with an excellent command of foreign languages. Foreign languages 
open access to literature and to historical debate and discussions. 
The more business that is conducted in translation the more that will 
be missed or falsely interpreted. 

In a lecture reviewing American diplomacy of the 1890s, Kennan 
lamented “the overestimation of economics, of trade, as factors 
in human events and the corresponding underestimation of psy-
chological and political reactions—of such things as fear, ambition, 
insecurity, jealousy, and perhaps even boredom—as prime movers 
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of events.”17 To get at these psychological and political reactions 
takes time and hard work; it demands a literary imagination. The 
work must be done by a cadre of highly-trained diplomats impervi-
ous to the fads and slogans of democratic politics, which is to say 
sheltered from public opinion and even from democratically elected 
politicians who lack the patience and the wisdom to absorb what the 
imaginative, erudite, and cosmopolitan diplomat knows. Real area 
expertise takes decades to acquire, and communicating its insights, 
once acquired, is an uphill battle, whether because of democratic 
whim or bureaucratic inertia. Democracy is not the natural ally of 
well-wrought diplomacy, though Kennan’s concern was less about 
democracy per se than about the complacency and smugness of 
20th-century American democracy.18

Indeed, Kennan was proudly unsentimental about democracy. He 
tended to regard it as a form of government or as an empty form 
that had to be filled in by leadership, by governance, and by culture. 
Democracy mirrors the relative strengths and weaknesses of the 
society in which it is found. Here Kennan’s attitudes traced a chrono-
logical arc that was not the arc of progress. From the 1920s to the 
1950s, the United States was ascendant. It withstood the cata-
clysms of the 1930s, emerging in the 1940s and 1950s a stronger, 
better country. Franklin Roosevelt embodied much that was best 
in the American spirit—at home and abroad.19 Wartime sacrifices 
helped Roosevelt to win the war. In the postwar years, as the coun-
try changed around him, Kennan’s revulsion mounted. The country 
had lost its way in the Vietnam War, he thought, letting its culture 
dissipate into hedonism, arid secularism, and commercial vulgarity. 
In a 1999 interview Kennan characterized the United States as “the 
world’s intellectual and spiritual dunce,” a phrase evocative of the 
anti-modern mood that was second nature to Kennan.20 Democracy 
was not the reason for this moral and intellectual decline, but Amer-
ican democracy was only as worthwhile as the country behind it. 
Kennan was not cheered by what he saw.



13

More than cultural pessimism was at stake in Kennan’s gloomy 
assessment of postwar American politics and culture. Kennan was 
arguing for the rigorous incorporation of domestic politics in foreign 
policy. This had been a premise of the Marshall Plan, which he had 
had a hand in developing. By minimizing the domestic turmoil and 
despair that was rampant after the war, financial, food, and industrial 
aid harmonized with the stationing of American troops in Western 
Europe. The Marshall Plan was more than an anti-communist tactic. 
It was a nuanced strategy of encouraging political decency in coun-
tries tempted by their own worst instincts. 

The same equation—between decent domestic politics and for-
eign-policy promise—obtained in the United States. Far from the 
Iron Curtain and the Fulda Gap, the outcome of the Cold War would 
turn on the image that foreigners had of American politics. In the 
grand finale of the X article, Kennan appealed to an internal Ameri-
can excellence, contending that foreign-policy success rests on “the 
degree to which the United States can create among the people of 
the world generally the impression of a country which know what it 
wants, which is coping successfully with the problems of its internal 
life and with the responsibilities of a world power and which has a 
spiritual vitality capable of holding its own among the major ideolog-
ical currents of the time.” Propaganda, Olympic medals, symphony 
orchestras, and high-profile chess games were peripheral. Problem 
solving and vision were the decisive Cold War assets.

A GEORGE KENNAN FOR THE 21ST CENTURY

Since Kennan’s death some 15 years ago, a balance has emerged be-
tween his legacy, which withstands the test of time, and the chang-
es that distance our world from Kennan’s. The changes are many and 
encompass the emergence of Putin’s Russia, the rise of China, the 
expansion of the global economy, the acceleration of communica-
tions and other technology, and the division of the United States into 
rival camps, with little in the way of a shared political culture. Kennan 
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chafed against Cold War consensus and post-Cold War triumphalism, 
but he took an American foreign-policy establishment for granted; 
its virtues and vices were built into the political scene. Many of the 
givens of Kennan’s political era are no longer given, both within and 
outside the United States.

The international landscape has diversified since Kennan’s heyday. By 
serving in Moscow and then in Berlin in the 1930s, Kennan believed 
himself to be at the center of the world. Moscow, Berlin, and Wash-
ington were the inevitable focal points for international affairs: if this 
was not really true, it could at least appear to be true in the 1930s 
and 1940s. In the past 40 years, the loci of the international system 
have shifted away from Europe, and it is no longer acceptable for a 
diplomat or scholar of international affairs to have as European a gaze 
as Kennan so obviously did. 

Likewise, Kennan’s Luddite tendencies would be more of a burden 
today than they were in the 1940s. For good or ill, the technology for 
disseminating information has reconstituted international relations, 
introducing new modes of warfare, new styles of leadership, and 
new forms of political consent and dissent, especially in the Western 
democracies. Technology must be factored in; it cannot be placed to 
the side of events. Evolutions in communications technology, in par-
ticular, can themselves be events on par with the signing of a treaty 
or the erasure of a pre-existing border. No doubt Kennan would not 
have gone on Twitter and would have looked askance at those who 
do. But any latter-day Kennan would not have the option of spend-
ing weekends on the farm reading Chekhov, either. The times have 
changed, and the changes are unforgiving to those who would prefer 
to ignore them.

Together, technological change and the diversification of the inter-
national landscape qualify the strategy of containing Russia. So too 
does the vanishing of the Soviet Union. The post-Soviet Kremlin is 
not smoothly representative of the Russian people. President Putin 
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does not rule without coercion, and his government harnesses state-
run media to impose ideological positions on the culture, positions 
that do not emerge organically from public opinion; but the list of 
salient departures from the Soviet past is long and crucial to the 
formation of U.S. policy. 

The distinction Kennan drew, in the 1940s, between the Soviet 
government and the Russian people needs to be reformulated in 
the 21st century. One change is inherent to a post-Soviet Russia. 
The Soviet borders are no more, and today’s Russia is incompara-
bly more Russian than the Soviet Union ever was. Suppressed in 
Soviet times, the Russian Orthodox Church has been brought back 
as a pillar of nationhood. Putin has found his way to a usable past, 
mixing together elements of imperial Russia, elements of the Soviet 
Union, and elements of post-Soviet Russia. Whether weak or strong, 
Putin’s government cannot be as starkly separated from Russia as 
the Soviet state could be. Containment as Kennan charted it in the 
1940s will not have the same final chapter, or the same spectacular 
denouement. 

Another change is external to Russia in the present moment. Un-
like the Soviet Union, Putin’s Russia, if it is to be contained at all, 
will need to be contained in a highly porous information space and 
contained against the will of an ascendant China (as well as a host 
of other countries). Kennan’s idea of containment emerged from a 
bi-polar world and from an information space in which there could 
be such a thing as an iron curtain, as indeed there was between the 
East and West of Europe and between the American-led and Sovi-
et-led Cold War coalitions in the 1940s and 1950s.

Yet Kennan’s containment holds still within it the building blocks of a 
21st century U.S. policy toward Russia. There are three such building 
blocks in 2019. The first is an avoidance of extremes, of fearful pas-
sivity on the one hand and a maximalist military posture on the oth-
er. The second is a focus on the domestic strengths that follow from 
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well-practiced self-government, a focus that includes the capacity to 
be self-critical and open to reform; and the third is an educated abil-
ity to penetrate beyond centuries-old clichés about Russian politics 
and foreign policy especially where the relationships among Russian 
state, society and culture are concerned. From these building blocks, 
an U.S. policy that is proactive, restrained, self-confident and well-in-
formed can be fashioned. 

All diplomatic concepts, even the most durable, apply to a world 
in flux. Most of them fade away quickly. Containment as Kennan 
construed it has retained a peculiar salience. More remarkable than 
an evolving international landscape is the continuing fascination 
with Kennan and with his reasoning behind containment. Of course, 
fascination is understandable in considering the person John Lewis 
Gaddis brought to life in his Pulitzer-Prize-winning biography, George 
F. Kennan: An American Life, which was published in 2011. Gaddis’s 
prosaic title was also revealing. Kennan’s was an American life and 
an American story, after all: the modest Midwestern beginnings, the 
lonely years at F. Scott Fitzgerald’s Princeton, the bold, globe-trotting 
journey forward, the success and the problems of success—and 
then the recreation of things left behind at Kennan’s farm in East 
Berlin, Pennsylvania. 

Kennan was a self-made diplomat and, to borrow a phrase from 
Emerson, he was an American scholar. Instead of a doctoral degree 
he had an autodidact’s curiosity about many subjects. He had John 
Winthrop’s conviction that America could be like a city upon a hill; he 
had Thoreau’s or Jefferson’s skepticism of cities and manufacturing; 
he had John Quincy Adams’s contempt for the fantasy of slaying 
foreign-policy monsters. And there was more than a touch of the Pu-
ritan about Kennan, the rigorous intellectuality and the fear that righ-
teousness was rapidly slipping away, for sin and evil were so close 
at hand. Kennan had the Puritans’ austerity of vision. Kennan himself 
described the X article as 20th-century variation upon the theme of 
a 17th-century Protestant sermon. The X article even concludes with 
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an exhortation to be good and with mention of the responsibilities 
history (read: Providence) “plainly intended” America’s political lead-
ers to bear.21

To posterity Kennan demonstrated that it is possible to know other 
cultures and that, through this knowledge, productive, helpful ideas 
can be generated. Though he believed in an Occident and an Orient, 
in a Western and an Asiatic mind, in fundamental differences be-
tween the West and the “Russian-Asiatic world,” as Kennan termed 
it in the X article, he was the opposite of the stereotypical Orien-
talist. He was eager not to superimpose an American or a Western 
frame onto the Russian picture and vigilant about identifying the 
particularities of a genuinely—and at times obstreperously—foreign 
culture. True diplomacy starts with an awareness of these particular-
ities, and true diplomacy involves the management rather than the 
eradication of incompatible particularities.22 

When Kennan was a rookie diplomat, the United States did not recog-
nize the Soviet Union, so abhorrent were the Soviet particularities to 
the American government. When Kennan was a seasoned diplomat, 
the United States was enmeshed in a Cold War with the Soviet Union, 
with the constant risk of contained hostility turning to open hostility. 
The enmity between Washington and Moscow was longstanding, 
quite possibly intractable. Yet Kennan found countless ways of eluding 
this enmity, of which the best was to discover qualities in the foreign 
culture that were worthy of love. Language and literature were his 
tools. They lifted the mind out of its innate parochialism and chauvin-
ism. Kennan impressed none other than Joseph Stalin with his fluency 
in Russian, and in December 1987 Mikhail Gorbachev approached 
Kennan at a reception, telling him “’Mr. Kennan… we in our country 
believe that a man may be a friend of another country and remain, at 
the same time, a loyal and devoted citizen of his own; and that is the 
way we view you.’”23 Kennan was gratified. It was a gracious compli-
ment, and it confirmed the inner logic of his containment strategy, the 
weakening of enmity through friendship.
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Kennan’s accomplishment with “The Long Telegram,” the X article, 
and the founding of the Office of Policy Planning may not have been 
accomplishment enough for him. Or it may have been the wrong 
kind of accomplishment, but the “misinterpretation” of containment 
was to be expected. No government elegantly executes an idea: 
ideas collide with the inelegant machinery of government, and no 
idea ever survives the collision intact. Kennan the historian knew this 
very well.

Kennan’s accomplishment in his writing and in the office he creat-
ed was to raise the conversation within government to the level of 
ideas. Normally, diplomats and secretaries of state are too busy, too 
beholden to the play of events and personalities, too encumbered by 
the tyranny of procedure to sustain prolonged, nuanced conversa-
tions. The mind-numbing chore of diplomacy is wonderfully captured 
by the phrase “clearing paper,” and for much of the day paper must 
be cleared. Kennan put words to paper and the effect was enlight-
ening. He advanced the conversation, he informed the conversation, 
and in doing so he clarified the choices that President Truman and 
Secretary Marshall had before them. This was a great and lasting 
accomplishment. 

Kennan then doubled this accomplishment by doing in the public 
sphere what he had done behind closed doors at the State Depart-
ment. He advanced and informed the conversation. So cogent and 
probing were his lectures, essays, and books, that they are informing 
and advancing the conversation still.
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Joan Kennan, George F. Kennan, Grace Kennan 
and Annelise Kennan, September 1938.
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REMARKS AT THE  
KENNAN LEGACY 
CONFERENCE

When George Kennan died in 2005, my siblings and I all 
grieved at our personal loss but also at the thought that our 

father’s ideas and influence would be waning as well. It has been a 
complete surprise that not a week goes by without our reading or 
hearing some reference to Kennan and his policies. Most, of course, 
refer to the containment policy, but for us it keeps our father alive.

The question is whether George Kennan is still relevant today, more 
than a century after his birth. In some ways, he is definitely not. 
He certainly never understood or learned to use the new technol-
ogy which has transformed our world. He was definitely European 
focused, but some of that was because his diplomatic posts were all 
in Europe and he married a Norwegian. He had peculiar prejudices—
no interest in South America—and a strong prejudice, for example, 
against the state of California. But he was interested in China and 
the Far East and played an active role in the State Department’s 
stands on Korea at the beginning of the Korean War. 

My father was definitely an elitist in the better sense of the word. 
Kennan felt very strongly about the importance of knowledge. He 
considered that the more you know about a country the more sensi-
tive you can be towards it. He was a strong supporter of the impor-

Grace Kennan Warnecke
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tance of professional diplomats, with foreign language skills and 
in-depth country erudition. In term of what is happening to the State 
Department today—staff cuts, the resignation of senior officials, and 
empty ambassadorial posts—he would be appalled. I can hear him 
fulminating at the breakfast table. 

George Kennan was committed to competence and dedicated to 
professionalism. While he never understood the Internet, he kept 
up an enormous card file which took up half a wall of his office and 
was almost a precursor of the computer. He tracked Russian military 
and politically important figures by reading the Russian press. That 
knowledge often led him to learning of twists in Soviet foreign policy 
before anyone else. When he was ambassador to Moscow, many 
of the foreign ambassadors would come to the American embassy 
to learn what was going on and report back to their governments. Fa-
ther thought that Stalin’s irritation with his extensive knowledge was 
one of the reasons for his being declared persona non grata in 1952. 

In 1974, when I went to the Soviet Union as Senator Ted Kennedy’s 
aide and interpreter, we had a meeting with General Secretary Bre-
zhnev in his Kremlin office. At the beginning of the meeting, Brezh-
nev’s top aide pulled me aside and told me privately how much they 
admired George Kennan. This was 20-plus years after he was kicked 
out of the Soviet Union. 

My father’s emphasis on professionalism was also reflected in 
his deep involvement in the Kennan Institute. He was always very 
proud to have played a role in creating this institution dedicated to 
supporting advanced Russian studies. And he would be thrilled to 
know about the conference held on his life and legacy at the Kennan 
Institute on February 2018. 

Today, when relations with Russia are again strained, the question 
that comes up is whether to go back to a containment policy. My 
father’s view of containment was always political more than military. 
But I think the main reason that he formulated this policy was be-
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cause of his horror of nuclear war. He had traveled around Europe at 
the end of World War II and never got over the loss of human life and 
physical destruction caused by that conflict. He later co-sponsored 
the so-called “gang of four” declaration, along with McGeorge Bun-
dy, Robert McNamara, and Gerard Smith, that called on Washington 
to renounce first use of nuclear weapons. 

His containment policy was also predicated on his gut feeling that 
the Soviet Union was in some way unnatural and thus temporary. 
Ambassador John Beyrle has related the anecdote that when asked 
why the Kennan Institute was named the Institute for Advanced 
Russian Studies he answered, “because the Soviet Union will not 
last, but Russia will.”

The best aspect of what we will retain from George Kennan’s think-
ing is that we have the luxury of choosing the best of his ideas. It is 
amazing how many of those policies are even more applicable today 
than when they were first formulated. He was a prescient man.



George Kennan getting sworn in as U.S.  
ambassador to Yugoslavia (1961) 
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A COMPLEX MAN 
WITH A SIMPLE 
IDEA

When George F. Kennan provided the intellectual underpin-
nings for the Cold War strategy of containment in 1946–47, 

he set a standard that others have striven for but failed to match: 
the articulation of a simple American grand strategy that can guide 
policymakers and the public but that reflects a deep understanding 
of geopolitical dynamics. The effort to combine conceptual simplicity 
with deep global understanding was as valued by the generation 
that emerged after the end of the Cold War as it was for Kennan’s 
contemporaries in the decades that preceded it. There is no conver-
sation about American grand strategy that does not use Kennan as 
its reference point.

A TALENT FOR THE BIG PICTURE

Kennan had a knack for getting the big thing right. He recognized 
in 1946 that the United States needed to protect its core interests 
in Europe, Northeast Asia, and the Middle East by containing Sovi-
et expansionism, particularly through non-military means, and he 
argued that there was a strong possibility that the Stalinist system 
“bears within it the seeds of its own decay” that would result “in 
either the breakup or the gradual mellowing of Soviet power.”24 The 
most spectacular American post-World War II success while Kennan 

James Goldgeier 
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was still serving in government was the Marshall Plan for Western 
Europe. He did so much to help bring it about, and it enabled those 
countries to regain their economic strength and avoid succumbing to 
communist propaganda.

When Soviet foreign policy did mellow under Mikhail Gorbachev in 
the late 1980s, ultimately leading to the breakup of the entire edifice 
of the Soviet bloc and the USSR itself, Kennan appeared to be a ge-
nius for what he wrote in 1946–47. After all, he got the big thing right 
for the right reasons. He was a well-trained Foreign Service officer 
who knew Russia, its culture, and its language. In fact, he knew 
Russia better than he knew the United States, whose society and 
culture were a much bigger challenge for him to comprehend.

Kennan also got the big thing right despite his shortcomings. He 
was an elitist who joined the Foreign Service in part because it was 
a meritocracy and believed foreign policy was best left to Ivy-League 
trained, Northern European, white diplomats. He also believed 
that the Soviet Union, because of its closed nature, had a superior 
foreign policy making process. Kennan remarked that if the Founding 
Fathers were hostile to participatory democracy “for a population 
predominantly white, Protestant and British, faced with relatively 
simple problems, would they not turn over in their graves at the 
mere thought of the democratic principle being applied to a popula-
tion containing over ten million Negroes, and many more millions of 
southern Europeans, to whom the democratic principle is complete-
ly strange and incomprehensible?”25 

Despite his views that the Soviet system could not last, Kennan was 
not an optimist about the United States in the manner of a Ronald 
Reagan. Along with Cold War policymakers such as Henry Kissinger 
and Paul Nitze, Kennan studied the works of German historian and 
philosopher Oswald Spengler closely, leading him to believe that 
the West was in decline. (There is undoubtedly more to be written 
on the ways in which Spengler’s reading of history shaped leading 
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American diplomats of the Cold War.) Unlike Nitze, who believed the 
United States could reverse that decline, Kennan, like Kissinger, was 
focused on managing it.26

Kennan’s ability to get the big thing right meant that it also would 
have been good for policymakers to pay attention to him on other 
things, most notably the Vietnam War, which he understood as an 
unnecessary, undesirable, and faulty application of the strategy of 
containment and a foreign-policy and human fiasco. As he wrote in 
the Washington Post in December 1965: “I would not know what 
‘victory’ means….If we can find nothing better to do than embark 
upon a further open-ended increase in the level of our commitment 
simply because the alternatives seem humiliating and frustrating, 
one will have to ask whether we have not become enslaved to the 
dynamics of a single unmanageable situation—to the point where 
we have lost much of the power of initiative and control over our 
own policy, not just locally, but on a world scale.”27 Sadly, these 
words echo today in the continued U.S. involvement in Afghanistan.

Kennan was not always right. He himself said that his greatest 
mistake was support for CIA covert operations, which he originally 
viewed positively as a non-military means of implementing contain-
ment.

More complicated is Kennan’s opposition to NATO enlargement 
in the 1990s. Critics of the decision, who believe proponents of 
expanding the Alliance into Central and Eastern Europe foolishly ig-
nored the predictable Russian reaction against it, often cite Kennan’s 
opposition to bolster their argument. But Kennan’s opposition has to 
be put in the context of his own attitudes toward NATO; after all, he 
had major concerns about the Alliance when it was being created. 
A 1948 paper written by the State Department Policy Planning Staff 
under his direction raised concerns that a defense pact going beyond 
the strict North Atlantic area would harden the line of conflict be-
tween the West and the Soviet Union in Europe: “It may not be pos-
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sible for us to prevent a progressive congealment of the present line 
of division. But our present policy is still directed (and in the opinion 
of the Staff, rightfully so) toward the eventual peaceful withdrawal 
of both the United States and the USSR from the heart of Europe, 
and accordingly toward encouragement of the growth of a third force 
which can absorb and take over the territory between the two.”28

Ironically, proponents of NATO enlargement in the Clinton adminis-
tration believed they were operating off of containment’s success. 
They were promoting a new policy that maintained a core feature of 
Kennan’s strategy: containment was an easy-to-understand concept. 
The deliberations among the National Security Council staff on a 
post-Cold War strategy were internally dubbed the “Kennan Sweep-
stakes.” The goal was to come up with a simple single-word re-
placement for containment that would make its author or authors as 
famous as George Kennan. National Security Adviser Anthony Lake 
asked his aide Jeremy Rosner to draft a speech that could produce a 
new foreign policy idea “understandable enough you could put it on 
a bumper sticker.”29 

Rosner came up with “democratic enlargement.” Juxtaposed against 
the Cold War objective to protect Western Europe by containing 
Soviet expansionism, the new American policy in the aftermath of 
the Soviet Union’s collapse, espoused by Lake in his speech at the 
Johns Hopkins School of Advanced International Studies in Septem-
ber 1993, was to enlarge the community of democracies to include 
the former communist bloc. Democratic enlargement became the 
theme for the Clinton administration’s 1994 National Security Strat-
egy, and over the years the prospect of membership in NATO was 
meant to encourage political and economic reform in the countries 
of Central and Eastern Europe.

Ironically, the NATO enlargement policy resulting from the Kennan 

Sweepstakes was shot down by Kennan himself. He argued that 

“expanding NATO would be the most fateful error of American policy 
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in the entire post-cold-war era. Such a decision may be expected to 

inflame the nationalistic, anti-Western and militaristic tendencies in 

Russian opinion; to have an adverse effect on the development of 

Russian democracy; to restore the atmosphere of the cold war to 

East-West relations; and to impel Russian foreign policy in directions 

decidedly not to our liking.”30

Newly released records of the conversations between President Bill 
Clinton and President Boris Yeltsin throughout their years in office 
demonstrate just how bitter a pill NATO enlargement was for the 
Russians to swallow even as Clinton tried various ways to lessen 
the pain.31 Any assessment of the policy, however, has to account 
for the fact that for its proponents, it largely accomplished its objec-
tives. Central and Eastern European nations carried out the political 
and economic reform necessary to join NATO and the European 
Union, and they are more secure and prosperous as a result. Unfor-
tunately, while the prospect of gaining membership induced reform, 
once in the Alliance, countries are more free to abandon democracy. 
The recent rise of authoritarianism in Poland and Hungary certainly 
casts doubt on the future of the European project and the support 
for liberalism in countries of the former Warsaw Pact. On balance, 
however, the effect of NATO enlargement on Central and Eastern 
Europe, and especially on the Baltic countries of Estonia, Latvia, and 
Lithuania, which would otherwise be insecure in the face of Russian 
aggression, has been profoundly positive for the region, even as it 
worsened relations between NATO and Russia.

Kennan’s argument highlights his strengths and weaknesses. As 
a student of Russia, he knew that Moscow would react badly to 
NATO’s expansion. Proponents of enlargement in the Clinton admin-
istration believed that the United States could expand the Alliance 
and still maintain good relations with Russia. Kennan knew that was 
unlikely since Russia would see the expansion of the West into the 
East as undermining its geostrategic position in Europe and threat-
ening its role as a great power. 
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But the argument that NATO should not enlarge because of the Rus-
sian reaction also reflects his weaknesses. Why should Russia get to 
determine the fate of Central and Eastern Europeans? Why should 
the West accept a Russian privileged sphere of influence in its neigh-
borhood? And what was the alternative to not enlarging NATO? A 
Europe in which a line drawn by Josef Stalin in 1945 continued after 
the revolutions of 1989 would not have been a stable continent. It is 
easy to imagine that the Baltic nations and perhaps others in the re-
gion would today face the same problems that Ukraine, Georgia, and 
Moldova face: namely, violations of their sovereignty with Russian 
troops on their territory.  

Kennan’s opposition to NATO enlargement can be viewed not only 
as a direct outgrowth of his views when the military alliance was 
created, but also his concerns with how containment was applied. 
He sought a non-military approach to containing the Soviet Union 
because he thought its challenge was largely political and economic, 
but those who implemented his policy found his understanding of 
containment to be too limiting. Similarly, he opposed using a military 
alliance to extend democratic norms, which would not have been a 
major concern of his anyway, and as his earlier quote on Southern 
Europeans indicates, his views of what constituted “the West” were 
quite narrow.

When NATO enlargement was underway, he, like many opponents 
of the policy, did not propose an alternative approach to the vast 
territory between NATO and Russia. (Inside the government, the 
primary alternative, developed at the Pentagon in 1993, was the Part-
nership for Peace, open to all former Warsaw Pact and former Soviet 
nations, which was a military-to-military endeavor.) Opponents of 
enlargement such as Kennan also have to grapple with the question 
as to whether the West’s relations with Russia would have been 
more positive in the absence of enlargement. The political scientist 
Kimberly Marten has argued they would not have been, because the 
central problem could not be solved: the impact of Russia’s loss of 
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status as the other superpower after the Cold War on its attitudes 
toward the United States and Europe.32 

DEFINING THE NATIONAL INTEREST

At the core of Kennan’s arguments was a foreign-policy realism, 
focusing on narrow American interests, leading him to oppose more 
expansionist, interventionist foreign policies. On this, he was con-
sistent, from his horror at the Cold War strategy document NSC-68, 
which led to a dramatic defense build-up in the 1950s, to his opposi-
tion to NATO enlargement in the 1990s. 

There is no more important foreign policy issue for us to debate in 
the United States than the proper scope of our national interest. 
Wherever we come down, we have to grapple with Kennan. He was 
very circumscribed, with what in today’s academic foreign policy 
conversation would be seen as a position of “restraint.” Restrainers 
argue that the United States has overextended itself since the end 
of the Cold War, to the detriment of American national interests.

U.S. policy in the immediate aftermath of the end of the Cold War 
was a strategy of primacy. The leaked 1992 Defense Planning Guid-
ance argued that the United States needed not only to prevent the 
rise of a peer competitor on par with the Soviet Union but that it 
needed to prevent regional hegemons from arising, whether ad-
versaries like Iraq or allies such as Germany and Japan. At the end 
of the Bush administration, the United States initiated the effort to 
feed the starving in Somalia, a mission that increased in the Clinton 
administration until the Black Hawk Down incident in Mogadishu in 
October 1993. In the Clinton years, the United States ended the war 
in Bosnia in 1995 and launched the Kosovo war in 1999. Despite the 
George W. Bush team arguing for a return to realism in the 2000 
campaign, after the terrorist attacks of September 11, 2001, the 
United States went to war not only in Afghanistan, where al-Qaeda 
had planned the attacks, but then in Iraq. And while Barack Obama 
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came into office pledging to get the United States out of two wars 
and not into new ones, not only was the United States still at war in 
Afghanistan and Iraq when he left office, but he also supported the 
NATO-led and United Nations-authorized attack on Libya in 2011.

The restrainers have been appalled by the global American military 
footprint and the extensive use of force since 1993, particularly 
the 1999 Kosovo War, the 2003 Iraq War, and the 2011 Libya War 
launched by presidents Bill Clinton, George W. Bush and Barack 
Obama. Each of those wars has demonstrated, however, that 
American leaders have an easier time selling war at home when they 
appeal not just to narrow U.S. self-interest but to broader democratic 
values and/or humanitarian concerns inherent in upholding interna-
tional order. A great illustration was the 1991 Persian Gulf War, seen 
as one of the most significant foreign-policy highlights of George H. 
W. Bush’s presidency, a presidency most analysts associate with a 
greater realism and restraint than those of his successors. The sell-
ing of the war to the American public was based on the need to up-
hold the post-World War II international norm enshrined in the United 
Nations, the idea that powerful countries should not be allowed to 
occupy the territory of their weaker neighbors, as they had prior to 
1945. This was the argument used by American officials in building 
a broad international coalition to support the goals of the United 
States. Secretary of State James A. Baker III got very little traction 
at home in the debate over how to respond to Iraq’s August 1990 
invasion of Kuwait when, trying to shore up support for the confron-
tation with Iraqi leader Saddam Hussein, he argued, “the economic 
lifeline of the industrial world runs from the gulf and we cannot 
permit a dictator such as this to sit astride that economic lifeline. To 
bring it down to the level of the average American citizen, let me say 
that means jobs. If you want to sum it up in one word, it’s jobs.”33 
In the end, the main message used to justify the first Gulf War was 
the need to uphold the post-World War II international norm against 
aggression by strong states against their weaker neighbors and by 
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comparing Saddam Hussein to Adolf Hitler to underscore why the 
international community could not afford a policy of appeasement. 
Similar appeals to American values helped Clinton, George W. Bush, 
and Obama make their case when arguing for the need to go to war 
in 1999, 2003, and 2011. 

KENNAN: IT WAS THE IDEAS, NOT HIS POLICY-
MAKING PROWESS

Although Kennan’s first career was in the Foreign Service, he was 
not an inside policy adviser for very long. For most of the Cold War 
and after, he was on the outside of government looking in, as he 
began a second career as a historian at Princeton, while his Foreign 
Service colleagues Charles “Chip” Bohlen and Llewellyn “Tommy” 
Thompson became the main presidential advisers on Russia. Thomp-
son himself had his own biting assessment of his more famous 
colleague. Kennan was, in his words:

a “charming, lovable man, sentimental yet ruthless.” He was 

also “aloof,” a “one-man show.” He had a great sense of history 

and a broad perspective. He was often wrong in the short 

term, but right in the long run. He was a poor administrator yet 

refused to delegate authority. Kennan was brilliant at tossing 

out ideas, but not capable of choosing among them. He had a 

good intuition and was “exceedingly perceptive,” but he was 

not the sort of person who should have the responsibility for 

carrying out policy. Working with Bohlen helped Kennan, since 

Bohlen was “practical and knocked many extreme ideas out of 

Kennan’s head.”34

Despite the fact that he was not in government for most of the Cold 
War, as a strategist he was important, and his architecture of con-
tainment remained the gold standard for American policymakers. In 
1994, State Department officials asked a 90-year old George Kennan 
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for his advice in a private dinner discussion. After Lake’s inability 
to gain much notice for the policy of “enlargement” he articulated 
the previous year, they were hoping Kennan could help them cre-
ate a single foreign policy rationale for what they were doing in the 
post-Cold War world. But Kennan would have none of it. He argued 
that it was a mistake to try to boil the world’s complexities down to 
one word and advised them to compose “a thoughtful paragraph or 
more.”35

Even that thoughtful paragraph has proven elusive. For America 
during the Cold War, everything was viewed in the context of the 
U.S.-Soviet rivalry, and so every issue could be understood in the 
context of containment. There is simply no way to create a simple 
framework in a world of threats posed by a range of actors and 
issues, including hostile authoritarian states like China, Russia, and 
Iran; dangerous non-state actors; complex globalization; climate 
change; and artificial intelligence. The Clinton team’s “democratic 
enlargement” came and went. So did George W. Bush’s “war on 
terror.” Barack Obama resisted being pinned down on the notion of 
a doctrine and was widely cited as saying the U.S. goal should be, 
“don’t do stupid stuff.” Donald Trump’s “America First” is a rejection 
of the approach of his predecessors to uphold the post-World War II 
liberal international order, casting doubt on America’s commitments 
to free trade and alliances.

Long before Trump’s election, Bill Clinton looked back at the end of 
his presidency and admitted to an audience in Nebraska that he had 
not succeeded in conveying the rationale for American engagement 
in world affairs: “People say I’m a pretty good talker,” Clinton de-
clared, “but I still don’t think I’ve persuaded the American people by 
big majorities that you really ought to care a lot about foreign policy, 
about our relationship to the rest of the world, about what we’re 
doing.”36
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That, too, is a large part of the Kennan legacy: the challenge of 
explaining foreign policy to the American public. Kennan would 
have greatly preferred a foreign policy carried out in the absence of 
public debate, by well-trained elites such as himself applying their 
deep knowledge to solving problems and to promoting the national 
interest. He did not view democracy in a positive light, at least with 
respect to the making of foreign policy. Even during the Cold War, 
the public may have understood the basic need for containment, but 
significant internal debates occurred over implementation. In the 
case of the Vietnam War, debates over the implementation of con-
tainment boiled over, as well they should have, given that more than 
50,000 American troops died in that conflict. 

Today we struggle to agree on first principles. Given the growing 
complexity of global affairs and the increased domestic political 
polarization in the United States, the failure to create a new grand 
strategy will likely persist. But while we will continue to hear wistful 
calls for the next George Kennan, we are unlikely to find one.

	



Dennis Ross
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INTERVIEW WITH 
DENNIS ROSS

Editors: We want to start with your coming in as director of Policy 

Planning at a moment that one might describe as the culmination of 

George Kennan’s vision and strategy for managing the Cold War, the 

vision he laid out in “The Long Telegram.”

Between 1989 and 1992, the Soviet Union collapsed from its own 

internal contradictions, while the United States offered better 

solutions to the sorts of problems that Soviet citizens cared about. 

Eventually, we came in and tried to help Russians and Ukrainians 

and others through those problems. 

In many ways, that was exactly the vision that Kennan had articu-

lated. Did that have the feeling of a culmination of long-term policy 

strategy planning?

Dennis Ross:	 The way I would describe it is that during the tran-
sition I was asked by Secretary of State James Baker to formulate 
what our approach to the Soviet Union should be and to brief him 
and the team he was assembling. One of the things I said is, “we 
are clearly at a point of transition. It’s too soon to know exactly how 
this is going to play out but the potential for change is quite real.”

May 17, 2018
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I think I said that I don’t know if we’re at the point yet where the kind 
of contradictions that Kennan identified as eventually changing the 
Soviet Union [were evident], but it’s clear that we’re at a point where 
something big is happening. At a minimum, the potential to see the 
Cold War end is high. Whether that itself will then have implications 
within the Soviet Union remains to be seen.

Our task was to see if we could move things along—at least in 
terms of bringing the Cold War to an end, in terms of recognizing 
that what we saw happening within the Soviet Union was being 
driven by a recognition that they need to change internally.

Our interest was in supporting that change, not making it harder for 
them to carry out that change. But we had to calibrate what we did in 
terms of understanding their impulses. We had to recognize what Gor-
bachev had already done without supporting competition or conflicts 
in the third world. That was a good impulse. That was a good instinct, 
and we certainly wanted to do that. 

We also wanted to see what we could do on arms control. These 
were all things that might allow us to help foster some of the more 
favorable trends we were then seeing emerge. 

I didn’t say more than that about Kennan, but I was acknowledging 
at the time—at least in my own mind—that if you go back and take 
a look at “The Long Telegram” and you look at the logic of what 
containment was supposed to do, it did seem that the inner contra-
dictions were beginning to reflect themselves. 

I’ll add one other point. I had done a doctoral dissertation earlier in 
which I didn’t really have the complete confidence of my own convic-
tions. But I had laid out that the character of Soviet decision-making 
in what might be called the coalition maintenance model. Coalition 
maintenance tends to work by giving all of the members of the coali-
tion incrementally “more.” 
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It looked to me as if that coalition maintenance would be harder and 
harder to do. Therefore, something had to give. From a conceptual or 
theoretical standpoint this was a way of taking account of the Ken-
nan argument: that there were these inner contradictions and sooner 
or later they would manifest themselves. 

E: One of the implications of Kennan’s early analysis and of your 
observation at the end of the period was that the Soviet threat to 
the United States relied on the nature of the Soviet system, on the 
strength and durability of its political model. 

If the Soviet threat and the political model were closely linked, did 
that make long-term strategic planning inherently more difficult? 
Kennan himself once wrote that one of his biggest regrets was his 
decision in favor of lending covert support to Baltic dissidents in 
1946 or 1947.

In other words, if you really can’t control domestic developments in 
another major power, it’s unwise to try. The unpredictable linkage be-
tween domestic politics and geopolitical activity makes it very hard 
to plan your geopolitical engagement. 

DR: There’s one other factor I would add to what you’re raising. 

Policymaking doesn’t occur in a vacuum. It has to take account of 

what the Soviets were doing at that time, the changes that pere-

stroika represented, that glasnost represented. But we also had to 

take account of a certain degree of bureaucratic inertia here in the 

United States. 

Within the national security apparatus, there were different points 

of view. Some were convinced that Gorbachev was a more clever 

competitor than his predecessors had been. Much of what he was 

doing had less to do with changing the Soviet Union on the inside 

and more to do with making himself attractive to the Europeans so 
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that he could compete more effectively with us and create a breach 

between the Europeans and us. 

So here you are trying to make policy. It is not just that there are 
these elements over there that we couldn’t control, but also there 
is a certain competition in terms of policy formulation. Those who 
find it difficult to acknowledge that something is changing are still an 
important part of the policy-formulation process. And that too was 
the case at this time. 

E: We would like to ask about another aspect of “The Long Tele-
gram” in light of your policy-planning experience from 1989 and into 
the post-Soviet period. Kennan argued that for the Russian people, 
the Soviet Union was an unnatural political construct and that at 
some point the Russian people would push against Soviet power. 
I’m curious how much this argument factored into your analysis at 
the time, whether the Russian nationalism of Boris Yeltsin or nation-
alism in the Baltics. How did you approach the issue of nationalism 
at this moment of Soviet transition?

Dennis Ross:	 It became an issue on which we focused much 
more, and on which I in particular focused much more, not during 
the transition but beginning in 1989 when I would join Secretary 
Baker in meeting with Foreign Minister Shevardnadze. I still recall 
very vividly when we flew to Wyoming for our ministerial [meeting] 
in September of ’89. On the flight, it was just Baker, Shevardnadze, 
Tarasenko, and I. We got into a discussion of the nationalities raised 
not by us but by Shevardnadze, and he was explaining to us why 
Gorbachev and he were so committed to transforming the Soviet 
Union from within. 

Shevardnadze started by saying, “we can’t produce a hypodermic 
needle but we can produce, you know, rockets.” He said, “I’m a 
Georgian, and I feel that I know that others feel that, and we’re not 
going to survive unless we can do much more to recognize these 
separate identities. We can survive as a Soviet Union, but not if we 
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don’t reform our approach, not just to the economy but also to each 
of the republics. We’re going to be torn apart if we don’t do that.” 
This was quite striking to me. 

We recall Baker and I sort of looking at each other as if this were 
something more profound than we had realized. Here’s the Sovi-
et foreign minister acknowledging this point. I have to tell you, it 
did one other thing. It helped to create this profound bond of trust 
because of how much he was confiding in us. He could easily have 
felt that his saying these things would be perceived as a weakness 
that we could exploit. But he wasn’t acting as if that was the case. 
He was acting as if he already felt he had a relationship with us and 
therefore he could say these things. Obviously, he was trying to get 
us to be responsive, but it had quite a profound effect on both of us 
at the time. 

In answer to your question, I have to say that initially I was not as 
sensitive to the issue of the nationalities and of what might be going 
on among the peoples of the different republics until we had that 
conversation in September of ’89. 

E: I have one other version of this question, which is not about the 
Soviet Union or the post-Soviet space but about Germany. In the 
1990s, Kennan voiced skepticism about the unification of Germany. 
There was a divergence of opinion among the Western European 
leaders at the time about German unification. Was this a problem 
that your office tackled?

DR: Yes, I had a major role in it. I’ll discuss it from two standpoints. 
Members of my staff went to Germany not long after Secretary Bak-
er and I went to Germany; that was in May [1989?]. They went not 
long after that, and they came back convinced that the potential for 
unification was much more real than anybody within the administra-
tion seemed to accept. In fact, their judgment was explicitly rejected 
by the Bureau of European Affairs. 



42

This didn’t really become an issue with the Allies until after the wall 
came down. And after the wall came down, Thatcher and Mitter-
rand were overwhelmingly against any rapid movement. I still recall 
Thatcher saying the Germans will achieve in peacetime what they 
couldn’t achieve in wartime. And in our inner councils we had a dis-
cussion on how to manage. From my staff, Francis Fukuyama, Roger 
George, and Jim Holmes had gone on this trip, and they came back 
and said that we should begin to plan for this. 

Francis Fukuyama was the one who drafted principles designed to 
guide us in the event that something like this happened. Built into 
these principles was a sense that somehow you had to find a way 
not to look like you’re imposing German reunification on the Soviets 
and on the Europeans as well. My role quickly became focused on 
how to manage the Soviets in response to this. There was a quick 
consensus, forged at the apex of the administration by the president, 
the secretary of state, the national security advisor, and their most 
immediate aides.

The quick consensus was that you had to learn the lessons of 
Versailles and that you couldn’t single out the Germans. Singling the 
Germans out would be the surest way to put us at odds with the 
Germans and to have them leave the Alliance, to have those within 
Germany feel that they should end up being more neutral between 
the U.S. and the Soviet Union. There was a consensus that we had 
to stay close to the Germans. They had to have a sense that we 
weren’t trying to block their aspirations. 

But we also had to manage how this was done. My role was to 
focus on how we could create a sense that this is not being imposed 
on the Soviet Union, we were not against their interests. Gorbachev 
ran the risk of being challenged, as if he’d lost the Cold War and was 
surrendering too much. I was focused very heavily on this. It was my 
responsibility. How could we create a package for Gorbachev that 
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would show that we were addressing their needs and at the same 
time not build up their sense that they could block this? 

We had to create a duality. The train was leaving the station, but 
there were also things that could be done to manage this from a So-
viet perspective. The whole two-plus-four mechanism that we faced 
opposition to internally was designed to create a process where 
Gorbachev and the Soviets could say, “we’re the ones, we’re part of 
this process, we’re managing this.” Later on, our focus on changing 
NATO doctrine was once again designed to address Soviet needs. 

We sought to work with the Germans to ensure that there would be 
significant economic assistance going to the Soviets; that too was a 
part of this. We fashioned a package, which included a statement by 
Secretary Baker that NATO forces would not move eastward. When 
he said that he was referring explicitly to Germany, but it’s fair to say 
that the Soviets heard not just Germany. All of this was designed to 
help Gorbachev manage this process, to make it a process in which 
the Soviet Union had its own input. 

We had discussions with them at one other point. We went to 
Moscow in February 1990. A Central Committee plenum was taking 
place at the time. Shevardnadze arrived for our initial meeting. He 
arrived late because of the plenum and described how difficult it had 
been. 

We spent time with him and then with Gorbachev, talking through 
the issue of why Germany could not be put in a position where if 
it wasn’t in the NATO alliance it would feel the need to acquire an 
independent nuclear capability. That was not in the Soviet interest 
or our interest. This was a conditioning process that we were going 
through. We understood that German reunification had to be accom-
panied by a package that Gorbachev could sell. 
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E: You spoke earlier about the real clarity and connection—maybe 
trust is the right word—that came from Shevardnadze’s opening up 
about the domestic Soviet nationalities challenges, his own Geor-
gian identity, and so on. Over the past three decades, one of the 
criticisms of U.S. policy toward Russia has been the degree to which 
it has been driven by domestic politics, diaspora politics, defense-in-
dustry interests, and intra-Alliance politics. There are the commit-
ments that we make to our European allies and the leverage that 
they exert in turn, little of which is reflected honestly in high-level 
dialogue between U.S. and Russian leaders. To what extent did you 
seek to reciprocate Shevardnadze’s openness about the constraints 
you were under? 

DR: I think that we were also pretty honest as a result. Secretary 
Baker was the kind of guy who always held his cards very close to 
his chest. But he opened up much more with Shevardnadze after 
that. I think he felt like that Shevardnadze was revealing himself, and 
it made Baker much more open with him than he would have been 
otherwise. 

Something else contributed to this. We were seeing Shevardnadze 
every other week. He had a lot of things happening internationally. 
We went to see him and then Gorbachev for the first time in March 
1989, but things—when we offered an arms-control initiative by late 
May—things began to accelerate. There were international confer-
ences. There was Namibia and the Namibian independence; so we 
went there. 

Everywhere there was an international setting or there was a reason 
to be seeing him either in Moscow or in Washington or internation-
ally. There was such an intensity of meetings. Baker was pretty open 
about taking on those within the administration who saw things 
historically and found it hard to break old habits of thinking about the 
Soviet Union. 
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And that had the virtue of being true. It also didn’t hurt with the 
Soviets that he could suggest that he was doing battle with his own 
government. Another way you build a kind of bond is by putting 
yourself in a position where the other side can see that you’re doing 
things that are hard for you and that matters to them. I do think it 
was part of the discussion over time, and after the plane ride it was a 
more prominent part of the discussion. 

E: One of the famous guiding principles for policy planning is George 
Marshall’s injunction to Kennan to avoid trivia.

DR: Yes. 

E:  You clearly had one cluster of challenges around the end of the 
Cold War. What about all the rest? How did you engage with the 
wider problem set, be it the regional or functional issues that were 
clamoring for your attention? How did you ensure that the United 
States as the principal superpower was giving adequate attention to 
global challenges without wasting time on trivia? 

DR: It was not a simple thing to balance. I wouldn’t say trivia. I would 
say operational details. It was not a simple thing to balance because 
Baker viewed me and Robert Zoellick as his main assistants on all 
matters of substance. He looked to the two of us. We would meet 
every 90 days and go over our established set of priorities. What 
were the most important things we should be doing? What were the 
opportunities we were acting on? What were the things that sur-
prised us? Did we need to rejigger or redefine what was important 
to us? 

We each had this broader responsibility, plus I was responsible at 
least for Arab-Israeli peace issues at the same time. Baker was 
determined not to be visibly involved with that at that point. He put 
a premium on my doing it. What that led to was one other thing that 
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Baker wanted. Initially, Baker wanted both Zoellick and me on every 
trip with him. We both came to the conclusion that it was just impos-
sible to manage. So we began to split the trips based on substantive 
responsibilities. 

That also meant that there was this broad array of issues that we had 
to work on. In a sense, when Bob and I weren’t together on trips, one 
of us was helping to manage all the issues coming to his attention and 
working with the executive secretary on what he should and what 
he shouldn’t see, on the issues he had to be aware of. Did he have to 
call the president? Were there issues that required his dealing with a 
counterpart? All this was being done on the road. 	 

I had to manage the staff on a broad array of issues. I created a kind 
of bifurcation. On the one hand, I was being used operationally in a 
way that would have made it very difficult for me to ensure that the 
staff was still planning. I was on the road a lot with the secretary. 
On the other, I felt this larger responsibility to ensure the essence 
of good policy planning, which is making sure that you are moving 
toward and not away from the objectives that you identified as im-
portant from the beginning. 

That’s how I tried to contend with the imperatives of policy planning. 

E: You came to the Office of Policy Planning approximately 42 years 
after the office was created. You have said that in some ways your 
mission was very much George Kennan’s mission in the late 1940s, 
but clearly there had to have been changes and evolutions in the 
office itself. Could you comment on the changes in the office and in 
the State Department around it? 

DR: I did a study of the office before I took the position. There had 
always been a tension between Policy Planning and the rest of 
the building. The way Policy Planning is and its impact is heavily 
influenced by the relationship the director has with the secretary. I 
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understood that I was going to be in a position where I had leverage 
because I was going to be part of the inner circle, and I also had 
operational responsibilities. 

The operational responsibilities and the proximity to the secretary 
were useful at one end because it meant that the functional and 
regional bureaus couldn’t do things without Policy Planning. They 
couldn’t go around Policy Planning. They couldn’t ignore Policy Plan-
ning. Ultimately, it was in their interest to be inclusive because they 
had a better chance to influence policy if they were. 

When I inherited Policy Planning from Dick Solomon, he had a 
good relationship with Secretary of State George Shultz, but Shultz 
tended to give much greater weight to the regional and functional 
bureaus and particularly a bureau like EUR [European bureau]. His 
teams didn’t pay attention to policy planning at all. That changed with 
Baker and obviously with the role I had with Baker. 

To be fair to them, under Rozanne Ridgway, there was a sense they 
could continue doing business the way they did before Secretary 
Baker changed this. The key to Policy Planning is not having a tense 
relationship with the rest of the building. The secretary of state must 
demonstrate that Policy Planning matters so that others have an 
incentive to work and to get along with it. 

E:  What forms of communication did you find to be most effective 
at Policy Planning? You’ve mentioned personal conversations with 
the secretary, and we’re sure that there was a lot of memo writing. 
Email played no role at that time.

DR:  Yes. 

E:  What were the best ways of getting your and the office’s ideas 
across? 
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DR:  Baker had a daily lunch with Zoellick, me, [Lawrence] Eagleburg-
er, Margaret Tutwiler, Janet Mullins. That lunch was a place where 
we would go over what we needed to go over. If there was an issue 
I wanted to let him know about, or a memo I wanted him to be 
aware of, that was a way to flag it for him. Sometimes, I would just 
bring it down to him.

He was fine with memos through the system, but if he felt there 
was something sensitive he would say to me, “I want you just to do 
this and just give it to me, just hand it to me.” That was more unusu-
al. That was much less the norm, but it did happen. It was less the 
daily staff meeting. There was a daily staff meeting, but that’s not 
where we would go over things. It was more perfunctory, where he 
would go around the room and people would report something, but 
that was more general. In terms of the real daily business it was the 
daily lunches that mattered most. 

When I was traveling on the trips, the level of intense engagement 
with him was even higher. It was in that kind of a setting. Then, if 
there was follow up on an issue, he would just ask me to come 
down and talk to him about it. I would see him when we were in 
Washington. I would see him five, six times a day—at least five, six 
times a day. There was a lot of very direct communication verbally. 

He was a reader too. If he read something and wanted to talk about 
it, that would be one of the reasons to come over to him. Or if he’d 
just returned from the White House, he might want to brief me on 
what happened and ask for some follow-up work to be done on it. 
Then I’d get a call. They moved my office into the inner corridor so 
that I would be more immediately available to him. He was sending 
a very clear signal about the role of Policy Planning. In a lot of ways, 
Policy Planning became kind of a mini-NSC [National Security Coun-
cil] in the State Department, and that sent its own signal not only, by 
the way, within the building but in the inter-agency process as well. 
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E:  We wanted to pivot and ask you to contrast your time recently 
in the Obama NSC. In a much smaller government, 70 years ago 
versus today, you could have whole-of-government strategic thinking 
reside within one cabinet agency; and the Office of Policy Planning 
could really think on behalf of the government as a whole. When you 
served at the NSC it was almost an agency unto itself.

DR:  Absolutely. The growth of the NSC and the changed character of 
its role would have made it impossible for Policy Planning to function 
as it did when I was its director. The NSC was so small after it was 
formed, and it had almost no operational role; it couldn’t, given its 
size. When Kennan created Policy Planning, he already had a genuine 
stature. He had a real relationship with George Marshall. 

The nature of the challenges created an interesting confluence of 
circumstances that lent itself to a kind of Policy Planning that would 
be unthinkable today. 

E:  When you were director, we imagine that the Office of Policy 
Planning had an open door to scholars, thinkers, researchers on the 
outside to get ideas of merit into the policy process. Did you see it 
that way? How useful was that type of interaction to you? If you were 
to compare it honestly with what the intelligence community would 
bring to you? Is the interchange between policymakers and experts 
waxing or waning in the longer-term trend of the 21st century? 

DR:  Today that role actually is probably played more by the intelli-
gence community than it is by the Office of Policy Planning or other 
places within the national security apparatus. Guidance comes more 
typically from the intelligence community than from academics or 
those in think tanks. 

When I was at the Office of Policy Planning, there wasn’t a lot of 
time for conversation with academics and outside experts given 
the travel schedule. But I had a number of academics that I brought 
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onto the staff. They represented more openness to creative thinking, 
more awareness of emerging concepts in academia. And from time 
to time we brought people in. 

There was a recognition of the importance of outside expertise. We 
were going through a time of unmistakable transition, and it was 
logical to bring people in who were keen observers of this. Whether 
that’s always the case or not, it was certainly a logical thing to do in 
my time. 

E: Kennan was very often frustrated as a diplomat. As a member of 
the government, he often felt that his best ideas weren’t heeded or 
they were misinterpreted, including containment itself. Were there 
ideas that you put forward that fell to the wayside or ideas that got 
misinterpreted? 

DR:  Yes, it’s impossible for that not to be the case. You don’t get 
your way on every issue. Certainly when I was there, I was on the 
winning side of most things because I would be presenting them to 
Secretary Baker. Most of the time Baker carried the day, but not all 
the time. I was pushing for us to be taking initiatives very early on 
and because I felt the scope of change, I saw something new in Gor-
bachev. There was great resistance to that, and even Baker couldn’t 
deliver it early on. The president had made a decision that we were 
going to do these bureaucratic reviews of every issue. 

At a time when there were rapid changes, the people being asked 
to do the reviews were from across the interagency. This meant the 
people writing the reviews were for the most part people who had 
held their positions in the Reagan administration. They had a kind of 
intellectual stake in the positions that they held. For the first couple 
months of the new administration, I was pushing hard to change 
things and found a fair amount of frustration early on because there 
was resistance to it. That tended to change over time. 
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One of the virtues of working for Baker was Baker was unques-
tionably the strongest actor in the administration. One area where 
I wanted to do much more and did not succeed was where Bush 
wasn’t prepared to overrule Treasury Secretary Nicholas Brady over 
Baker. Brady was loath to provide much assistance to the Soviets, 
and I was among those who found this frustrating given all the 
things I thought we might gain. We had a hard time breaking through 
on that. 

Similarly, in the aftermath of the Gulf War, which followed immedi-
ately on the heels of a unified Germany’s entry into NATO, a non-
stop policy initiative from November of 1989 until March of 1991, 
I pushed an initiative on funding Soviet scientists who might have 
been working the nuclear area. Eventually Nunn-Lugar did this but 
at about one-third of what I was pushing for, and it took a long time 
before it was done. I felt we needed to be investing in this. It was 
just very hard to break though at that time. 

For me the picture was crystal clear. It was just too hard to break 
through. There was a level of fatigue. You began to see signs of Bush 
feeling that he had to focus more on domestic issues. Those were 
the two areas where I felt that I could see clearly what needed to be 
done and where it was hard to get attention. Same on Yugoslavia. 

E:  When you came on the job it was Washington-Moscow as the 
dominant axis of Cold War diplomacy. That already begins to become 
more complicated by 1989, 1990, 1991. we’re curious to get your 
take on the new complexity. Was it felt purely as an opportunity at 
the time, or was it something you had to worry about as well? 

DR:  We focused very heavily on how we were going to deal with 
nuclear weapons in these emerging new states. We also focused 
very heavily on creating a set of principles on civil-military relations 
among other things, on building relationships with the new states 
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and moving them in a direction of being democratic and mar-
ket-based economies. 

That was very much part of what we were doing. I ended up being 
sent a couple times to Ukraine to help manage what was going on 
there. So the short answer is: yes, there was new complexity. It 
opened up new challenges. We negotiated the process of central-
izing the nukes. This was a big deal. I think I viewed it as a really 
interesting challenge. The landscape was changing and already Larry 
Eagleburger was saying we might want to have nostalgia for the 
Cold War because at least then everything was bilateral. Now we’re 
going to face all these additional challenges as well. But, yes, I was 
caught up in it. 

E:  Do you have nostalgia for what it was to be Policy Planning direc-
tor in 1948? 

DR: I think I have some appreciation for it. I think Kennan was having 
to shape what we were going to do in what was a new world and 
in a context that was different than the one that I faced. He was 
having to do it in a context where you were trying to build an instinct 
for American engagement at a time when there was a desire to be 
focused domestically. He was trying to focus on how you could build 
a case for us to play a role that Walter Russell Mead claims we have 
always been playing—that of an active foreign policy. But that was 
not the self-image when Kennan was the director of Policy Planning. 

When I was the director, the idea of the U.S. in a leadership role was 
given. By comparison, Kennan’s task was much more demanding than 
the one that I faced because of the profound difference in domestic 
circumstances. 
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of Freedom by President George H.W. Bush, July 6, 1989
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When man is given (as he can be given only for relatively brief 
periods and in exceptional circumstances) freedom both from 
political restraint and from want, the effect is to render him 
childlike in many respects: fun-loving, quick to laughter and 
enthusiasm, unanalytical, unintellectual, outwardly expansive, 
preoccupied with physical beauty and prowess, given to sudden 
and unthinking seizures of aggressiveness, driven constantly to 
protect his status in the group by an eager conformism—yet not 
unhappy.			   	 —George Kennan, 195137 

	

George Kennan witnessed the triumph of democracy over fas-
cism, and he predicted it would outlast communism too. Yet, he 

feared democracy would defeat itself. The tendencies toward materi-
alism, moral sanctimony, and militarism frightened him in the earliest 
days of the Cold War, when the United States simultaneously invested 
in consumerism and exhibited cruel intolerance. The expansive promis-
es of education and homeownership through the G. I. Bill went hand-
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Jeremi Suri
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in-hand with the repressive witch-hunts of McCarthyism. Mid-century 
America was going in too many contradictory directions at the same 
time. It was both over-exuberant and paranoid.38

This was the context for Kennan’s famous advice to American policy-
makers about containment: “The issue of Soviet-American relations 
is in essence a test of the over-all worth of the United States as a 
nation among nations. To avoid destruction the United States need 
only measure up to its own best traditions and prove itself worthy of 
preservation as a great nation.”39 Americans had to confront ag-
gression firmly abroad as they also curbed their excesses at home. 
Tradition and preservation were the key words—along with con-
tainment—for a conservative-minded man like Kennan. The United 
States had to defend democracy without becoming too democratic. 

Democracy was a problem because it discouraged what Kennan be-
lieved were the essential qualities of effective diplomacy: patience, 
restraint, compromise, and consistency. Citizens wanted immediate 
results, especially after long decades of economic depression and 
world war. They treasured boldness and tenacity in pursuit of their 
goals. They rejected cooperation with adversaries, and they switched 
policies with each election, and often in between. 

Kennan believed these damaging behavioral tendencies were inev-
itable with public participation in policymaking. “A good deal of our 
trouble seems to have stemmed from the extent to which the exec-
utive has felt itself beholden to short-term trends of public opinion in 
the country and from what we might call the erratic and subjective 
nature of public reaction to foreign policy questions,” he said. “What 
passes for our public opinion in the thinking of official Washington,” 
he continued, “can be easily led astray into areas of emotionalism 
and subjectivity which make it a poor and inadequate guide for na-
tional action.”40

The emotionalism and subjectivity of populist policymaking induced 
stupidity, according to Kennan. He wrote one of his most memorable 



57

and controversial descriptions just five years after American victory 
in the Second World War: 

I sometimes wonder whether in this respect a democracy is not 

uncomfortably similar to one of those prehistoric monsters with 

a body as long as this room and a brain the size of a pin: he lies 

there in his comfortable primeval mud and pays little attention 

to his environment; he is slow to wrath—in fact, you practically 

have to whack his tail off to make him aware that his interests 

are being disturbed; but, once he grasps this, he lays about 

him with such blind determination that he not only destroys his 

adversary but largely wrecks his native habitat.41 

This is hardly the language one expects from the man who authored 
the framework—“containment”—for American foreign policy in the 
Cold War. This is not the attitude one frequently encounters from 
American diplomats. And this is decidedly not the optimism about 
American power and righteousness that constitutes the vernacular 
of mission and purpose for most successful American politicians. 

How, then, did the grumpy Kennan come to matter for so much, 
and for so long? Why do scholars, pundits, and policymakers remain 
obsessed with him? What is his enduring legacy? 

These are difficult questions to answer because Kennan does not 
fit any standard category. In fact, he disdained them all. He found 
classical realists too power hungry and ignorant of foreign cultures. 
He viewed liberals as too idealistic and ignorant of diplomacy. And he 
criticized institutionalists for overstating the force of law and under-
stating the enduring pull of the nation-state. In Kennan’s estimation, 
the United Nations was never the correct place to conduct great 
power diplomacy. 

His views were an unstable and messy mix. When criticized for his 
inconsistency, Kennan wrote an eloquent little book that included 
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complaints about automobiles, televisions, and big cities—not a 
coherent philosophy.42 His most thorough biographer finds many 
endearing impulses—patriotism, restraint, balance, and a belief in 
inherited wisdom—at the center of Kennan’s thinking. Yet, a policy 
temperament and a diplomatic style emerge from a full rendering of 
his life, not an enduring philosophy: “Kennan disliked theory,” John 
Lewis Gaddis writes, “and never regarded himself as practicing that 
dark art.”43 

There might have been a Kennan doctrine of containment, but there 
was no Kennan school of thought as there was for some of his 
peers, Henry Kissinger especially.44 Although many policymakers 
were influenced by Kennan, few credit him as a mentor or a guide 
or even a close friend. He was more of an island—“an outsider in 
his own time,” according to John Lewis Gaddis—than an institution. 
Loneliness was his frequent and self-pitying condition.45 

Perhaps that is the source of Kennan’s endurance. He exposed and 
challenged core American assumptions about the world, as he also 
supported American purposes in trying to protect stability, prosperi-
ty, and national independence. Kennan did not believe in making the 
world look like the United States in its politics, economy, or culture. 
In fact, he thought that would be a horrible idea. He was neither a 
universalist nor a cultural relativist but instead a particularist. 

Drawing on the conventional wisdom of the nineteenth century, 
Kennan perceived that different cultures and traditions emerged 
over time, and that they remained distinctive. Influenced by social 
Darwinists, Kennan believed in a world of hierarchal civilizations 
that manifest themselves in nations and empires that the United 
States could neither eradicate nor reform. Instead, America had to 
encourage favorable behavior from the civilizations that had the most 
to contribute (Europe and Japan), while ignoring those that did not 
(Africa and Latin America), and containing those that threatened de-
struction (especially Russia under communism). Kennan noticeably 
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favored northern light-skinned societies, and he frequently disdained 
tropical climates, cultures, and communities. His worldview was 
racialized and Orientalist, as one would expect from a man educated 
in his early 20th-century Euro-American milieu.46  

For all its limits, that canonical education produced valuable insights, 
especially for one of the oldest international professions: diplomacy. 
Kennan entered the newly created U.S. Foreign Service because it 
offered an opportunity to travel and interact in cosmopolitan, elite 
circles.47 The Foreign Service did not exist to change the world but 
to make sense of it for policymakers, businesspeople, and ordinary 
citizens. Kennan never thought of himself as a “change-agent” (a 
term popularized in the late 20th century.) He was an interpreter of a 
large, complex world to a distant and ignorant American public.

Diplomacy for Kennan, therefore, meant managing and influencing 
a diverse, historical cocktail of world civilizations from the margins. 
Kennan had a keen eye for foreign societies and a good ear for 
foreign languages. He traveled extensively in Europe and eventually 
made his way to Russia, reading intensely about the history of these 
societies as he interacted with their leaders and ordinary citizens. 
Kennan was not bringing America to them; he was bringing them to 
America in his frequent telegrams and reports to Washington DC, 
as well as his prolific letters and diary entries. Kennan’s goal was 
to penetrate the mysteries of these civilizations, explain them to 
Americans, and help improve mutual relations. This was diplomacy 
as anthropology and not as imperialism or intervention. 

Kennan did not think the United States could act as an empire, or 
a hegemon, or even a world policeman, even if it wanted to. It was 
a big, self-serving, distant island nation that interacted with others, 
while remaining far removed from their cultures and traditions. 
(Hence, his infamous comparison of the United States to a prehis-
toric monster “with a body as long as this room and a brain the size 
of a pin.”) Even after World War II, Kennan suspected that American 
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complaints about automobiles, televisions, and big cities—not a 
coherent philosophy.184 His most thorough biographer finds many 
endearing impulses—patriotism, restraint, balance, and a belief in 
inherited wisdom—at the center of Kennan’s thinking. Yet, a policy 
temperament and a diplomatic style emerge from a full rendering of 
his life, not an enduring philosophy: “Kennan disliked theory,” John 
Lewis Gaddis writes, “and never regarded himself as practicing that 
dark art.”185 

There might have been a Kennan doctrine of containment, but there 
was no Kennan school of thought as there was for some of his 
peers, Henry Kissinger especially.186 Although many policymakers 
were influenced by Kennan, few credit him as a mentor or a guide 
or even a close friend. He was more of an island—“an outsider in 
his own time,” according to John Lewis Gaddis—than an institution. 
Loneliness was his frequent and self-pitying condition.187 

Perhaps that is the source of Kennan’s endurance. He exposed and 
challenged core American assumptions about the world, as he also 
supported American purposes in trying to protect stability, prosperi-
ty, and national independence. Kennan did not believe in making the 
world look like the United States in its politics, economy, or culture. 
In fact, he thought that would be a horrible idea. He was neither a 
universalist nor a cultural relativist but instead a particularist. 

Drawing on the conventional wisdom of the nineteenth century, 
Kennan perceived that different cultures and traditions emerged 
over time, and that they remained distinctive. Influenced by social 
Darwinists, Kennan believed in a world of hierarchal civilizations that 
manifest themselves in nations and empires that the United States 
could neither eradicate nor reform. Instead, America had to encour-
age favorable behavior from the civilizations that had the most to 
contribute (Europe and Japan), while ignoring those that did not (Afri-
ca and Latin America), and containing those that threatened destruc-
tion (especially Russia under communism). Kennan noticeably 
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power was not all that it was cracked up to be. The United States 
had proven that it could fight in a coalition to defeat fascist states, 
but it did not have the will, knowledge, experience, or resolve to 
govern abroad. 

The history of the Cold War would confirm Kennan’s astute, but often 
unpopular, judgment of American limits. Kennan was an early critic 
of the Vietnam War and a consistent detractor from most American 
military interventions outside Western Europe and East Asia. And 
even in Europe, he opposed the creation of the North Atlantic Treaty 
Organization (NATO), which he feared would divide Europe per-
manently and antagonize neighbors. Kennan favored opening rela-
tions with Communist China long before President Richard Nixon’s 
overdue visit in 1972. Kennan’s loudest critics were generally more 
idealistic and militaristic, and history has not judged many of them 
well. That verdict explains Kennan’s continuing influence. It helps 
that numerous American misadventures seem to have confirmed his 
predictions.48

Kennan’s most influential policy documents—his “Long Telegram” 
from Moscow on February 22, 1946 and his X article published 
in Foreign Affairs in July 1947—brilliantly reconciled the limits on 
American power with the need to combat Soviet aggressiveness. 
Kennan described how the Soviet system under Josef Stalin was 
“committed fanatically” to conflict with the capitalist world, but also 
“highly sensitive to [the] logic of force.”49 That meant Stalin was 
not like Hitler; the United States did not have to fight a war to stop 
his aggression. There were other strategic alternatives: “the main 
element of any United States policy toward the Soviet Union must 
be that of a long term, patient but firm and vigilant containment of 
Russian expansive tendencies,” he wrote.50 

Kennan called on the United States to “create among the peoples 
of the world generally the impression of a country which knows 
what it wants, which is coping successfully with the problems of its 
internal life and with the responsibilities of a World Power, and which 
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has a spiritual vitality capable of holding its own among the major 
ideological currents of the time.” Kennan did not want the imposition 
of American ideas abroad; instead, he favored aid for other societies 
to find their way free of communism, in partnership with the United 
States. He wrote, “to the extent that such an impression can be cre-
ated and maintained, the aims of Russian Communism must appear 
sterile and quixotic, the hopes and enthusiasm of Moscow’s support-
ers must wane, and added strain must be imposed on the Kremlin’s 
foreign policies.”51 

Careful defensive military power, according to Kennan, served a vital 
role as an accompaniment to the political pressure he advocated. 
Kennan never argued that the United States could defeat the Sovi-
et Union by force of arms. Military power would enforce limits on 
Moscow, just as it reflected America’s own limits. Military power 
would give American political actions time and space to encourage 
positive internal dynamics within societies (including Russia), reflect-
ing their own unique histories. Communism was an alien intruder, 
and the United States would stand on the side of independence 
and self-government, not an alternative imposition. That comparison 
would give the United States and its partners “reasonable confi-
dence” in “a policy of firm containment, designed to confront the 
Russians with unalterable counter-force at every point where they 
show signs of encroaching upon the interests of a peaceful and 
stable world.”52

Containment, as articulated by Kennan, was not a military or an 
ideological policy. It was a political strategy to nurture developments 
within societies, on their own terms, that would benefit American 
interests. That was all. 

The first, and perhaps most important, step in containment was to 
stop Soviet advances and allow European and Japanese citizens 
to rebuild their societies based on the particularities of their own 
respective histories. Recipients of American aid, Kennan explained, 
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“should themselves take the initiative in drawing up a program and 
should assume central responsibility for its terms.” 53 The Marshall 
Plan in Europe and the Reverse Course in Japan were anti-com-
munist and pro-capitalist, but they left a lot of openness for local 
institutions and traditions to set the contours for political-economic 
development. Despite the horrors of fascism, Kennan looked for 
continuity in supporting new regimes that resurrected enduring 
pre-fascist traditions. West German Chancellor Konrad Adenauer and 
Japanese Emperor Hirohito—neither of whom were American-style 
leaders—embodied the historically grounded anti-communists that 
containment privileged. The local and national traditions defined the 
nature of postwar democracy for Kennan, not American models, 
which Kennan always found ill-suited and undesirable.54

Early success in containing communism and helping national leaders 
build alternatives encouraged Kennan’s counterparts, including fig-
ures like Dean Acheson and John Foster Dulles, to increase Ameri-
can ambitions. After the shock of the North Korean invasion of South 
Korea, with Soviet and Chinese communist collaboration, American 
policymakers undertook a breathtaking set of global investments 
in nation-building throughout East Asia, Southeast Asia, the Middle 
East, and soon Africa. Fears of communist penetration in the West-
ern Hemisphere, and a long-standing tradition of American inter-
vention in the region, had already driven this dynamic close to U.S. 
borders in the early 1950s. In the compelling analysis of one histori-
an, the defensive posture of communist containment slipped into an 
aggressive pursuit of preponderant power around the globe.55

The lingering trauma of the Second World War made it hard for 
American leaders to maintain perspective on foreign threats. Com-
munist aggression on the Korean peninsula and elsewhere evoked 
memories of Nazi and Japanese war making, which triggered panic 
and an overwhelming response. American leaders also believed that 
they now commanded military and economic power that was absent 
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a decade earlier. They intended to use their newfound power, often 
flagrantly, to bolster morale at home.56 

Threat inflation and an overestimation of American power character-
ized NSC-68, an influential document written by Kennan’s successor 
on the Policy Planning staff at the State Department, Paul Nitze. Con-
tainment now became a clarion call for American intervention around 
the globe to attack communist sympathizers and support preferred 
American leaders. There was no time to let history takes its course 
in each society. The United States and its allies had to act quickly 
and decisively to slam the door shut. In the 1950s, this thinking 
motivated a series of American-sponsored coups in Iran, Guatemala, 
the Congo, and elsewhere. In the 1960s, it led, most tragically, to 
Vietnam.57 

Kennan was the author of containment who, less than a decade 
after articulating his ideas, became a chief dissenter against their 
deployment by his government. He characterized the militarization 
and globalization of communist containment as yet another example 
of American decadence. The massive primeval American monster 
with the pin-sized brain was all-out or all-in. Now that it was all-in, 
the country was hyperactive, responding everywhere with force and 
money, even if national interests were not at stake and the solution 
was worse than the problem. Americans were unprepared for the 
new environments into which they entered with strong determina-
tion and very weak knowledge. Trying to anesthetize societies like 
Iran, Guatemala, and Vietnam from communism, the United States 
was undermining healthy forces it did not recognize, creating new 
indigenous enemies, and overextending itself. 

Writing of American leaders in the early months of the Vietnam War, 
Kennan said, “it seems to me that they have taken leave of their 
senses.” He was clearly dismayed. “I am absolutely appalled at what 
is going on,” Kennan explained to his wife. “It looks to me as if Mr. 
J[ohnson] had lost his head completely.”58 Kennan famously went 
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public with his criticisms of the Vietnam War in particular, and Ameri-
can Cold War strategy as a whole, in 1965 and 1966. 

He followed those criticisms in later decades with urgent calls for 
nuclear disarmament and peaceful cooperation with the Soviet 
Union. In the months after Ronald Reagan’s election to the presi-
dency in 1980 on a platform of getting tough with Moscow, Kennan 
became somewhat apocalyptic:

Adequate words are lacking to express the full seriousness of 

our present situation. It is not just that our government and the 

Soviet government are for the moment on a collision course 

politically; it is not just that the process of direct communication 

between them seems to have broken down entirely; it is not 

just that complications in other parts of the world could easily 

throw them into insoluble conflicts at any moment; it is also—

and even more importantly—the fact that the ultimate sanction 

behind the policies of both these governments is a type and 

volume of weaponry that could not possibly be used without 

utter disaster for everyone concerned.59

The world had entered what Kennan called a “cloud of danger.”60 
American policies of communist containment had morphed into ag-
gressive adventures that promoted foreign wars and violent dictator-
ships in regions far from core U.S. interests. Policies of containment 
also financed a gargantuan military in the United States. Oversup-
plied with nuclear weapons, this military was over-deployed around 
the globe, in Kennan’s eyes. 

By the end of the 20th century, an old and embittered Kennan re-
nounced most of what was done by the United States in the name 
of containment. He came to regret how his early ideas had become 
justifications for rigid anti-communist policies and interventionist 
tendencies, which he abhorred. Kennan lamented the absence of 
enlightened American leaders who displayed the courage to return 
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to the flexible and limited vision of containment that he had initially 
intended. Kennan’s ideas had changed over the years, but he blamed 
the presidents and other officials who implemented them for what 
he viewed as simplistic and short-sighted policies. Kennan still hoped 
for a sophisticated prince, who would listen closely to him—and read 
his writings attentively—on all strategic matters.61 

He was, then, like Machiavelli, looking to instruct a prince who would 
empower him. Kennan relied on a combination of history and per-
sonal experience to make his arguments. On the model of Machia-
velli’s The Prince, he searched for lessons that would endure. In his 
most ambitious moments, Kennan embodied Machiavelli’s mining 
of historical wisdom to elucidate the present. Machiavelli famously 
wrote: 

When evening has come, I return to my house and go into my 

study. At the door I take off my clothes of the day, covered with 

mud and mire, and I put on my regal and courtly garments; and 

decently re-clothed, I enter the ancient courts of ancient men, 

where, received by them lovingly, I feed on the food that alone 

is mine and that I was born for. There I am not ashamed to 

speak with them and to ask them the reason for their actions; 

and they in their humanity reply to me.62 

Like Machiavelli more than four centuries earlier, Kennan lived in a 
world where few policymakers had the time or inclination for such 
serious contemplation. The irony of becoming the arch critic of his 
own misused words makes Kennan the American Machiavelli of the 
20th century. The Florentine sage was frequently misunderstood—
and condemned—in his own time, and his words have been repeat-
edly misused over five centuries to justify some of the worst horrors 
in politics. Machiavelli, like Kennan, was not justifying all forms of 
force against adversaries, nor was he empowering the prince to 
adopt any means in pursuit of his cause. Machiavelli’s message was 
about balance, careful application of force, and the strategic pursuit 
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of the state’s interests in a dangerous world. He emphasized lim-
its as much as possibilities; attention to history and circumstances 
instead of simple answers.63 

Writing from his own policy exile in 1513, Machiavelli warned Lo-
renzo de’ Medici about the false allure of doctrinal consistency or 
the pursuit of power for its own sake. Machiavelli emphasized the 
aspiration to a “well-ordered state.” And this required, in his famous 
account, a mix of love and fear, and an avoidance of hate:

A dispute arises, whether it is better to be loved than feared, 

or the reverse. The response is that one would want to be both 

the one and the other; but because it is difficult to put them 

together, it is much safer to be feared than loved, if one has 

to lack one of the two….The prince should nonetheless make 

himself feared in such a mode that if he does not acquire love, 

he escapes hatred, because being feared and not being hated 

can go together very well.64

For Machiavelli, policy was a constant rebalancing of efforts to 
manipulate love and fear in citizens, allies, and adversaries alike. 
This required intelligence, courage, and careful use of force to win 
affection without inspiring hatred. The well-ordered state, in Machia-
velli’s estimation, protected its core interests by managing complex 
and respectful relations with different peoples for mutual gain. War 
was a last resort that the prince must prepare for, but he should fight 
infrequently, relying on persuasion and compromise more often. 

Power, for Machiavelli, was in managing the opinions of others. 
Words and arms were tools, not ends in themselves. The state 
depended on how its leaders appealed (positively and negatively) to 
a wide range of actors in ever-changing circumstances. “Thus,” Ma-
chiavelli wrote, “a prince who has a strong city and does not make 
himself hated cannot be attacked.”65
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Kennan and Machiavelli shared an iconoclastic temperament and a 
somewhat quixotic desire to be intellectuals and policymakers at the 
same time. They criticized their peers in the policy community who 
wielded more power with less thought. Both men suffered profound 
self-doubt and regret for the very limited influence they exercised 
directly over their societies’ policies. Both were dismayed by the 
distortions of their ideas for contrary purposes.

Machiavelli began The Prince with an argument, in his dedicatory let-
ter, that policymakers needed more knowledge than they possessed 
by virtue of their position: “to know well the nature of peoples one 
needs to be prince, and to know well the nature of princes one 
needs to be of the people.”66 Machiavelli promised to use his experi-
ence and his deep reading of history to give the prince access to the 
knowledge he needed about the peoples and issues he confronted. 

The Prince is filled with historical examples and the lessons derived 
from them, articulated for a leader without time to master that his-
tory. Machiavelli’s short book does not recount the history in detail; 
it helps the reader to use some of that history to ask better policy 
questions. A leader, according to Machiavelli, “should be a very 
broad questioner, and then, in regard to the things he asked about, 
a patient listener to the truth.” Historically informed questions would 
elicit better direction from advisers and allow for better decisions by 
the policy maker: “good counsel, for wherever it comes, must arise 
from the prudence of the prince, and not the prudence of the prince 
from good counsel.”67 

Kennan wrote for precisely this reason. He wanted to help American 
leaders (his intended readers) gain good counsel, especially from 
him. His first short book, American Diplomacy, was his adaptation of 
Machiavelli’s The Prince for the Cold War. Based on six lectures he 
delivered at the University of Chicago in 1950, Kennan interrogated 
the history of American foreign policy from the Spanish American 
War of 1898 through the Second World War. He argued that this 
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history was useful to derive a “theoretical foundation” for policy. 
Exploring how the United States grew into a world power, and the 
deficiencies of the country’s preparations, Kennan hoped to offer 
a “stimulus to further thought on these problems and to worthier 
efforts by wiser and more learned people.”68

These worthier efforts, according to Kennan’s historical analysis, had 
to be aware of the inherited problems facing American policymakers. 
Echoing Machiavelli, Kennan was skeptical of public opinion, which 
his account described as myopic, inconsistent, and ill-informed. He 
was also critical of American moral self-righteousness, trumpeted by 
policymakers who were ignorant of foreign societies and beholden 
to their voters’ prejudices. 

Kennan depicted a counterproductive rashness in America’s dem-
ocratic behavior abroad, which was bouncing between the ex-
cesses of isolation and intervention, with advocates of each tactic 
promising a utopia of peace with minimal sacrifice. “I cannot resist 
the thought,” Kennan explained, “that if we were able to lay upon 
ourselves this sort of restraint and if, in addition, we were able to 
refrain from constant attempts at moral appraisal—if, in other words, 
instead of making ourselves slaves of the concepts of international 
law and morality, we would confine these concepts to the unob-
trusive, almost feminine, function of the gentle civilizer of national 
self-interest in which they find their true value…posterity might look 
back upon our efforts with fewer and less troubled questions.”69

What Kennan called “feminine” restraint against moral self-righ-
teousness and adherence to the national interest was the core of 
his argument. It was Machiavelli’s too. The prince, according to both 
men, had to see through the words and myths, focusing on the uses 
of power that best served a “well-ordered state,” and in Kennan’s 
time, a well-ordered world. Both Machiavelli and Kennan used his-
tory to show the perils of too much benevolence (love) or too much 
force (hate). Leaders had to find the right balance, mixing different 
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forms of power to build relationships between peoples that connect-
ed them around their histories and their interests. 

The interests of the state were civilizing forces for Kennan and 
Machiavelli because they set limits on excesses of all kinds. Perma-
nent peace was not possible, but permanent war was self-defeating. 
The interests of the state required circumstantial knowledge and 
constant adjustment. They were consistent and legible to friends and 
foes alike. And the interests of the state set achievable goals—some 
would say “realistic” goals—for leaders. 

George Kennan was one of the 20th century’s great oracles because 
he issued an uncomfortable, Machiavellian warning that policymak-
ers often did not want to hear. American democracy empowered 
attitudes and behaviors that threatened its sustenance. Daniel Bell 
famously called these traits the “cultural contradictions of capital-
ism.”70 Kennan was more focused on politics and foreign policy. 
With his razor-sharp prose, he diagnosed an ever-present American 
tendency to excess in consumption, militarization, and intervention. 
These tendencies were driven by high-minded idealism and grubby 
selfishness. They infected economic policy at home and foreign 
policy abroad. 

Kennan’s writings have enduring appeal because they describe these 
phenomena and offer alternatives—from containment to negotiation 
to restraint. There are no silver bullets in Kennan, no easy escapes 
from the dilemmas he describes. But there is hope. And there is 
a worthy struggle in each of Kennan’s writings to make American 
policy fit the complexity of an ever-changing world. If Machiavelli is 
the place to start for modern politics, Kennan is the essential primer 
on foreign policy. His final sentences in American Diplomacy cap-
ture the everlasting dilemma of balancing capabilities with restraint, 
power with wisdom:
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I am frank to say that I think there is no more dangerous 

delusion, none that has done us a greater disservice in the past 

or that threatens to do us a greater disservice in the future, 

than the concept of total victory….If we are to get away from it, 

this will not mean that we shall have to abandon our respect for 

international law….It will mean that we will have the modesty 

to admit that our own national interest is all that we are really 

capable of knowing and understanding—and the courage to 

recognize that if our own purposes and undertakings here 

at home are decent ones, unsullied by arrogance or hostility 

toward other people or delusions of superiority, then the pursuit 

of our national interest can never fail to be conducive to a better 

world.71

Kennan carried Machiavelli into the Cold War, and beyond. We shall 
never stop arguing about these two difficult thinkers. We are better 
for these arguments, even as they shake our daily attitudes. 

Kennan and Machiavelli demanded powerful states with strong lead-
ers, but they warned against the excessive use of power and mis-
guided displays of strength. They were idealists in their attachment 
to the noble purposes of enlightenment and self-rule; however, they 
justified repeated demands to abandon principle for survival. Most 
of all, Kennan and Machiavelli remind us that the world is not as we 
wish. We cannot re-make it in our image, but we cannot turn away 
in disgust either. We must make do and work on the edges, as best 
we can. Americans, like Florentines centuries earlier, still struggle to 
learn the frustrating art of statecraft. 
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Editors: We’d like to begin with the natural connections you have 
with George Kennan, having been director of Policy Planning and 
then at the Council on Foreign Relations. You have two very import-
ant tent poles of Kennan’s career, the Mr. X article and then his role 
as director of Policy Planning. We’d like to get your sense of the 
biggest impacts he had with these positions, with the article and the 
role of first director of Policy Planning. What has been important to 
you? What do you consider important today?

Richard Haass: I think when history considers George Kennan, the 
most important element is probably “The Long Telegram,” which in a 
slightly revised form ended up in Foreign Affairs. And he will forever 
be known as the father, or whatever other word one wants to use, of 
containment. And the magazine publication, the Foreign Affairs pub-
lication of it, was obviously important for it as a public document be-
cause up until then it had been an internal document. But it was when 
it was an internal document, it gave shape to what some people were 
thinking. It just captured the moment. And then when it went public 
in the magazine, it was important because foreign policy never thrives 
if it’s made only in private; you need public support. And containment, 
given its various dimensions, required a lot of public support. So the 
public articulation was just as important in its own way as the initial 
private articulation.
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As for Kennan at Policy Planning, obviously he’s the most famous 
director of the office. He got it started. It’s had a very uneven history 
since then. My own sense is, he’s less significant for the bureaucratic 
perch he occupied than for the particular memos and ideas he put for-
ward. And that’s simply because policy planning in many ways cannot 
be institutionalized. The impact of the office, the impact of the director, 
of the staff depends a great deal on the person in the job, on the ap-
petite of the Secretary of State, on the openness of the administration 
to receive certain kinds of big ideas, and on the moment. Not every 
moment in history lends itself to big rethinks. Not every moment in 
history lends itself to big ideas.

But Kennan came at a time when people were looking for big ideas 
because it was one of those transitions in the world, in this case 
going from the World War II world into something else. And it was a 
moment where people were for obvious reasons searching for big 
ideas, for policies that would help the United States navigate this 
very different world. And so you have the context, you have Ken-
nan who by temperament and background was able to produce big 
things. And in somebody like Marshall you had a Secretary of State 
who was open to it and then was in a position—given his relation-
ship with Truman—he was in a position to promote it. So the stars 
aligned in ways for Kennan that I would argue they didn’t align for 
any of his successors.

E: We want to follow up on context, on place and time as a matter of 
career and as a matter of policy. In our era, containment has a unique 
status. Other policy ideas can get rolled into some kind of dichotomy 
like hawk versus dove, or realist versus idealist. They basically fall 
into a more traditional version of the foreign policy debate, whereas 
containment stands on its own. And maybe that makes it more time-
less. Do you have a perspective on that?

RH: Containment stands apart probably for at least two reasons. 
One is it did provide direction for U.S. foreign policy in the Cold War 
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and in particular towards the Soviet Union. I don’t want to exagger-
ate it because we had fierce debates over, for example, Vietnam. 
And someone could believe in containment and support what we 
did in Vietnam and someone could support containment and oppose 
what we did in Vietnam. Containment wasn’t a cookbook that gave 
you recipes. But still, it gave you a first order take and a direction 
on what the United States ought to do in the world at that time and 
it gave people an intellectual handle, and intellectual handles are 
important.

What’s also interesting about containment is it has turned out to 
have more staying power than many might have predicted because 
it offers a framework for dealing with other imperial or expansive 
actors on either the regional or world stage. So even though it was 
devised as a response to the Soviet challenge in the late 1940s, at 
various times either in part or in whole it’s provided at least some di-
rection for how to deal with other countries. For example, one sees 
elements of it in the Iran debate today. So it actually turns out to be 
a slightly less context- or time-limited concept than I expect even 
Kennan would have imagined when he wrote it.

E: On the subject of Kennan’s legacy, We were wondering if you 
could speak in somewhat personal terms about when you came to 
read Kennan for the first time, on the effect of his writing style, on 
the things that you might wish to emulate, and on what you have not 
sought to emulate either in your career as Policy Planning director or 
as an interpreter and commentator on international affairs?

RH: I would expect my answer will disappoint you. I read Kennan 
first as a graduate student at Oxford in the 1970s. And then and now 
it is impossible not to be impressed by the range of his intellect. 
What’s so interesting about Kennan is he represents the kind of clas-
sical education that almost nobody gets any more. His ability to draw 
not just from history, but from literature, reflects a richness that we 
rarely see. English majors and historians and political science majors 
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are rarely to be found in the same person and Kennan was such a 
person.

Both the breadth and the depth stand out. But almost in some ways 
because of that, because of his background, there was almost a Eu-
ropeanness to it. There was something about Kennan—I hope this is 
not misunderstood—but there are some parts about him that were 
not to me particularly American; they were much more European in 
certain ways.

It didn’t have a big influence on me because that’s not a league I can 
play in. I don’t know who can but it’s certainly not one that I can. And 
when I was at graduate school—and I don’t mean to compare my-
self to either lest anyone get the wrong idea—but the people who 
influenced me more were Hedley Bull, an Australian academic who 
wrote a book called The Anarchical Society, which more than any 
other single book has framed my own outlook on the field, and Henry 
Kissinger. I read A World Restored when I was a graduate student. I 
remember reading it the fall of 1973 when I first started at Oxford and 
that had a tremendous impact on me.

So more than Kennan, those were the two individuals whose writing 
and thinking influenced my own. This idea that at any moment in 
history there are forces of anarchy and forces of society, and that 
is what gives the character of the world order, or lack of it, at any 
moment. And what I so liked about Kissinger was his ability to 
weave not just history into a narrative, but his ability to go back and 
forth between specific points of history and then to take a step back 
and provide a larger perspective, a larger take on what the specific 
pieces of history were telling us if only we were able to understand 
them. The metaphor that comes to mind is a camera that zooms in 
and zooms out and zooms in and zooms out. And I found both of 
them to be great influences.

Kennan was very much of the realist school. Indeed, he had very 
little time for thinking about promoting democracy abroad and re-
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shaping other societies. I’m not as extreme as that but I lean in that 
direction. But he also had a pretty good understanding of the need 
to take the cultures, and histories, and philosophies, and perspec-
tives of others into account. That led to a certain restraint. To use 
modern-day language, in no way was he a transformationalist. There 
was an understanding of history that I liked about Kennan because it 
made one a little bit more humble and a little bit more careful.

I absorbed that in the same way I did other people who were closer 
to the realist perspective. But in my own case, we never met that 
I can recall. Indeed, I wrote him when I was at S/P [the State De-
partment Office of Policy Planning] and said I’d like to come see him 
and he basically said thanks but no thanks. He was one of the major 
contributors to the field. And if I were ever going to write, say, an in-
tellectual history of American foreign policy, he would be a part of it.

But for me at least, he is not one of the top influences. And at S/P, 
again, when I was there I did not come to work and say “What 
would George Kennan have done?” Or when a problem came my 
way, I would not think of it in those terms. Again, I was simply trying 
to do what I could, given my abilities, my staff, and more important, 
given the context. Given the issues we were dealing with, given 
what the secretary of state, in this case Colin Powell, wanted, given 
what the interagency would tolerate or allow.

So, Kennan’s experience at S/P didn’t have great meaning for me 
with two exceptions. I kept on my desk a mug that said, “Avoid 
Trivia,” and secondly, like every other person who sat in that position, 
there were days of satisfaction but also days of real of frustration. 
The Policy Planning job, at the end of the day, is a job about influ-
ence, not power. And everybody who has sat in that job I expect had 
his or her moments of real frustration, simply because your ability to 
influence is not something dependent upon the power of your own 
prose.

E:  You’ve mentioned Kennan having a salience that goes beyond 
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time and place, the enduring notion of containment. That suggests 
a lasting relevance after 1991. At the same time, the world changes 
fundamentally when the Cold War comes to its end.

RH:  Sure.

E:  So is it possible to argue for the fading away of at least some of 
his insights as we’ve entered a new era international in international 
affairs?

RH:  It’s a fair question. I’ve written myself that containment could 
survive and did survive everything except its success. I never 
thought I’d see the day that what Kennan basically called, what he 
predicted to be, I think his phrase was, “the mellowing of Soviet pow-
er,” would happen. That after decades of frustration, that ultimately 
the second dimension of containment, this one of internal change 
inside the communist world, inside the Soviet Union, would occur. 
Most of the emphasis was on pushing back on the containing part, 
but it turns out that both dimensions of what Kennan had written about 
came to be after 40 years, quite suddenly in many ways. Like a lot of 
other people, I was taken by surprise.

I think after that Kennan was in a position more like others. And by 
that I mean containment and his whole argument there at the dawn of 
the Cold War gave him a unique place in the foreign policy firmament. 
But 40 years on, when, after containment, again, succeeded beyond 
the expectations of just about everyone, I would think, he was at that 
point one of the community offering ideas of what to come next. And 
just like not all of his previous ideas necessarily were taken or came 
to fruition (for example, some of his ideas on nuclear weapons were 
essentially flat out rejected), his ideas, say, about NATO enlargement 
were not welcomed by some and did not have much of an influence 
on U.S. policy.

So I’d say for most of his career he was an influential voice, but 
containment was the one moment where he was truly primus inter 
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pares, and had a special place and always will occupy a special place 
in the foreign policy pantheon because of it. But at other moments 
in the debate, he was an important voice; he was simply a respected 
voice. He would be writing in places, say, like the New York Review 
of Books, so he was in the foreign policy debate. He was a “liberal” 
voice who was arguing against, say, American overreach, as he saw 
it, something that became a persistent theme of his writings. Within 
that he was simply—and I don’t mean this with any disrespect—he 
was simply a voice, a respected voice but again, I don’t think he was 
ever able to re-create the kind of influence he had at the beginning 
of the Cold War when it came to other debates.

E:  As far as I can tell, principally via a Tom Friedman quote in the 
1990s, Kennan very clearly opposed any kind of NATO enlargement. 
You had a front seat for that debate and for the implementation with 
respect to the Baltic States in the early 2000s. Did you have access 
to Kennan’s argument at the table? Maybe you had some who were 
channeling that argument as it was expressed at that time? Who 
did the most justice to Kennan’s concern about overreach, about not 
reintegrating Russia into the kind of European, Euro-Atlantic, Western 
security and political world and instead about alienating them? And in 
what way was that argument defeated from your vantage point? How 
did that go?

RH:  We didn’t have a full view on that, in part because most of that 
conversation took place during the eight years of the Clinton pres-
idency. That was really the period at which the NATO enlargement 
policy was born, and debated, and initially implemented. So I was 
more aware of the external debate where, as you mentioned, Tom 
Friedman, Michael Mandelbaum, and others were against it, and ob-
viously the preponderance of people in and out of the administration 
were for it.

When I worked for Bush 41 just before then—Clinton was 42—the 
debate was not about NATO enlargement, it was more about how 
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does one react to Gorbachev’s predicament, to Yeltsin’s succession, 
what sort of help do we give Russia under what terms. And if you 
remember at the time, it was Richard Nixon on the outside who 
was arguing the United States should be more generous and more 
ambitious given Soviet/Russian needs. And I think the Bush adminis-
tration—this is 41’s administration—largely held back. The president 
was always careful to be sensitive to Gorbachev, never to humiliate 
him or anything like that, to be sensitive to his position.

But we didn’t do as much, say, as Nixon thought we should do for 
Russia at that juncture. I think Nixon had a point. If we had done 
that, no one could say whether it would have made an appreciable 
difference in Russia’s trajectory, but I think there’s a fair case for 
saying we should have been more forthcoming. The NATO enlarge-
ment debate largely took place over the next eight years and as I 
said, I was out of government. When I got back into government 
under Bush 43 and I was at Policy Planning—just to be clear when I 
worked for 41 I was on the NSC staff, I was overseeing the Middle 
East-Persian Gulf-South Asia directorate, though I did get involved in 
some other issues, including this question of aid to Russia, which I 
think came up in ’92, if I remember correctly.

But in Bush 43 I remember arguing in a set a memos that we should 
rethink parts of NATO enlargement. I was never a big enthusiast 
of it. And I worried about two things. I worried about its impact on 
Russia and I worried about the obligations we were taking on. And 
I didn’t understand why we were so quick to dismiss two other 
options, which was either making the Partnership for Peace more 
attractive or even bringing Russia into NATO. NATO by that point 
had become increasingly an out-of-area mechanism and countries 
essentially decided or chose whether they participated in this or that 
undertaking.

It was less and less of an all-or-nothing alliance so I actually put 
forward at one point the idea that we should either think about bol-
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stering the Partnership for Peace or think about offering Russia some 
type of limited NATO membership. But those ideas went nowhere. 
By then NATO enlargement already had tremendous momentum. So 
I was going against some pretty powerful forces.

E:  Starting in 2014 with the renewed crisis between Russia and 
Europe, Russia and the United States, George Kennan returned. 
People were claiming Kennan for several different and conflicting 
positions. Do you think that Kennan had a second life after 2014 and 
if so, in what fashion: as a critic of NATO expansion, as the author of 
containment? Which George Kennan has been the one that we’ve 
most needed since 2014? And in fact in a situation that resembles a 
new Cold War, then does that breathe new life into both the debate 
and the ultimate policy framework that governs our policy towards 
the first Cold War?

RH:  Not particularly. Russia today poses a very different sort of 
challenge. We’re not in a global competition in the same way that 
we were. I mean, it’s much more interesting as a construct if you 
think about China. Russia seems to me to pose multiple challenges, 
whether in terms of European security, whether in terms of what 
it’s doing in the Middle East, whether in terms of how it’s using 
digital tools to interfere in our and others’ elections. But I see Russia 
as a collection of specific security threats or challenges rather than 
something systemic. Russia is just too small and too weak to pose 
a systemic threat and intellectually it offers nothing. I mean, Putin’s 
great failure has been Russia doesn’t represent much of anything 
economically or politically whereas the Soviet Union did offer an 
alternative.

So if there’s a parallel it’s much more China. But when it comes to 
Russia now, the question is what kind of specific responses do we 
develop for each one of its probes, what do we do about Ukraine or 
what do we do about the European security challenge, what might 
we do about the Middle East, what might we do to the digital chal-
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lenge. But it doesn’t represent something larger. It doesn’t represent 
something systemic and it doesn’t represent a model of anything.

China is China. If there’s an applicability it would be potentially China. 
One other thing. Russia under Putin has essentially rejected inte-
gration in many forms with the West, whereas China has not. China 
wants to be partially integrated. It also wants to, in some ways, 
change the rules of the game. In some cases it’s creating an alterna-
tive game with things like Belt and Road. So to me the intellectual 
question would be how does one or could one dust off containment 
for dealing with the challenge of China.

I’m not wild about the comparison because again I’ve not given up 
on what I would call selective integration of China but China does 
represent, given its economic strength, its size, its growing ambi-
tions as well as capabilities, more of a global challenge to the United 
States. So again, I don’t think containment gives you the overall an-
swer. There are elements of containment that might make sense but 
containment per se is not a particularly useful framework for either 
contemporary Russia or for China.

I think the country where it may make the most sense as a model, 
at least as a starting off point, is Iran. Iran is something of an impe-
rial power in the Middle East. And the question is, if one needs to 
frustrate Iran’s external push in the region, then the question is at 
the same time, can one bring about a mellowing of Iranian power? 
And so if there’s a country out there where there’s an applicability of 
containment, off the top of my head Iran probably comes closest.

E:  We want to go back to Kennan and containment and the Soviet 
Union. How, in “The Long Telegram” and the X article, did Kennan 
address the threat from Russia—he used the term Russia—to how 
Americans defined themselves? One of the reasons that the case 
for renewed containment is compelling is the degree to which 
today’s Russian challenge conjures up a similar internal panic in the 
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United States: election interference, manipulation of our deepest 
internal divisions and our most sensitive inequities, genuine unfair-
nesses and injustices in American society. All of this is being done 
cynically, just as it was by the Bolsheviks, by Putin’s Russia and yet 
it boils down to a challenge that is about us, more than about where 
Russia is on the map. 

RH:  I don’t see the parallel. For so much of the Cold War, we were 
worried about the appeal of the Soviet Union and that internal forces 
in various countries would be attracted to it, communist parties and 
other such fronts and the like. Nobody is worried about that now. 
Russia again has a willingness to use brute force, be it military force 
or energy. It’s able to use digital tools to its advantage, mainly to 
weaken the fabric of other societies. But these are for specific situa-
tions. Again, Russia doesn’t represent a model of any sort of political 
or economic development idea.

I think when Putin departs the scene, Russia is going to face a crisis, 
not only a succession crisis because there’s no concept of legitimacy 
in Russia anymore, but it’s going to face a crisis of its political and 
economic future. None of the foundations have been laid there. So I 
think it’s wrong to exaggerate the Russia [threat]—that doesn’t mean 
Russia is not dangerous, it’s not a problem—but I think it’s wrong to 
exaggerate or see it in any way as a new Cold War or justifying con-
tainment. It’s not that kind of a challenge.

It’s a challenge; I don’t mean to underestimate it. But it’s a different 
sort of challenge. Again, I think Iran is a better match in the region 
because it’s not self-limiting and I think China potentially, globally, 
but again China is a more multifaceted country than the Soviet Union 
ever was. The Soviet Union developed economically largely apart. 
China is much more integrated. So I don’t think containment particu-
larly gives us the tools. But I don’t find the parallel to Russia particu-
larly helpful right now.



84

The challenge for U.S. policy toward China is not to push back all of 
the time—though in some cases it is—it’s more how to get China to 
continue its integration but on terms closer to ones we want to see. 
Where China has been most effective—say, economically harvesting 
the fruits of that integration without going through many of the dis-
ciplines or constraints of integration—that’s been a mistake on our 
part. The problem, and to me the mistake wasn’t letting China into 
the WTO, but it was not monitoring its trade behavior close enough 
after it got in and disciplining it and adapting to it along the way.

But China is not an outsider in many cases trying to overthrow the 
order, so much as use it for its own purposes, and that’s why, again, 
containment is not the best model. I also don’t think it particularly 
works for North Korea. North Korea is not a model to anyone or any-
thing, it’s just a threat and we have to find ways to deter that threat, 
or one way or another reduce it through diplomacy or other tools. It’s 
a one-dimensional challenge and in that sense it’s closer to Russia. 

But I think Iran is the one country out there, not on a global basis 
but a regional basis, where the idea of containment probably has its 
greatest applicability. For China, we’re going to have to come up with 
a new foreign policy approach, which may draw some elements of 
containment, but it will also draw many elements of integration. And 
I think we’ll have to come up with something that’s specific to China.

E: One final question. Kennan was a very deep area expert, having 
been schooled in the European school of humanities and in Russian 
studies. But he was also an intellectual who came very directly out 
of the Foreign Service. How are we doing on both of those fronts to-
day, on area expertise and on human capital, in the Foreign Service?

RH: Well, area expertise is easier or less difficult to generate: one 
can study language, one can study history, one can go live in a 
certain place for a number of years. So, you know, the problem is 
sometimes with the bias towards rotation. So we seem to often 
move people around to the point where it’s hard to get sufficient 
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depth. But all things being equal, my own view, the challenge wasn’t 
with area expertise—it was more, how do individuals who get area 
expertise not only get area expertise? How do we make sure they 
have the functional skills; how do we make sure they have the com-
parative understandings? How do we make sure they have the skills 
to think about policymaking and think strategically about the United 
States?

The biggest weakness of many Foreign Service officers, I found, 
wasn’t their lack of knowledge of this or that country or region. Rath-
er, it was that they weren’t nearly as good at thinking about what 
the blue team should be doing, what should we, the United States, 
be trying to do. That to me reveals the limits of area expertise. Area 
expertise tells you about just that, a context; it doesn’t tell you about 
how the United States ought to advance its interest in that context 
or with those countries.

Your second question about expertise more broadly, similar to what I 
just said, would apply. What I’m going to say now is not going to win 
me a lot of friends. With very few exceptions, the skills of Foreign 
Service officers, in many cases, were not strategic. They didn’t have 
enough history and were better, again, at understanding the world 
of this or that country or this or that region than they were about 
thinking strategically about the means and ends of American foreign 
policy. And so I did not find, for the most part, Foreign Service offi-
cers all that useful when it came to thinking on the Policy Planning 
staff or elsewhere about what the United States should be doing in 
a particular part of the world. They were very good at describing the 
part of the world, about giving a better feeling for it, but they weren’t 
very good about offering up creative or, if you will, quote unquote, 
offensive ideas about how we advance our own interests. There 
were some important exceptions. I can think of a number of individu-
als who were just that, but they were the exceptions in terms of the 
Foreign Service.
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And it’s one of the reasons, by the way, on Policy Planning staffs 
or National Security Council staffs, you always want to have a mix 
of people. You want to have a few FSOs, but you also want to have 
some military officers, and above all, you want to have what I would 
call scholar practitioners. People, if you will, in Kennan’s mold, outsid-
ers, people who were trained academically, people who were trained 
as historians, or political scientists, or economists, and you bring 
them in. And to me, often the most effective people in government 
were people who came to government with a rich background from 
academia, but they were also practical people who learned how to 
get things done.

One of the things about Kennan, by the way—I mentioned that 
when he wrote he often brought in aspects of literature. What I think 
Kennan’s real gift was and what in some ways set him apart was 
not just the quality of prose or the quality of his thinking, but that he 
was better able than almost anyone else I know to integrate thinking 
about culture with other social sciences. So when he wrote about 
Russia, he could blend or incorporate aspects of understanding Rus-
sia, the Russian psyche, Russian culture with history, with political 
science, and then write about American foreign policy in that larger 
context. So many of the rest of us, we all come out of universities 
and we all reflect the training in this or that department.

But as I often tell people who work with me, universities have 
departments; the world does not. That was to me Kennan’s great 
advantage. He was able to take things from different worlds, again, 
literature or history, and then combine them in ways that very few 
contemporary people, particularly those that come out of more quan-
titative traditions, or more, now, modern social sciences, they can’t 
do. So people who have area studies tend to be narrowly area stud-
ies; too many social scientists tend to be narrowly social scientists.

Kennan was a much more—[he] had the kind of richness that comes 
with a kind of horizontal reach that went across disciplinary lines or de-
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partmental lines. And that was his great advantage, so he could write 
something like “The Long Telegram,” the X article, and have a profound 
understanding of Russian culture and Russian political culture and that 
provided the background to when he would be writing prescription. 
And there are very few people, in my experience, who can do that. 
Indeed, Kennan’s one of the only ones.
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U.S. President George W. Bush and Russian President 
Vladimir Putin, in Sochi, Russia, April 6, 2008
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George F. Kennan’s impact on American foreign policy was not 
confined to Russian and European affairs during the Cold War; 

the same is true for his contemporary relevance. Kennan exercised 
his most profound influence over U.S. foreign policy as the inaugural 
director (1947–50) of the State Department’s Policy Planning staff. It 
was from that position that he proposed containing the Soviet Union 
and developed the strategic rationale for its original centerpiece: the 
European Recovery Program (the Marshall Plan). The purview of the 
Planning staff was global, however, and Kennan was deeply involved 
in formulating policies toward other parts of the world, including East 
Asia. Both his strategic approach to the Far East and his thinking 
about the Soviet Union during the Cold War apply to the primary stra-
tegic challenge the United States faces in East Asia today: the rise of 
China and its bid for regional and global influence.72

Although some analysts and policymakers advocate containment of 
China, he doctrine of containment itself, at least as he originally con-
ceived it, is probably obsolete in East Asia. He never thought it was 
applicable to China. Kennan insisted that containment was aimed 
exclusively at preventing the spread of Soviet Communist influence. 
During the early Cold War years, Kennan was among those who 
assessed—correctly—that Beijing would never fall under the effec-
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tive control of Moscow. He later deemed the Sino-Soviet split “the 
greatest single measure of containment that could be conceived.”73

The only place where Kennan thought containment applied in East 
Asia was Japan, a country he judged both strategically important to 
the United States and susceptible to Soviet infiltration. Japan was 
the only Asian country on his list of the five major industrial pow-
er centers on the globe; the United States, the United Kingdom, 
Western Europe, and the Soviet Union were the others. Kennan long 
dismissed China and the rest of mainland East Asia as incapable of 
posing a strategic threat to the United States. Only in Japan should 
U.S. policy aim at preventing Soviet influence and control. Accord-
ingly, during 1947–48 Kennan was the leading bureaucratic driver of 
a redirection of American occupation policy in Japan. Policy moved 
away from a punitive approach and toward an economic reconstruc-
tion that would protect the country against potential Soviet inroads. 
This “reverse course” in occupation policy was essentially the East 
Asia counterpart to the Marshall Plan.

Kennan nonetheless later advocated elements of an approach to 
China that seemed to echo his original idea of containment. In the 
1960s, he occasionally cited the need to erect barriers against any 
Communist Chinese influence that upset the post-war balance of 
power in East Asia. This sounded a lot like his definition of contain-
ment in the X article as the “adroit and vigilant application of coun-
terforce at a series of constantly shifting geographical and political 
points.”74 Kennan today would probably still be promoting policies 
and strategies for counterbalancing Chinese influence within East 
Asia relative to that of the United States), which appears to be a 
central strategic objective of current U.S. policy. It is precisely this 
objective, and American policies designed to advance it, which 
Chinese leaders routinely refer to as “containment.” Yet there is a 
persistent rhetorical disconnect between Washington’s denial that 
it seeks to “contain” China and Beijing’s firm belief that U.S. policy 
toward China constitutes “containment.”
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Aside from this semantic difference, the key reason that Kennan’s 
original doctrine of containment does not apply to today’s China is 
that China—contrary to the narrative that has emerged in the 21st 

century—does not represent the existential or ideological threat to 
the United States that the Soviet Union did during the Cold War. 
Kennan would have recognized this, even though he was myopic in 
his longtime dismissal of China’s strategic potential. In the X article, 
he specified that Soviet ideology asserted a “basic antagonism be-
tween the capitalist and socialist worlds” that excluded “any sincere 
assumption of a community of aims” and instead required Soviet 
leaders to recognize “that it was their duty eventually to overthrow 
the political forces beyond their borders.”75 

Chinese Communist leaders have never subscribed to such a ze-
ro-sum, winner-take-all strategy. They have moved far beyond any 
fundamental antagonism between capitalism and socialism. Their 
“socialism with Chinese characteristics” is essentially a merger 
with capitalism. Moreover, Beijing’s promotion of its governance 
and economic model abroad is meant to legitimize that model rather 
than to impose it on the rest of the world. Unlike the Soviet Union, 
Beijing is genuinely pursuing a “community of aims” with the United 
States and other Western powers on shared interests and transna-
tional issues of mutual concern. Although Kennan did not anticipate 
the nature and scope of the strategic challenge from China today, 
he would have appreciated the differences between China today 
and the Soviet Union of the early Cold War. Old-school containment 
would not work against contemporary China. 

COMPARING THE SOVIET UNION AND CHINA

Several lessons follow from the distinctions between today’s China 
and the Soviet Union that Kennan dealt with during the Cold War. 
First, it is crucial not to misattribute motives to an adversary. The 
current U.S. National Security Strategy characterizes China as a 
“revisionist power” that is “attempting to erode American security 
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and prosperity” and to “shape a world antithetical to U.S. values and 
interests.”76 Kennan would have been duly skeptical of these asser-
tions. Among the mistakes that he ascribed to U.S. policymakers 
after World War II were those “involved in attributing to the Soviet 
leadership aims and intentions it did not really have.”77 Writing in 
the late 1970s, he criticized Washington for making several false 
assumptions about Moscow: that Soviet leaders were still “primarily 
inspired by a desire, and intention, to achieve world domination”; 
that the Soviet military served “primarily aggressive rather than de-
fensive purposes”; and thus that “the differences in aim and outlook 
between the Soviet Union and the United States... can be resolved 
only by war or by the achievement of an unanswerable military supe-
riority by the one party or the other.”78

Moreover, recent trends in the characterization of China’s strategic 

intentions are eerily reminiscent of a shift Kennan perceived in the 

1970s toward a “frame of mind in which the Soviet Union appeared 

in a far more menacing posture than had been the case for the past 

decade.” He speculated that this “seemingly inexorable advance” 

of “hysteria of professed fear and hostility” was attributable to 

“a subconscious need on the part of a great many people for an 

external enemy...in the light of the frustrations and failures Amer-

ican society had been suffering at the time.” Whatever its causes, 

Kennan characterized its effects as “the sweeping militarization of 

the American view of East-West relations...the acceptance of the 

likelihood, if not the inevitability, of a Soviet-American war; [and] the 

contemptuous neglect of the more favorable possibilities.” In his 

estimation, all of these assumptions were “either quite incorrect or 

highly improbable” but “like all false prophecies and all false images 

of conflict and enmity, tend to be self-fulfilling.”79 As he observed: 

“A war regarded as inevitable or even probable, and thus much 

prepared for, has a very good chance of eventually being fought.”80
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Similar assumptions are widely echoed in American commentary 

and policy discussions about China today. As the U.S. policy 

documents cited above show, a menacing and militarized view 

of China has fueled the fear that Beijing’s Communist leaders are 

determined to undermine American security, prosperity, values, 

and interests. But this exaggerates the nature and extent of China’s 

strategic objectives, which are essentially focused on maximizing 

China’s own security and prosperity relative to the United States. 

Beijing clearly is competing with Washington and is doing so broadly 

and relentlessly. The National Security Strategy correctly asserts 

that China “will compete across political, economic, and military 

arenas” using “technology and information...economic inducements 

and penalties, influence operations, and implied military threats to 

persuade other states to heed its political and security agenda” 

and “gain competitive advantages against the United States.”81 But 

this is not, and need not be, an existential winner-take-all contest. 

Chinese leaders almost certainly recognize that making it so would 

be destabilizing and probably futile. Yet the American presumption of 

such an absolutist China goal—and “neglect of the more favorable 

possibilities,” as Kennan warned with regard to the Soviet Union—

could be a self-fulfilling prophecy by prompting U.S. strategies 

that reinforce Chinese fears of absolutist American goals. This risk 

would be exacerbated if—as Kennan also suspected in the Soviet 

case—U.S. perceptions of the Chinese threat today reflect in part 

the “frustrations and failures of American society.”

In another claim of central relevance to China, Kennan attributed 
Washington’s misunderstanding and mischaracterization of Soviet 
intentions to an American failure to understand the Russians’ his-
torical mindset. “I tried to show,” he wrote, “that this Soviet threat 
looked less dramatic when viewed from a historical perspective 
than when that perspective was absent.”82 The original X article was 
built on Kennan’s analysis of Russian history as the primary source 
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of Moscow’s world view and its approach to dealing with perceived 
external challenges. Similarly, the prevailing American understand-
ing and characterization of Chinese strategic goals and behavior 
largely overlooks or dismisses the historical “sources of Chinese 
conduct”—especially what the Chinese call their “century of humil-
iation” at the hands of foreign powers from the 1840s to the 1940s. 
For the U.S., lack of attention to this Chinese historical experience is 
a major source of bilateral distrust and misunderstanding. Too often 
Washington undervalues the crucial defensive element in China’s 
historical mindset.  

RATIONALIZING U.S. EXPECTATIONS AND 
GOALS IN EAST ASIA

In addition to highlighting the risks of misunderstanding China, Ken-
nan would also caution against expecting too much from China. In 
particular, China is unlikely to replicate American values and modes 
of governance or diplomatic conduct. Kennan long believed that 
U.S. policy towards East Asia (as elsewhere) was overly moralistic. 
He lamented the “tendency to achieve our foreign policy objectives 
by inducing other governments to sign up to professions of high 
moral and legal principle,” and he specifically complained that this 
“seems to have achieved the status of a basic diplomatic method” 
in East Asia.83 Accordingly, Kennan would be skeptical of the current 
emphasis on Beijing’s obligation to comply with Western “rules and 
norms” in its international behavior. In 1950, during a policy debate 
over whether Communist China should be admitted to the United 
Nations, Kennan criticized the “moral indignation about the Chinese 
Communists” that he saw infecting policy discussions. In another 
comparison with the Soviet Union, he warned that Washington was 
grappling with the same problem that had afflicted “we old Russia 
hands” 20 years earlier: “the fundamental ethical conflict between 
their ideals and ours.” Kennan recommended that Washington not 
let this derail pragmatic diplomacy: “Let us recognize the legitimacy 
of differences of interest and philosophy” between countries “and 
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not pretend that they can be made to disappear behind some com-
mon philosophical concept.”84 With regard to Russia, he said “there 
is no use in looking for...a capitalistic and liberal-democratic one, with 
institutions closely resembling those of our own republic.” Americans 
should “repress, and if possible...extinguish once and for all, our invet-
erate tendency to judge others by the extent to which they contrive 
to be like ourselves.”85 Kennan would have said the same about China 
today. U.S. policies aimed at producing regime change or at restructur-
ing China’s economic system to make it less competitive or easier to 
manage are likely to have only incremental if any success.   

In the late 1970s, Kennan recommended a pragmatic approach to 
China: “tread warily and not too fast, recognizing the great differ-
ences in the psychology of the two peoples as well as those that 
mark the ideals and purposes of the two governments.” This could 
be done “without neglecting, or failing to manifest, the great respect 
Americans have traditionally had for Chinese civilization and the sym-
pathy they have felt for the vicissitudes of Chinese life in the modern 
age.” His bottom line was straightforward: “Let us collaborate where 
we can, agree to differ where we cannot, and see whether we can-
not contrive to live reasonably peaceably together for the time being, 
despite our differences, not asking too much of each other—or too 
little.”86 Although the strategic challenge from China is substantially 
greater than Kennan anticipated when he wrote this in 1977, the 
same guidance seems wholly appropriate today.

Beyond advocating a moderation of American expectations of China, 
Kennan would go further: recommending a reassessment and recali-
bration of overall American strategic goals in East Asia. The perennial 
U.S. policy objectives in the region are: preventing the emergence 
of an exclusive, hostile hegemon there that threatens U.S. access 
and vital interests; and sustaining the United States’ own primacy 
as security guarantor in the Western Pacific. The latter is generally 
viewed as the best way to avert a hegemonic challenge from China. 
Kennan probably would be ambivalent about both of these premises. 
Although China probably does seek to restore what it sees as its 
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rightful place as the preeminent power in East Asia, there is no com-
pelling evidence that it seeks to establish a hostile, exclusive hegemo-
ny that excludes a U.S. role or presence there. On the contrary, Beijing 
almost certainly sees this as neither achievable nor necessary, and 
Chinese pursuit of it as likely to be counterproductive, risking China’s 
own security and economic prosperity.

In addition, U.S. primacy is itself not permanently sustainable in East 
Asia. Kennan was always carefully attentive to American capabilities, 
emphasizing the need to define interests and objectives so they did 
not exceed the country’s grasp. This applied especially to East Asia, 
and it still does today. Kennan wrote in 1948 that Washington—de-
spite its enormous international power in the wake of World War II—
was “greatly over-extended in our whole thinking about what we can 
accomplish, and should try to accomplish,” in East Asia: “We will have 
to dispense with all sentimentality and day-dreaming; and our atten-
tion will have to be concentrated everywhere on our immediate na-
tional objectives.” He advised that “we must observe great restraint in 
our attitude toward the Far Eastern areas” because “the day is not far 
off when we are going to have to deal in straight power concepts.”87

This thinking was only reinforced by the impact of the Korean War 
and later the Vietnam War, both of which confirmed the constraints 
on Washington’s ability to secure its preferences and to dictate the 
course of events in East Asia. Today, given the shifts in the balance 
of power that have followed the Cold War, Washington again faces 
the need to “deal in straight power concepts” in the Western Pacific, 
and to adjust its policies and strategies there accordingly. This should 
include recognition that defining U.S. primacy in the region as a vital 
long-term interest would probably be counterproductive. It could fuel a 
“winner take all” contest that China itself would prefer to avoid. 

PURSUING A NEW REGIONAL BALANCE

Because a shifting balance of power in East Asia is eclipsing the 
“Pax Americana,” Kennan probably would support those who ad-
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vocate proactive efforts by the United States and China to pursue 
a new balance of power in the region and not to risk an escalatory 
arms race or zero-sum struggle for hegemony. Here too his think-
ing about U.S.-Soviet relations during the Cold War is instructive. 
Kennan judged that Washington’s failure to engage Moscow in just 
such a process in Northeast Asia had contributed to the Korean War: 
“We Americans had little interest in negotiating with the Russians 
a political settlement of the problems of that region, and particularly 
one which would have put an end to our military presence in Japan.” 
In Kennan’s view, this was likely because “we had already made up 
our minds that Moscow was determined to launch a new world war” 
for which Washington would need Japan “as a military outpost.” But 
it was also because “Russia was already identified as the epito-
me of evil; and it wouldn’t look good, from the domestic political 
standpoint, to be negotiating and compromising with evil.”88 Similar 
sentiments are now fueling reluctance or resistance to any kind of 
mutual accommodation with China, even though this might be the 
only viable path to avoiding a new cold war.

Central to this approach would be avoiding a military response to what 
are essentially non-military problems. China’s territorial and maritime 
sovereignty claims in the East and South China Seas are obvious dan-
gers in this respect. Kennan spent the second half of his life insisting 
that he never intended containment to be a military strategy, and his 
approach to East Asia always emphasized the need to minimize U.S. 
military commitments in the region. His early Cold War vision for 
American policy there generated what became the “defensive perim-
eter” concept: an offshore balancing approach that excluded Amer-
ican forces or military commitments on the mainland of East Asia. 
Kennan’s version went further in advocating the demilitarization and 
neutralization of Japan, with the exception of U.S. bases on the island 
of Okinawa. The Korean War, however, negated the defensive perim-
eter concept by providing the rationale for U.S. military alliances with 
South Korea, Japan, and Taiwan and the beginning of U.S. intervention 
in Vietnam. Kennan had advised against all of this. 
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Nonetheless, and possibly because of that history, Kennan’s warn-
ings about the militarization of foreign policy problems remain valid 
in East Asia today. Here another comparison between China and the 
Soviet Union is illustrative. When Kennan perceived a “sweeping mili-
tarization of the American view” of U.S.-Russia relations in the 1970s, 
he asked rhetorically what impact this was likely to have on Russian 
officials, who “have always been prone to exaggerated suspicions.” 
Given that, he predicted that “Soviet leaders will see sinister motives 
behind these various phenomena—that they will conclude, in par-
ticular, that we have come to see war as inevitable and have put out 
of our minds all possibilities for the peaceful accommodation of our 
differences”; if so, “then they, too, will tend to put such possibilities 
out of theirs.89 This later formed the basis for Kennan’s criticism of the 
U.S. decision to pursue NATO expansion in the 1990s. He correctly 
anticipated that the inclusion of former Soviet bloc countries in NATO 
would fuel post-Soviet Russia’s threat perceptions and the subsequent 
hardening of Moscow’s approach to Washington.

Similar worries accrue to Chinese perceptions of the emphasis 
on military alliances and deployments in the post-Cold War U.S. 
approach to East Asia. Beijing perceives a range of U.S. policies in 
the region as military challenges to Chinese interests and security, 
whereas Washington perceives China itself as expansionist and 
routinely dismisses the notion that Chinese military behavior is a 
response to steps taken by the United States or other countries. 
Recognizing this as a classic security dilemma, Kennan would have 
advised that U.S. policymakers help mitigate it by focusing more on 
diplomatic and economic engagement than on military posturing in 
order to defuse regional tension.

Kennan, however, would not have sought to abandon the U.S 
alliance network in East Asia. Despite his reservations about the 
alliances and the rationale for their establishment, which echoed his 
resistance to the original establishment of NATO, he would concede 
their utility as vehicles for shared interests and goals. At the same 
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time, he cautioned against taking allies for granted. Although he 
subscribed to and even pioneered the notion that Japan should be 
the centerpiece of U.S. policy in East Asia, he was always skeptical 
of the military aspect of the alliance. He correctly anticipated that the 
U.S. military presence in Japan would become a source of bilateral 
tension, predicting that Tokyo would eventually seek to make inde-
pendent judgments about its foreign and security policies. In the 
1970s and 1980s, he even encouraged the Japanese to do so. Tokyo 
to some extent is following that advice today, partly because it is 
uncertain about the long-term reliability of Washington’s attention to 
Japan’s interests.

More broadly, Kennan advised against expecting too much from U.S. 
allies and partners in East Asia. He anticipated that their nationalism 
would chafe under perceived U.S. pressure, and observed that their 
comfort with and confidence in U.S. engagement in the region could 
be fickle. Referring specifically to the U.S. competition with China for 
regional influence, Kennan observed in 1964 that “we are working 
here with and through the reactions of people who are not under our 
power, and on whose loyalty and obedience we can lay no ultimate 
claim.” In its engagement in the region, Washington was attached 
“not just to the virtues of our associates...but also to their weak-
nesses: to their domestic political ambitions, their inefficiencies, 
their blind spots, their internal rivalries and divisions, their ulterior 
commitments.” The United States had been hampered “at one 
time or another, by short-sightedness, by timidity, by indifference, 
by misunderstanding, by deliberately inculcated error, by dislike of 
foreigners or anti-western prejudices, and above all, by the congeni-
tal tendency of people to respond to the efforts of outsiders towards 
their protection by slackening their own.”90

All of these variables are amply visible in East Asia today, imposing 
limits on what the United States can presume to accomplish through 
its network of alliances and partnerships in the region. There are 
persistent and, in some cases, expanding fault-lines between U.S. 
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interests, objectives, and threat perceptions and those of U.S. allies 
in the region. These fault-lines have been exacerbated by growing 
uncertainties about the substance and sustainability of Washington’s 
commitment to the region, given the constraints on the resources 
the United States can devote there. These trends have prompted 
many countries in the region, including U.S. allies, to recalibrate their 
foreign and security policies, reinforcing their reluctance to choose 
sides between the United States and China.

MAKING FOREIGN POLICY

Kennan’s wisdom on some East Asian issues notwithstanding, 
there were flaws and inconsistencies in his approach to the region 
that would encumber his contributions to foreign policymaking 
today. Some of his ideas were short-sighted or unrealistic, such as 
his dismissal of China’s strategic potential and his proposal for the 
neutralization of Japan. His ethnocentric and racist attitudes toward 
East Asian peoples’ capacity for governance, although typical of his 
generation, marred his judgment and would be anathema in diplo-
macy today. Some of his ideas were not politically viable because 
he was often inattentive to the domestic political drivers of foreign 
policy. He believed that foreign policy should be insulated from the 
vicissitudes of public opinion. Kennan would no doubt be appalled by 
the influence of social media on foreign policy today, and by the role 
that the press and party politics play in constraining policy options or 
forcing decisions.

He would be particularly dismayed by the marginalization of exper-
tise that often occurs in the politicized fog of the decision-making 
process. During the intense policy debates in the summer of 1950, 
when Washington was grappling to understand the motives and 
actions of the various players in the Korean War, he characterized 
the debate as “a labyrinth of ignorance and error and conjecture, in 
which truth is intermingled with fiction at a hundred points [and] in 
which unjustified assumptions have attained the validity of premis-
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es.” He complained that substantive expertise was being dismissed 
as too arcane to serve as the basis for crucial policy decisions, 
bemoaning the discomfort among policymakers with input from 
experts “to analyze the probabilities involved in your enemy’s mental 
processes or calculate his weaknesses. It seems safer to give him 
the benefit of every doubt in matters of strength and to credit him in-
discriminately with all aggressive designs, even when some of them 
are mutually contradictory.” Kennan lamented that he and his fellow 
Russia experts were “inclined to wonder...whether the day had not 
passed when the Government had use for the qualities of persons 
like ourselves.”91 The same problem is reflected in many of today’s 
policy debates about China’s strategic intentions and behavior, which 
often appear to be informed and driven by specious evidence, sim-
plistic analysis, conspiracy theories, or ideological bias.

Another flaw in Kennan’s approach to East Asia was his failure to rec-
oncile his advocacy for strategic restraint with his belief that Amer-
ican credibility and prestige should not be compromised. He faced 
this dilemma on the Korean Peninsula, which he had dismissed as 
strategically unimportant but where he immediately supported U.S. 
intervention in the Korean War: he deemed the Communist advance 
an unacceptable setback for U.S. credibility in the region. Similarly, 
he had advised against U.S. involvement in Vietnam but did not ad-
vocate complete withdrawal until American prestige was irretrievably 
lost. Kennan was not alone in having no easy solution to this dilem-
ma of credibility versus restraint, which continues to complicate U.S. 
foreign policy—particularly in East Asia, where Washington faces the 
challenge of adjusting to historical shifts in the balance of power.

Despite these flaws and inconsistencies, one element of Kennan’s 
thinking merits close attention in the strategic environment the Unit-
ed States now confronts in East Asia. Kennan focused consistently 
on the limits on American power and influence and the need to take 
those limits into account when defining American strategic interests 
and objectives. His relatively narrow definition of U.S. interests and 
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his opposition to extensive foreign military commitments almost 
certainly reflected an understanding that the United States’ position 
in East Asia after World War II was a historical anomaly that could 
not be eternal. Almost 75 years later, he would see validation of this 
in the tectonic shifts in the balance of power both within East Asia 
and globally that have been wrought by globalization, technological 
change and the rise and fall of great powers. Washington needs to 
acknowledge the impact of power shifts on its relative capabilities and to 
recalibrate its foreign policy wish list to bring it into alignment with what is 
reasonable and achievable.

Kennan would offer one final word of advice. He observed in the X 
article that the Soviet challenge was “in essence a test of the over-
all worth of the United States as a nation among nations” and that 
American success in meeting that challenge would depend in large 
part on “the degree to which the United States can create among 
the peoples of the world generally the impression of a country that 
knows what it wants, which is coping successfully with the problem 
of its internal life and with the responsibilities of a world power, and 
which has a spiritual vitality capable of holding its own among the 
major ideological currents of the time.”92 He reiterated this theme in 
the 1970s: “show me an America that has pulled itself together and 
is what it ought to be, then I will tell you how we are going to defend 
ourselves against the Russians.”93 As for the challenge of dealing 
with China today, these words are as applicable as they ever were.
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Editors:  We’d like to ask you to expand on a legacy that must have 
been a daily presence for you at Princeton as well as at the Office 
of Policy Planning and then to comment on the various issues in 
which George Kennan played a big role, from Russia to global grand 
strategy to the interplay between American domestic affairs and our 
role in the world.

Anne-Marie Slaughter: George Kennan is a legend for anyone who 
came of age during the Cold War and studied international relations 
because international relations really was U.S.-Soviet politics and the 
ramifications of U.S.-Soviet politics.

He set the terms of U.S. policy and the Soviet response, not as he 
actually intended it to be, which is a large part of the irony of George 
Kennan; but containment was certainly the frame.

I would have said containment and engagement, although we paid 
more attention to the containment side, but for him it was contain-
ment of the Soviet Union and engagement of our allies.

From that point of view, I could have told you as an undergraduate 
who George Kennan was and what his containment policy was. 

INTERVIEW WITH 
ANNE-MARIE 
SLAUGHTER
September 25, 2018
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Indeed, I knew about the director of Policy Planning because of 
George Kennan.

In that role, he’s the icon for all of us. But if you are the director of 
Policy Planning, and if you are as I was, the first woman director 
of Policy Planning, I felt a particular need to try to do important or 
lasting work. And if you’re a Princeton graduate working in foreign 
policy, then he is doubly venerated as a great Princetonian. You can’t 
move without thinking about George Kennan.

Indeed, immediately after I was named, I was given a copy of a 
photograph in the archives at Princeton of Kennan being sworn in 
as ambassador to the Soviet Union which I kept in my office when I 
was at Policy Planning and still have in my office now. 

The shoes are even bigger to fill because, as director of Policy 
Planning, George Marshall said to Kennan: “Avoid trivia,” which is 
the informal motto of the policy planning staff. Kennan acted on that 
advice by creating the Marshall Plan.

He was a towering figure, and his office was the nerve center of 
some of the most important policy initiatives of the 20th century; I’m 
not sure anyone has ever lived up to that.

Some of those stories are probably apocryphal, but let’s just say 
Kennan’s shadow looms very large indeed.

E: You were not only the first woman to occupy the post of which 
George Kennan was the inaugural holder, but you were one of a rela-
tively smaller number of scholars who served in this position.

AMS: Yes.

E: Kennan has an interesting mixed background. He had a very tradi-
tional scholarly grounding in Soviet affairs, Russian history, etc.

At the same time, he was a man who spent his career in gov-
ernment in the Foreign Service until he moved to the Institute of 
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Advanced Studies at Princeton. What are your thoughts about the 
balance between the role of scholar in policy planning and that of a 
policymaker?

AMS: I think it’s gotten harder and harder in the intervening decades 
to straddle those two worlds. If you think about the OSS in World 
War II, plenty of the top diplomats and professors went in and out 
much more readily than they do now in large part because of the 
hyper specialization and quantification of what we now call political 
science. In Kennan’s day the field would have been called politics or 
government or international affairs, which tells you a lot right there.

I think it was also easier for diplomats to be scholars. They were 
deeply specialized in the language and culture of a particular country 
or region and were encouraged to write wide-ranging analysis in 
cables.

Indeed, Kennan’s long telegram is called “The Long Telegram” for a 
reason. It is essentially a scholarly article. 

The idea that you could be a deep thinker and a scholar in the sense 
of someone who is extremely well-read, who is grounded in history 
and politics and culture and who can put new ideas together and have 
a role to play in the government and in the academy was something 
that was much more true in Kennan’s era than it is today. Today there 
are only a handful of people of my generation who have held positions 
at our leading universities and also served in government, in politics. 
There are a number of economists, but I can name on one hand my 
colleagues who have done that.

Instead, you have people who are in think tanks, which did not exist 
in Kennan’s day. Brookings did and the Council on Foreign Relations 
did, but you didn’t have nearly the range of think tanks that you have 
now.

Those at think tanks, although they often have an advanced de-
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gree, a doctoral degree—it’s often from Britain, not from the United 
States—generally do not meet the criteria of academic departments 
in a particular discipline. The academics do more basic research; 
think tankers focus more on the details of policy, whereas Kennan 
really focused on history and culture and politics in a deep sense to 
inform policy. I think that’s gotten harder to do.

E:  We’d would like to ask about the possible difference in sensibility 
between yourself and Kennan. Educated as a historian and a Rus-
sianist, he always strikes me as an intelligent pessimist.

AMS: Yes.

E:  We’d think that there’s a certain optimism in the way you look at 
international politics. Is Kennan distant in that respect or do you feel 
a strong sense of that intellectual connection to him?

AMS:  Yes, I think Kennan and I are—we’re not opposites but we line 
up differently in the different schools of international relations. He’d 
call me a legalist/moralist. He would associate me with people who 
get the United States into trouble because we are too optimistic 
about human nature and about the United States and the potential of 
its power. And he would be right that I am more optimistic than he 
was.

On the other hand, I would say that some of these differing per-
spectives come with age and experience and the times you live in. 
Kennan had just come through World War I and World War II. He had 
seen the very worst of what man can do to man, and he understood 
the ways in which grand ideas and visions can go terribly, terribly 
wrong from World War II, obviously, but equally importantly, I think, 
from 1917.

If you’re a Russianist, you’ve seen the hope of the early revolution 
against the czars and then you’ve seen what became of that and 
so you’re suspicious of grand visions. Whereas if you’re me, you’ve 
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come of age in the 1960s and 1970s and the early 1980s. The 1970s 
were a time of malaise and disarray. But fundamentally the United 
States had won the two great wars of the 20th century, fighting 
on the right side. The full implications of Vietnam had not yet been 
internalized.

1989 was this defining moment for my generation, a time of great 
hope, optimism, and human potential. I was 31 in 1989; the Cold 
War had ended essentially on Western terms; the peoples of East-
ern Europe were rising up and claiming their universal rights. One of 
my very first scholarly articles was called “Revolution of the Spirit,” 
about the profoundly human dimension of those revolutions.

But I will say that 30 years after 1989 I’m probably more of a Kennan 
disciple. I still see the best of human nature and think it will triumph. 
But I am chastened by exactly what he warned us about, which is 
intervening and believing we can shape others without fully, deeply 
understanding who they are, what their culture is, what their motiva-
tions are.

In the telling of the history of the Truman administration, Kennan was 
the intellectual godfather of the Marshall Plan.

This exemplifies the reach of American power in shaping the intel-
lectual, political, social, and economic context for much of the world. 
But we have never been able to duplicate what we achieved in the 
rebuilding of Europe and Japan.

E: So how could Kennan’s vision of human nature and his pessimism 
or skepticism have generated a policy vision like the Marshall Plan, 
which ended up being so successful?

AMS: Yes. I do think where Kennan was both prophetic and pro-
found in a way that he gets less credit for was in understanding the 
domestic roots of foreign policy.

We think of containment as linked to structural realism, a doctrine 
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I think Kennan had very little time for. It focuses on geopolitical 
structures of hegemony, bipolarity, and multipolarity and assumes all 
state behavior can be deduced and predicted from that structure. I 
think the domestic dimensions of Kennan’s thinking, which are also 
the historical dimensions of his thinking, don’t get enough attention.

What he’s really saying about Russia, or the Soviet Union, is: con-
tain them and in the end they will destroy themselves because 
domestically they will not be able to succeed either economically or 
socially and, relatedly, they will not preserve their legitimacy with the 
Russian people.

The flip of this is that in designing the Marshall Plan he was not saying 
we will remake the world in America’s image by re-imposing democ-
racy. He’s saying: let us enable these countries to chart their own 
course and then let us empower them to do that. And that’s a really 
different view. It’s the opposite of something like structural realism. 
It is understanding that you must let people find their own way to a 
version of liberal democracy. That could look very different in what 
would then have been West Germany or Italy. Or, as you say, originally 
he was thinking Poland or Hungary; let them make their own plans 
and then we will give them the money or at least the investment to re-
alize those plans. It was an excellent way of framing American foreign 
policy.

Interestingly, I think that’s closer to at least one interpretation of 
Woodrow Wilson than many people assume. John Milton Cooper 
has a whole article and part of a book on how when Wilson said, 
“the world must be made safe for democracy,” what he is saying is 
we need to establish the peace that will allow different nations to 
find their own way. He was not saying, “we will create democracy 
everywhere.” He was saying that nations will find their own way. The 
passive, “must be made safe for,” was very deliberate.

At any rate, Kennan certainly saw the necessity of grounding eco-
nomic and political developments in the cultures and history of dif-
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ferent countries, and I think he also recognized a real role for historic 
individuals.

E: We’ve grounded Kennan here as a Europeanist. We’ve defined 
him as a pessimist and a product of his historical circumstances. But 
do you think that he was also something of a fatalist about certain 
peoples, groups, nations? 

AMS: Yes.

E:  What happens when we compare his sensibility to a globalized 
worldview, which favors the idea that everyone should have access 
to ideas and prosperity and opportunity? Do you think that Kennan 
was overly dismissive of the potential of East Asia, for example, or 
of Russia and Russians? Was part of his worldview archaic in that 
sense? Do you think it was a realistic assessment of the world as it 
was and maybe arguably where we’ve ended up now?

AMS: It’s hard to answer that question without engaging in a certain 
amount of amateur psychoanalysis which probably isn’t fair to him.

I think of him as somebody who went to Princeton myself and who 
understands the ways in which people of a particular social class can 
create very strong structures of being insiders and outsiders. And 
Kennan reflects this sense of being an outsider—we know this from 
John Lewis Gaddis’s biography and some of his own writings.

He was the Midwesterner at Princeton who never quite fit, not in his 
own perception. He was a loner in many ways and I often wonder 
to what extent that shaped his view of different groups. In a world 
in which there’s an in-group and an out-group, they’re very carefully 
defined, and you really are pretty locked in.

That is far less true of Princeton today, I think, but it was true when I 
was at Princeton and that was in the 1980s; I can only imagine how 
it was for him. You can read about that. I wonder how that might 
have shaped his sense of social and cultural fixity as opposed to 
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a more modern sensibility where we’re keenly aware of race and 
ethnicity and the ways in which discrimination and conscious and 
unconscious bias lock people in.

We’re also aware that that can be transcended and we’re in a world 
in which you can travel to China or Russia or Indonesia or Kenya and 
befriend people and stay in touch with them and see their children 
and the way they feel about their families in ways that are enduring 
and universal.

I do think Kennan had a set of attitudes about the fixity of groups and 
cultures that I understand from his own background. That’s amateur 
psychoanalysis, but I think many of our attitudes are quite different 
today.

E:  We want to ask about the Arab Spring.

AMS: Yes.

E:  What if Kennan’s insights in a different regional context and a 
different time and from a different sensibility were to have been ap-
plied to the Arab Spring and to the ways the United States engaged 
and failed to engage with it? Can you give us your retrospective 
assessment of how we did? What might have been missing from 
the approach that was taken?

AMS: Here when I think about Kennan it’s both as an intellectual gi-
ant and as someone whose very long life contained multitudes. You 
can apply and invoke different parts of him.

With the Arab Spring, I think that the United States was at a mo-
ment of hope and change. That’s what Barack Obama ran on. And we 
were only too ready to see that as a global moment.

Social media played right into that because you had the Twitter 
Revolution [in Moldova], the Orange Revolution in Ukraine, and the 
Rose Revolution [in Georgia]. When you suddenly see Wael Ghonim 
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organizing 70,000 Egyptians on a Facebook page, you think, yes, this 
is now the Arab version of the ball—it’s not Kennan, it’s Jefferson—
the ball of liberty rolling around the world.

This is subconscious as much as conscious, because it really was 
the mood. I was in the Obama administration for the first two years, 
and I left just as the Arab Spring was beginning. I left right after 
Tunisia; Egypt was happening as I was leaving; Syria began to erupt 
a month later. But we were on the right side of history, we thought. I 
still think so.

In that first flush of that kind of revolutionary moment, people have 
power and they can speak, and they can topple governments and old 
orders and establish new ones. From the vantage point of 2017 or 
2018, of course, everything looks very different.

I still think the Arab Spring is like the French Revolution or even the 
American Revolution because the American Revolution, in many 
ways, needs to be understood together with the Civil War. It took a 
long time to get to something that looks like a real liberal democra-
cy—and we are still not there for many Americans.

In the French Revolution, you have much sharper counter-reactions 
of extremism and absolutism and terror and empire, going through 
the revolutions of 1848. That’s the way we need to understand the 
Arab Spring. We knew—and when I say we, I mean the Obama 
administration, the Bush administration (Condi Rice made a sim-
ilar speech to Obama’s “New Beginning with the Muslim World” 
speech), probably even the Clinton administration—that you cannot 
oppress people forever. Sooner or later, U.S. support for stable but 
deeply autocratic regimes was going to become unstable, and when 
it did, we were going to be on the wrong side.

That was a debate that broke open in the Obama administration very 
clearly in Egypt where Frank Wisner and Hillary Clinton are saying, 
“maybe we should slow this down.” Ben Rhodes and Samantha 
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Power were saying, “we should support the demonstrators against 
Mubarak—we need to be on the right side of this.”

But, it’s very interesting to wonder what Kennan would have thought 
with his knowledge of 1917 and how quickly something that was 
genuinely idealistic turned into something cruel and distorted.

It would also have been interesting to see where he would have 
come down on the ultimate outcome. I believe that ultimately those 
young people will not be denied, that they will demand to join the 
world of countries that respect individual rights and freedoms for 
their citizens and try to achieve self-government, even if they do that 
in very different ways and even if it takes a long time.

E:  A very brief follow up. When Kennan was asked late in his life—
this may have been already after the Cold War altogether—what his 
biggest regret was in policymaking in his time in government, he 
said it was his support for various nationalist insurgents during the 
early Cold War inside the Soviet Union.

AMS: Wow.

E: Right. Well, as you said, he had a long life.

AMS: Yes.

E: In that light, if you think that the circumstances of the network, 
the Web reality we live in now, can you say that it is a fair game? Is 
it part of good foreign policymaking to take into account groups that 
cross the sovereignty boundary of other states whether they’re big 
states like Russia or China or—the medium-sized Middle Eastern 
powers? Is Kennan’s era over in this respect?

AMS: I think this is one of the fundamental questions. When I said 
earlier that I am chastened, I believe that the United States and other 
liberal democracies do need to support their compatriots or their 
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fellow members of global communities striving for the values and 
rights embedded in the UN Charter.

I think we do need to support them, but I am much warier about how. 
We lead people along, and that’s a terrible thing. Kennan saw this in 
Prague and Hungary. That’s what we’ve done in Syria in many ways. 
Who knows what would’ve happened if Barack Obama had not said, 
“It’s time for Assad to go,” if we had instead made clear to the Syrians 
that we were not prepared to help them in their struggle?

If you are a dissident in another country and a country as mighty as 
the United States says, “I support your movement,” then you think 
they’ll help. And I’ve come to believe that is immoral. If we are not 
going to actually provide the help that those groups believe they 
need, we need to very clear about what we mean when we say we 
support them.

To the point about the Web world: I think it’s critical that we engage 
the world in which there are affinities of all kinds, for good or ill, be it 
hate or racism or violent religious ideology or be it women’s empow-
erment and democracy and human rights and lots of good things.

The kind of work that Kennan and many, many, many other Americans 
who have served officially in Russia or in non-governmental organiza-
tions have done with Russians who want a better country is right, but 
the question is not just how we manage expectations—that’s such a 
gray, bureaucratic word or phrase. The question is how our obligation 
to our own people limits the amount of support we really can give to 
other people, and how we can be clear about this.

Again, I think I started out a Wilsonian and I’m creeping towards Jef-
fersonianism in upholding the power of our example more than the 
example of our power, a phrase Obama borrowed from Bill Clinton 
and used in his inaugural address. 
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E:  We’d like to follow up with a question related to Russia. In the 
1990s, Bill Clinton used to pressure his staff, Strobe Talbott and oth-
ers, to come up with a doctrine as pithy as containment.

AMS: Yes, he did.

E:  We can imagine that when you became the director of Policy 
Planning that Russia was one of several important issues but that it 
wasn’t predominant. Of course, we’re speaking about Medvedev’s 
Russia, but could you speak about your own strategic thinking, that 
of your office, Secretary Clinton’s, and the president’s strategic think-
ing about Russia at that time? 

AMS: It’s striking because Russia was not really on the radar beyond 
engagement, which is hard to believe now. But engagement was 
a basic principle of Obama’s foreign policy. In the beginning of the 
1990s, when Clinton was pushing everybody to come up with an 
alternative grand strategy, the equivalent of containment, they came 
up with enlargement, which didn’t exactly capture either the popular 
or bureaucratic imagination.

Enlargement meant enlarging the sphere of liberal democracy, and 
I remember Anthony Lake’s speech on it at Harvard: it landed with 
a thud. And then Obama had engagement, which I have come to 
think of as a statement of philosophy. It was not a statement of 
strategy, but of a core belief that engaging countries is better than 
isolating them. Indeed, with Myanmar and Iran and Cuba, there were 
important diplomatic victories; many of which sadly have now been 
undone.

But engagement certainly applied to Russia. I was at the dinner in 
Switzerland and Geneva where Secretary Clinton presented the 
reset button to Foreign Minister Lavrov. Of course, we had mistrans-
lated reset, but we were determined to reset relations with Rus-
sia. Obviously, with Medvedev there, there was an opportunity to 
engage positively.
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But beyond that Russia was not a force. That’s very important to 
understand because I remember in the 1990s giving talks about the 
world and not even mentioning Russia. I would mention China and 
the BRICS countries like Brazil and India and South Africa, but Russia 
had fallen off the global map, which for Russians was deeply, deeply 
humiliating. That humiliation is still driving Putin and the support for 
Putin today. 

When I think back to what we were all thinking about, was there 
a doctrine? I remember Secretary Clinton gave a speech on a 
multi-partner rather than a multi-polar world. That didn’t exactly cap-
ture public imagination either.

We actually had a debate within Policy Planning about whether it 
was a good idea to try to search for one overarching doctrine—we 
called it “the containment obsession.” Derek Chollet, my deputy 
who had been in the Clinton administration, had written about this 
effort to live up to Kennan, and said that this is a fool’s errand. The 
world’s too complex; let’s forget about trying to look for one encap-
sulated strategy and recognize we’ve got lots of different strategies 
for different places.

I still felt that there was a way to capture overall themes of our 
policy, but I’m not sure we ever got there. It was not so much about 
specific countries, and to the extent it was it was certainly not about 
Russia.

I would say the biggest set of issues on the table in 2009 involved 
engagement with the Muslim world. The biggest foreign policy 
speech that Obama gave in his first year was his call for a new begin-
ning with the Muslim world in June of 2009, which is interesting to 
think about in relation to the Arab Spring.

Then there was the whole effort to follow that up by engaging differ-
ent majority Muslim countries, but of course, without the resources 
of the Marshall Plan.
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I think there was a desire to engage the Muslim world very different-
ly. And Obama himself saw that as a region where he could make 
progress.

And the other focal point for us was China. The Obama administration 
really came in thinking that we were not paying nearly enough atten-
tion to China. China and the Pacific are going to be the most important 
arena in this century, and we need to pivot from the Middle East and 
Europe to the Pacific basin. A tremendous amount of attention was 
paid to the strategic and economic dialogue with China and how we 
were going to engage China.

Russia was not really a focal point which, I think, has been a large 
part of Putin’s desire: once again to make Russia unavoidable in U.S. 
strategy.

E:  We would like to go back in time to a more prosaic question. 
This is about Kennan’s criticism of NATO expansion and his criticism 
of the Iraq War. Could you offer your thoughts on these two issues 
from the vantage point of 2018?

AMS: As for NATO, I was part of a Council on Foreign Relations task 
force on NATO enlargement. I was invited to join by Charlie Kupchan, 
who was the executive director.

As a Russianist—I’d studied Soviet politics and Russian history in 
college—I knew far more about Russia than I did about Central 
and Eastern Europe. My starting point was to be opposed to NATO 
enlargement for all the reasons that Kennan and other Russianists 
said: that this would inflame the Russians, that our relationship with 
them is critically important and we’re building it, and to do this will 
strengthen hardliners in Russia.

You had people like Zbigniew Brzezinski being very open about the 
Russian bear rising again and that we had better get the NATO line 
as close to its border as we possibly can.
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I started that way. I changed my view because Richard Holbrooke 
came and gave a presentation to our study group where he said, 
“Look, you’ve got countries in the Balkans coming apart and govern-
ments that are trying to beat back nationalism, racism, authoritarian-
ism, some of which we are seeing again today. Those governments 
need to have something to offer the people, and it’s going to take a 
long time for EU membership,” which I knew was true.

NATO is the umbrella of the West and if you don’t allow NATO to 
expand, these countries are going to come apart, he argued. We had 
already seen the war in Croatia and then it was in Bosnia.

When he talked about Romania and Hungary, Budapest and greater 
Hungary, that was persuasive to me. I still think that was right be-
cause in the end, if you measure success in terms of the number of 
people whose lives are better as a result of the expansion of NATO 
and then the expansion of the EU, I think that was worth it, even 
though it alienated Russia.

I have a view that says you don’t look at the international system 
only in terms of great power politics, You look at it in terms of peo-
ple, and states are legitimate to the extent that they represent and 
serve their people, which is why the Chinese government—just as 
an aside—is not fully legitimate. But it’s a lot more legitimate than 
many governments in the world. It has lifted its people out of pover-
ty, just as an aside.

So, I still feel that expanding NATO was the right thing to do, but not 
as a geopolitical strategy so much as a way of stabilizing Central and 
Eastern Europe; and I think that was worth it.

As for the war in Iraq, it was an unmitigated disaster. I opposed the 
war in Iraq absent a UN resolution. But had the UN supported the 
war, I would have been for it.

I did believe there were weapons of mass destruction, and I believed 



120

that the Iraqis would greet us as liberators. There were a lot of things 
that I thought were true that were not, and I think the Iraq War is the 
best example of Kennan’s attack on the Vietnam War, on legalism, 
moralism. Even though I don’t actually think that George W. Bush 
was motivated by legalist moralist reasons, I think there was an illu-
sion of our power that has had terrible, terrible consequences.

E:  Kennan concludes “The Long Telegram” with lines that charac-
terize the challenge from Russia—he says Russia, not the Soviet 
Union—as a challenge that is about our internal life. “The thoughtful 
observer of Russian-American relations will find no cause for com-
plaint in the Kremlin’s challenge to American society,” he writes.

Derek Chollet was right about the global landscape, that there are far 
too many and too disparate challenges to have a unified field theory 
for addressing them. And yet the precedent challenge is who we 
are. What’s our outlook and how is that relevant for facing these chal-
lenges in the world? It seems to me Russia is where this comes to a 
head today because it seeks so explicitly to exploit the vulnerabilities 
of American identity.

AMS: Yes. I agree. I have been thinking a great deal recently about 
Russia in the 1950s and what we thought of as Russian propaganda 
pointing out U.S. racism and the effort to desegregate the schools 
and massive resistance and the role of women, all of which privileged 
white Americans saw as purely Russian propaganda, you know? We 
were a great country and they were just picking on us.

But from the vantage point of today, you look back at the very same 
pronouncements by Southern politicians and blocks of senators and 
on police using firehoses on civil rights demonstrators and hurling 
epithets at African American children going to all-white schools and 
you think, “well, well, wait a minute.” Russia was no paradise, but as 
they were pointing out, neither were we. I think that we were closer 
to living our values than they were to living theirs, but I don’t think ei-
ther of us succeeded then or is succeeding now. But it is noteworthy 
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that plenty of defectors fled from Russia to the West; I don’t know 
any other than spies who went the other way.

And I think that in my own life this is why I have moved from foreign 
policy to domestic policy, to running an organization called New 
America that is really about American renewal. I deeply believe we 
cannot be the force for good that we hope to be in the world without 
renewing ourselves at home— deeply, radically renewing ourselves 
at home—that our democracy is broken and we are going through a 
period of our history that is testing us the way the Civil War tested 
us. Fortunately, it is not as violent or bloody, but the stakes are com-
parable. Can we make it to a majority minority country, or better, a 
country of multiple pluralities because that’s really what we will be? 
There will be a time when the default of “American” will no longer 
be a white Protestant person. It will be a person of any number of 
colors and any number of faiths. Can we get there and still be the 
country we say we are in terms of our Constitution and the Declara-
tion of Independence, our founding values, our civic creed?

To the extent that Kennan understood that we face rot from within 
as much as conquests or conflict from without, I think he was exact-
ly right. Right now, in many ways America is its own worst enemy, 
and we have to renew ourselves. I believe we can.

I use the term renew very advisedly because it is a question of filling 
those great words and ideals of Abraham Lincoln, of Martin Luther 
King, of Susan B. Anthony, and of the many, many, many Americans 
who have taken that founding creed and said, “Well, what does this 
actually mean and we’re not living up to it and we must live up to it.”

We’re in that moment. I believe we’ll prevail. I believe the country 
will renew itself, but I don’t think it’s a sure thing. I think right now 
we should be devoting more of our energies to making good on our 
values at home than to spreading them around the world. 
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I am a retired diplomat whose 45-year career in the United States 
Foreign Service focused primarily on Russia and Eastern Europe. 

Although I never met George Kennan and am by no means a Kennan 
scholar, I was, like most of the diplomats of my generation, strongly 
influenced by his example and thinking. This is an account of George 
Kennan’s recurring impact on my career representing the United 
States in Russia and other nations of Eastern Europe both before 
and after the end of the Soviet Union.

I joined the Foreign Service in January 1972. I had grown up in Mad-
ison, Wisconsin and gone to Marquette University in Milwaukee. It 
was only natural that I was drawn to Kennan, a fellow Wisconsinite 
from Milwaukee, who made his way to Princeton and then to the 
U.S. Foreign Service. I read George Kennan’s book, Memoirs, 1925–
1950, early in my career. The book was one of the main contributing 
factors in my decision to devote the bulk of my professional career 
to Russia and neighboring countries. 

I remember being impressed and humbled by Kennan’s academic 
achievements and his formidable language skills. I was awed by his 
knowledge of Russia and the Russian people. What struck me the 
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most at that time, however, was Kennan’s ability to transform his 
many ideas into practical policy initiatives and thereby to contribute 
to the formulation of American policy. His work as the director of the 
State Department Policy Planning staff and his role in the creation 
of the Marshall Plan were particularly impressive to young Foreign 

Service officers like myself.

Service officers like Chip Bohlen and Llewelyn Thompson became 
models for me and many of my colleagues who chose the Soviet 
Union and Eastern Europe more generally as our career path and 
who sought to have an impact on the evolution of our policy as the 
Soviet Union imploded and the new nations of the former Soviet 
Union came into being. I should mention that one of Henry Kissing-
er’s main aides at this point was Larry Eagleburger, also a native of 
Milwaukee, a fact not lost on me or the few other Wisconsin natives 
then working in the department. 

Although I never met Kennan, from 2003 to 2004 I served as the 
senior State Department officer at the National War College in the 
deputy commandant position in which Kennan had served in 1946. 
I sat for a year in the office and at the desk which I was told George 
Kennan used and at which he reportedly wrote a good portion of the 
1947 Mr. X article, “Sources of Soviet Conduct,” for Foreign Affairs. I 
thought it more than a little ironic that I took this position immediate-
ly after serving as U.S. Ambassador to Lithuania, during which NATO 
took the decision to admit the Baltic nations to NATO membership, 
a decision Kennan strongly opposed. As you might imagine, I was 
constantly teased at the War College about when I would write my 
own Mr. X article. My friends are still waiting.

Like Kennan, I used that year at the War College to ground myself in 
some of the classics of strategy. Although I had studied American 
and European diplomatic history, I had never engaged in a serious 
examination of how nations develop national security strategy, cer-
tainly not with the rigor with which they teach it at the War College. 
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We studied the great “strategic inflection points” in history, partic-
ularly the demise of the Soviet Union and its impact on seemingly 
every corner of international affairs. We also undertook a deep study 
of realism and idealism in foreign policy, with a focus on the then 
raging Iraq War. But inevitably those discussions drew me back to a 
concerted look at the role of U.S. policy in the post-Soviet space.

I think most of my State Department colleagues during these years 
understood clearly the role of Kennan and his articulation of the policy 
that came to be known as “containment.” We were all his intellectual 
protégés. We also understood how our policy had evolved in ways 
with which Kennan disagreed, in particular building NATO as a defen-
sive military alliance of like-minded nations to resist Soviet aggression 
and prevent war in Europe. I became personally aware for the first 
time of the impact of Soviet domination during a tour of duty in Hun-
gary from 1979 to 1982. Although Janos Kadar’s “goulash commu-
nism” was perhaps the mildest version of a Soviet-controlled commu-
nist regime, I saw every day the deleterious impact of this regime and 
its policies on people’s lives, not just in Hungary, but when I traveled 
to Romania, Czechoslovakia, and East Germany. The severe limitation 
on people’s freedom had a deep effect on my thinking.

I was made keenly aware of the Soviet willingness to use force 
during my first week working on the Soviet desk at the State Depart-
ment in 1983, when the Soviet Air Force shot down KAL 007. Later I 
watched as the Soviet Union walked out of the arms-control negoti-
ations with us that were designed to stop the deployment of inter-
mediate range nuclear missiles in Europe. Subsequently, my position 
on the Soviet desk gave me a unique perspective on the accession 
of Mikhail Gorbachev and the Reagan administration’s early efforts 
to engage with him and end the Cold War. The eventual demise of 
the USSR seemed to open up a new set of strategic opportunities 
with which to engage Russia and the successor states that emerged 
from the Soviet Union.
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With the collapse of the Soviet Union in 1991, the Bush administra-
tion set out on a dual task: to build a secure and prosperous relation-
ship with Russia and build relationships with the newly independent 
nations of the former USSR. Secretary of State James Baker ordered 
the establishment of embassies in each of the new states and then 
traveled to each of them to start building relationships with their new 
political leaders. I was deeply involved in setting up those embas-
sies and staffing them with Foreign Service officers who sought to 
build not only government-to-government ties but people-to-people 
connections. The Clinton administration continued these policies and 
simultaneously embarked on the first round of NATO enlargement in 
Central-East Europe.

Frequently, I found myself re-encountering Kennan and his ideas. I 
would read his interviews and criticism of the Clinton and Bush ad-
ministration policies, particularly on NATO enlargement. I tried to un-
derstand his logic but was also only too aware of the contradictions 
in his approach, which his critics did not hesitate to point out. Too 
often at that time he seemed to almost be on the verge of preferring 
the continuation of the status quo rather than dealing with the new 
opportunities and dangers of the post-Soviet era.

In those days, many of us thought that the time had arrived to right 
the wrongs of the Yalta Agreement of 1945. It would give the nations 
of Central and Eastern Europe the chance to develop new, inde-
pendent, and hopefully democratic societies which would enhance 
the interests of their people and in the process build a new order in 
Europe—a Europe whole, free, and at peace. Membership in NATO 
would also bring greater stability to a part of Europe that had been 
the source of instability and imperial competition for centuries. 

I also understood the realist criticism of this approach—that we 
should take Russia on its own terms, a deeply insecure nuclear 
power whose history drove its leaders to constant efforts to secure 
a strategic buffer and spheres of influence in neighboring countries. 
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But how was this in America’s long-term interest? Did this not 
condemn us to a continuation of the same Russian role we had seen 
during the Soviet period? And how did this square with a rising tide 
of nationalism in East-Central Europe and later in the post-Soviet 
period among the newly independent states of the former Soviet 
Union? Wasn’t working with these new states also an essential com-
ponent of realism as we approached a region that was changing so 
radically and so quickly? Was this not, as Kennan wrote in “The Long 
Telegram,” putting “forward for other nations a much more positive 
and constructive picture of the sort of world we would like to see 
than we have put forward in the past”?94

In 1996, I was appointed deputy chief of mission in Moscow. I 
served with Ambassador Tom Pickering for four months and then 
began a period of ten months as chargé d’affaires before Ambassa-
dor Jim Collins arrived. During this interim period Secretary of State 
Madeline Albright held several meetings with Russian Foreign Minis-
ter Yevgeny Primakov, with a particular focus on finishing the negoti-
ations of the NATO-Russia Founding Act. Time and again, I saw Sec-
retary Albright seemingly bend over backward in these negotiations 
to try and accommodate Russian concerns, which were often based 
on clear misunderstandings of NATO and its defensive mission, and 
to find a place for them within the new security structure the Clinton 
administration was trying to build in post-Soviet Europe.

Alas, Albright’s efforts proved to be of no avail. Russian participation 
in the NATO-Russia Council never realized the hopes that had been 
initially invested in it. The more American officials argued that NATO 
and the EU would help stabilize the historically volatile regions on 
its periphery, the more it seemed that the Russian elite reverted to 
its zero-sum game approach to European security in the post-Soviet 
world. I am well aware of those who argue that this was a foolhardy 
mission, but I honestly do not think the Russians took advantage of 
the new possibilities which were discussed at that time. The Rus-
sian political elite could not bring itself to abandon or even modify 
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its long-held approach of wanting to control institutions and trying 
to dominate neighbors to satisfy its own unquenchable desire for 
security.

During my three years in Moscow, I came to appreciate that one of 
George Kennan’s great gifts to us in the Foreign Service was the inci-
sive brilliance of his analysis of Soviet society and his understanding 
of the Russian people. His analysis was matched by his craftsman-
ship in writing. Despite the limitations placed on Kennan and other 
staff when he worked at the embassy in Moscow, his understanding 
of Russia was a model for all of us who tried to penetrate the histo-
ry, complexity, and contradictions of this huge nation. To paraphrase 
Susan Glasser in her December 23, 2011 Washington Post review of 
John Lewis Gaddis’s biography, George Kennan: An American Life, 
I came to admire George Kennan the Russia hand more than I did 
George Kennan the American strategist. 

I remember being particularly struck by the quote in Gaddis’s book 
from an essay which Kennan wrote for Ambassador Averell Harri-
man on the historical contradictions which characterized the Soviet 
regime and Russians more generally. Glasser re-quotes it: 

Russians were “used to extreme cold and extreme heat, pro-

longed sloth and sudden feats of energy, exaggerated cruelty 

and exaggerated kindness, ostentatious wealth and dismal 

squalor, violent xenophobia and uncontrollable yearning for 

contact with the foreign world, vast power and the most abject 

slavery, simultaneous love and hate for the same objects.”95

Conscious of America’s own paradoxes, I resolved not to forget 
Kennan’s words as I tried to understand this fascinating yet paradox-
ical land. In the same essay, Kennan wrote another truism that has 
stuck with me throughout my career: “The strength of the Kremlin 
lies largely in the fact that it knows how to wait. But the strength of 
the Russian people lies in the fact that they know how to wait lon-
ger.”96 I have often thought of that characterization not just in terms 
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of Russia’s own development but also in the context of the Krem-
lin’s approach to negotiating with us. We are an impatient power in 
international affairs. Strategic patience is not a hallmark of American 
foreign policy.

In late 2013, I retired from the Foreign Service after completing an 
assignment as ambassador to Ukraine. My retirement was short-
lived, as I was soon asked to serve as the United States ambassador 
to Russia. My wife Mariella and I lived in the ambassador’s residence 
at Spaso House from 2014 to 2017. Rarely a day went by when 
something did not come up that reminded us of George Kennan. We 
encountered numerous stories about his impact on both the estab-
lishment of the U.S. Embassy in Moscow and his abiding impact on 
Russian policy. 

I had arrived in Moscow after America’s relations with Russia had 
taken a deep plunge. The bloody confrontation on the Maidan had 
occurred in Kyiv, and President Yanukovych and his closest aides 
had fled to Russia. Russia invaded and annexed Crimea and sent 
“the little green men” into the Donbas, provoking a “hybrid war” 
which has cost thousands of lives. Europe and the United States had 
placed serious sanctions on Russia. In response, Russia placed limits 
on our work and that of our allied embassies in Moscow, particularly 
our access to some Russian officials. The situation did not improve 
substantially as long as I served in Moscow. Indeed, levels of ha-
rassment of the American embassy and our staff increased to levels 
unheard of since the darkest days of the Cold War.

Here again George Kennan entered the picture. Kennan had always 
argued that as we opposed the Soviet government, we had to do 
everything we could to stay in touch with the Russian people. My 
colleagues and I took this to heart and tried very hard to travel as 
frequently and as widely as possible throughout Russia. 

It was not easy, as the government also sought to limit our access 
to official and ordinary Russians in the regions. This was a part of the 
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Russian leadership’s fear of “colored revolutions” spreading in the 
country. The government had already closed our American Corners 
in regional libraries all over Russia before I arrived. Soon after I got 
to Moscow, it shut down our FLEX program, which brought talented 
Russian high school students to the United States for a year of study 
and a homestay with an American family. It forced our American 
cultural center to close in the All-Russia State Library for Foreign 
Literature, which left us no option but to reopen a center on the em-
bassy compound. Finally, it passed laws labeling Russian individuals 
and organizations “foreign agents,” clearly trying to intimidate them 
and limit ties to Western counterparts.

It was difficult to counter these repressive measures, and we tried 
to avoid putting our contacts in positions where they got in trouble 
with the authorities. In addition to travel and personal contacts, we 
also sought to employ social media to reach younger Russians by 
widely distributing articles and information about the United States. 
We gave interviews and press conferences on Russian language 
websites which reached all over the country. We employed a tried-
and-true embassy approach of holding concerts at Spaso House, 
promoting American culture and U.S.-Russian cultural ties. Again, 
we used social media, building our capability to reach out to internet 
users all over Russia by streaming concerts live.

Today our relationship with Russia is even more complicated as we 
try to find a way to deal with our differences over Ukraine, Syria, 
Iran, the use of chemical weapons and agents, and, perhaps most 
importantly, Russian cyberattacks on our democratic institutions. I 
often wonder what Kennan would think of the array of issues that 
divide us today. Would he see Russian behavior today, with all the 
new information and military technologies and the techniques of hy-
brid warfare, as a further set of threats to be contained? If so, how? 
More sanctions, more robust military containment? More aggressive 
counter-cyber policies?
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And beyond Kremlin policy, how would Kennan see Russian society? 
In many ways, Russia is still searching for its identity in the post-So-
viet world. How would Kennan view resurgent Russian national-
ism under Putin and the lack of Russian understanding of national 
sentiments among the nations of the former Soviet Union? What 
would he think of the new generation of young Russians who have 
no personal memory of the Soviet Union and communism? And 
how would he react to the continuing war in Ukraine and Russia’s 
isolation from the West? What kind of future would Kennan see for 
Russia’s post-imperial relations with many of its immediate neigh-
bors who now view Moscow with great suspicion if not downright 
hostility? 

Analyzing these and many other questions is the task before a new 
generation of Foreign Service officers who attempt to understand 
and work in Russia and the nations of Eurasia. In attempting to an-
swer them, they could do well to take time to study the greatest an-
alyst of Russia our Foreign Service ever produced, George Kennan.
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Editors:  We wanted to start with some questions about your time 
as Policy Planning director. Perhaps we could begin with the agenda 
that you brought to the job. 

Jake Sullivan:	 I was the director of Policy Planning from February 
of 2011—following the departure of Anne-Marie Slaughter, who 
was my immediate predecessor (she returned to Princeton)—until 
February of 2013, when I left the job a couple of weeks into Secre-
tary Kerry’s tenure as secretary of state. I stayed on past the end of 
Secretary Clinton’s time just to provide a transitional phase and to 
support Secretary Kerry as he got up and running. 

In terms of the main issue areas where I tried to drive the priority 
agenda of the policy planning staff, I would identify three. The first 
was what we called economic statecraft, which essentially was both 
sides of the coin of how economics and national security interact. 
So on the one hand, how to use economic tools to advance national 
security objectives; and then, on the other hand, how to use national 
security tools to advance America’s domestic economic objectives. 

I had a number of members of my staff working on different angles 
of that broad agenda, trying to figure out (a), how the State Depart-
ment itself could bring economics more to the center of its activities; 
and (b), how the U.S. government as a whole could be better orga-
nized to practice effective economic statecraft—especially at a time 
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when power is increasingly measured and exercised in economic 
terms and many of our main adversaries are much further along in 
integrating the economic dimensions into their grand strategy. That 
was one. 

The second was how to give content to and more granular concep-
tual shape to the Asia-Pacific “pivot” or “rebalance.” So I worked 
closely with members of my team and Kurt Campbell, who was 
the assistant secretary for East Asia, on a seminal article Secretary 
Clinton wrote in 2011 called “America’s Pacific Century.” And then 
that led to a number of more tailored initiatives, including the work 
that Policy Planning did to support the opening to Burma/Myanmar 
and related projects. 

The third was more of an inbox issue. It was how to think about the 
potential risks and opportunities of the Arab revolutions, which were 
unfolding right at the moment that I took the job on. And what was 
interesting about the time horizon on that particular set of activities 
was the U.S. government was operating day-to-day, hour-to-hour. 
And so for policy planning, mid-range to long range-planning became 
a week out, a month out, a year out rather than 5–10–25 years, as 
we were just trying to stay one step ahead and think through, you 
know, what all this meant, where it was all headed, and how the 
United States should respond. 

Those were some of the main areas where I tried to bring a new 
thrust or perspective to the overall agenda of the policy planning 
staff.

E:  If you were to step back and think about what that office had 
been, what it was meant to be, what it could be, how did you feel 
the mission fit the substance of what you set out to do? What is 
your sense of the ways in which Kennan shaped the office and its 
mission? 

JS:  Well, the threshold question for any Policy Planning director is 
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how do you implement the very simple directive that Secretary Mar-
shall gave to George Kennan, which was to avoid trivia.

That is, in many ways, a piercing charge to be given. In other ways, 
it’s a confounding charge because of course it leaves a huge space 
open for discretion to figure out: okay, in trying to look at the bigger 
picture, in lifting your head up above the smoke, as Marshall put 
it, and trying to see out to the horizon how do you (a) choose the 
issues and the relevant timeframes and (b) how do you then connect 
any of the work you’re doing to decisions that policymakers are actu-
ally taking in the here and now—decisions around budget, decisions 
around priority, decisions around strategic choices in a particular 
region or a particular functional issue? 

I think I, like every Policy Planning director from Kennan on forward, 
was faced with the really considerable challenge of how to actually 
think about making this office effective, both in helping the policy-
making and decision-making apparatus look out beyond the immedi-
ate inbox, but also in doing so in a way that wasn’t just interesting or 
academic but could be actionable in a meaningful way. 

For me, I probably put more emphasis on having Policy Planning be 
a connecting node between the secretary of state and her priorities 
and the bureaus and embassies of the United States Department of 
State spread across the world. And I mean a connecting node travel-
ing in both directions. So how to translate to the secretary what we 
were learning and hearing from the bureaus and the embassies in 
terms of their assessment of what was going on, what opportunities 
there were, what risk factors there were. And then I tried to com-
municate from the secretary down what her priorities were and how 
she hoped they would be implemented. 

One of the things that really struck me when I took the job was that 
unlike the Pentagon—where there’s something called Secretary’s 
Policy Guidance where the secretary of defense is constantly firing 
off missives to the broader DOD bureaucracy saying, “Here’s a 
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decision. I want it implemented. Here’s a priority. I want it elevat-
ed. Here’s a theme. I want it filled out and executed on in practical 
ways”—the State Department didn’t do that at all. 

One of the things I tried to bring to the job was to create a process 
for Secretary’s Policy Guidance at the State Department. Hillary 
Clinton cared deeply about women and girls and wanted gender to 
be integrated into diplomacy. What did that actually mean? And how 
could an ambassador understand what he or she should be doing 
with that? Same with energy diplomacy. Same with, as I mentioned 
before, the Asia-Pacific rebalance, etc.

I think that is because of the way that the Department has grown 
and decision-making has changed from the Marshall-Kennan days, 
where it really was concentrated in a few people with a much more 
linear reporting relationship and much easier communication up and 
down the line.

Now, it’s become so far-flung, so atomized in terms of the way that 
decisions are processed and then put out for implementation, that 
the job of Policy Planning director increasingly, in my view, has to 
be to serve in a substance role, first and foremost, but also a pretty 
important process role.

To the extent that was true for Kennan, I think it really frustrated him. 
He didn’t like having to manage his way through the process. And I 
understand why, having done it myself for a couple of years. But it’s 
so vital because if you don’t have an effective process for translating 
priorities into policy, then the tenure of the secretary, the person to 
whom you report, is going to be significantly less effective.

The other big thing that I will say about the job is that in Kennan’s 
time, the Policy Planning staff was the hub for the entire United 
States government when it came to foreign affairs strategic plan-
ning—period. In my time, the Policy Planning staff was one of sever-
al policy planning staffs spread across the government, including one 
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headquartered at the National Security Council. 

The State Department itself was just one of more than a dozen cab-
inet agencies that saw itself as deeply involved in the advancement 
of America’s foreign affairs mission. The Agriculture Department, 
the Department of Homeland Security, the Justice Department, the 
Energy Department, and on down the line, the Treasury Department, 
all had substantial elements of their bureaucracy devoted to foreign 
affairs and foreign policy.

Policy Planning at State suggested a division in responsibility and 
authority. But it also created a much more significant need for some-
one in that role to figure out: how do you try to bring some order to 
the long-term strategic outlook and planning across this very crowd-
ed space?

That was another aspect of the job that both bedeviled and ener-
gized me, and I put a lot of time into thinking about how could I help 
contribute to the entire American ship of state getting pointed in a 
direction toward the destination. Again, that meant the importance 
of process in addition to substantive strategic thinking. What are the 
priorities? What are the actual substantive answers? 

E:  Over time, the U.S. government became larger and more compli-
cated, and that mandates a different role for policy planning. But the 
challenges have also shifted from the time George Marshall planned 
for the Second World War and Kennan planned for the Cold War. Did 
the end of the Cold War make the job of policy planning more diffi-
cult? Was it more difficult to establish clear priorities?

JS:  At one point I wrote a memo for both the secretary and ulti-
mately for the president while I was director of Policy Planning on 
the future of the Middle East. In that memo, I started by noting, a 
bit wryly, that Kennan had it easy because as Policy Planning direc-
tor, and previously when he wrote “The Long Telegram,” he started 
from a very simple premise. Which was: I can tell you how this story 
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ends. This story ends with the contradictions of the Soviet Union be-
coming increasingly exposed to its own people, and eventually those 
contradictions are going to doom the Soviet system. 

And so that is the foundation for containment, his saying, “that’s 
where this is all headed—now we need a strategy that gets us 
from here to there.” That protects America’s interests and pushes 
back against Soviet expansionism but in a sense helps create the 
conditions for that result to unfold. He couldn’t say the timing or 
anything else, but he could say, “here’s where we’re going to end up 
and therefore here’s the prescription for how to get us from here to 
there.” 

When it came to the Middle East, we couldn’t say, “okay here’s 
where it’s going to end up. So now let’s talk about getting from here 
to there.” There was immense dispute and debate about where it 
was going to end up.

That’s just one of many examples—to answer your question about 
the end of the Cold War—of how a conceptually simpler (still incred-
ibly difficult but conceptually simpler) landscape for foreign policy 
and grand strategic decision-making lent itself to cleaner, sharper, 
more sustainable and durable strategies like containment. They were 
cleaner, sharper, and more sustainable compared to the messy, 
contingent, uncertain, and also incredibly varied landscape of the 
post-Cold War era, where not only did you have the continuation of 
geopolitical competition, but you had the rising strategic threat of 
terrorism and you had a series of transnational issues that required 
overcoming complex collective action problems and the mix of com-
petition and cooperation and your adversary sometimes also being 
your partner. 

This was the landscape we were dealing with in the post-Cold War 
era. I know that every Policy Planning director likes to say that his 
or her period was the most difficult, the most challenging, the most 
vexing period that there ever was. But in the case of the recent Poli-
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cy Planning directors, I’m going to say, I’m going to go out on a limb 
and say it was actually true. We had it harder. I’m sort of joking about 
that but only sort of joking. 

E:  For the post-Cold War United States, we think you accurately de-
scribe a problem set that is both diverse and in flux. Given the array 
of vital interests the United States has had in this period, does the 
Marshall injunction to avoid trivia have meaning any longer? Is there 
a way to operationalize it or is policy planning yet another inbox-driv-
en government entity where you’re drinking from a firehose all the 
time? 

JS:  It has a tendency towards that, and I certainly fell prey to that, par-
ticularly being dual-hatted in the secretary’s personal office and running 
the Policy Planning staff. I spent a fair amount of time on the road trav-
eling with her, where I would get trapped by the tyranny of the inbox, 
with my team and my staff interested in helping solve those immediate 
problems as well. 

There was a bureaucratic physics tending in that direction. But I 
would argue that the necessity of heeding Marshall’s plea to the 
best extent possible, to avoid trivia, has only gone up as the speed 
and complexity and interconnectedness of these challenges has ac-
celerated. Why? Because it’s much harder now to figure out: what is 
the main thing? What are the priorities that the United States really 
should be investing in rather than going and chasing every rabbit, 
running out there across every continent on every issue under the 
sun? 

It was easier in an earlier time, in a bipolar world, in a Cold War 
world, to know what the main thing was. And then you had to work 
through: what does that mean for the actual development and imple-
mentation of policy? But you had a sense of the big picture.

Now it’s different. What is the ultimate thrust of America’s foreign 
policy today? What are we trying to accomplish and why? Before you 
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even get to the “how.” If you’re not wrestling with that question in 
a systematic way, then you’re ultimately letting down the secretary 
and the president because you will get carried along by events. 

And I can’t give myself an A grade on being able to do that as Policy 
Planning director. I don’t know any Policy Planning director in recent 
memory who would because it’s so hard. We are all struggling with 
long-term thinking. But we need to get better at it. We really do. 

E:  We’re also consuming a lot more news and information from 
more sources than we would have been 50 to 60 years ago.

JS:  The advent of email has been disruptive to sound, sober, du-
rable, strategic decision-making because it creates a rhythm and a 
tempo and a mode, an operating style, that is much more tactical 
and reactive and doesn’t leave time for people to step back and 
ask big, hard, conceptual questions that allow one to hang a frame 
around America’s foreign policy choices. 

E:  There may be other significant powers in the world which none-
theless have a narrower aperture for foreign policy planning. We 
would suggest that Russia is one of them. Do you think that’s true? 
Does Moscow, for example, have an easier job of setting foreign 
policy strategy?

JS:  Let me say two things about that. The first is that Russia, China, 
other actors who operate in one way or another as revisionist ac-
tors—they have one massive advantage over the United States and 
that is: they are not the United States. They are relying upon the U.S. 
as the burden-bearer of last resort, as the main security broker in key 
regions. And they’re playing off against that. 

And playing off against that kind of actor is just an easier game to 
play because you don’t have to face any of the contradictions or 
tensions nearly as squarely. 

So just as an example, the Russians can be friends with the Iranians 
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and the Saudis, the Kurds, the Turks, and the Iraqis. They can bring the 
Sunni opposition groups and also sit down and talk to Hezbollah. And 
why is that? It’s because they’re not—no one’s ultimately counting on 
them to produce outcomes as a broker, you know. They’re a backer of 
Assad and so forth and the Saudis want to pull them away. But fun-
damentally, it is the presence of the United States that allows Russia 
to play that kind of role. If the U.S. disappeared tomorrow and Russia 
were thrust into a similar role, Moscow’s job of policy planning and 
strategy would get a heck of a lot harder because they would have to 
deal with the contradictions and tensions that we’re forced to strug-
gle with on a regular basis. So that’s one thing that’s quite different. 

Secondly, the United States has gotten less effective at strategy over 
the decades because we have been so rich and so powerful that 
effective strategy was not vital to us in achieving what we needed 
to achieve. Weaker states cannot simply throw resources and large 
numbers of friends and allies at the problem; they have to invest 
more in effective strategies to be able to get what we want. 

And just to give you an example of this: a rich person who needs 
to get a loaf of bread doesn’t have to be particularly strategic, does 
not have to be a strategic genius to get a loaf of bread. They go to 
their wallet, they take out money, and they go buy the bread. A poor 
person who has no money has to develop a strategy go to get that 
bread. Has to come up with, by hook or by crook, some way of get-
ting their hand on that bread.

And that analogy to me says a lot about why I think there has been 
some atrophy in the strategic muscle memory of the United States, 
because our way of thinking about strategy is ends-ways-means. You 
know, we have the ways and the means. So we define the ends and 
then just put the ways and the means to work to get to those ends. 
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We are now entering a much more competitive phase where to 
maintain a competitive edge strategy is going to matter a whole lot 
more to the United States. I think we’re going to have to get better 
at it as a strategic community. That’s the second thing. And that says 
Russia relies more on strategy to get what it needs because of its 
relatively weaker position. The United States has not had to rely on it 
as much. 

Even so, I view Russia in particular as having more of a tactical 
opportunistic approach to its strategy than some kind of coherent, 
comprehensive game plan that it is going out and executing on a 
daily basis. I think Putin gets more credit for being a strategic genius 
than he deserves. I think he has nerve and gumption and is willing 
to move fast and seize opportunities when they present themselves, 
but I think there’s a lot more improvisation in what the Russians are 
up to than the conventional wisdom would suggest. 

E:  You’ve already recited from “The Long Telegram.” Kennan’s ap-
proach was to ask questions about, as he put it, “the sources of So-
viet conduct” or the nature of the regime. These were questions that 
he answered through political analysis but also through reflections 
on history and literature. Was that approach was still active in your 
time as Policy Planning director? Or was it better to take another ap-
proach? This is a Russia question, but there might be other countries 
that come into play in this regard. 

JS:	 There were two big priority areas for my time as director: 
where the Middle East was headed and this whole issue of econom-
ic statecraft. Digging into the academic literature and the history and 
talking to a lot of people who have looked at these questions not as 
policymakers but as historians or as theoreticians or as anthropolo-
gists—that was an important part of what we did. And my staff really 
dug in methodologically to the social sciences, to the history, to the 
theory, and then tried to generate papers that would be informed by 
all of that but not weighed down by it to the point where they be-
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came irrelevant to ultimate decision-makers. But that was an import-
ant factor. 

The other thing is we tried to integrate intelligence analysis as well 
into what we did. We tried to really use the tools especially that the 
State Department uniquely had through the INR Bureau—the Intelli-
gence, Analysis, and Research Bureau—to think about: okay, how do 
you actually take all of the intelligence products of the United States 
intelligence community which are amassed and not just have them 
inform the decision of the next deputy’s committee meeting but 
have them paint a picture for you of what you’re up against and really 
try to think about how to make the best use out of the NIC [National 
Intelligence Council], the DNI [Director of National Intelligence], the 
agency [the CIA], and especially the State Department’s own intelli-
gence arm. 

So methodologically that’s how we approached things. And I have 
to say, on some issues it made us more effective, and on others it 
made us less effective, to be bringing a quasi-academic approach to 
some of the work that we did. I feel that on economic statecraft we 
produced a series of papers and secretary speeches that I actually 
think stand up really well if you go back and look at them in terms of 
what they suggested the United States should be doing. But they 
don’t stand up as well in terms of actually producing a change in 
U.S. policy or the orientation of our various foreign policy interests in 
economics questions. And that’s because they just were a little too 
abstract. 

And that, you know, became one of the major balancing acts of 
being director of Policy Planning was how do you make sure that 
what you’re doing is not just the same thing everyone else is doing 
in government in terms of the policymaking process—that it has 
a deeper, a more contextual flavor to it. But on the other hand, to 
make it relevant and concrete enough that it could actually be used 
to shape decision-making.
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Looking back at Kennan’s thought process reveals a huge challenge: 
how to stay true to what it was that made him so good while at the 
same time make sure that the Policy Planning staff’s products were 
actually really useful and guided policy. That was one of the things 
that frustrated him as he came to the end of his tenure. 

E:  You mention Kennan’s frustrations, and we think from his vantage 
point he lost a lot of bureaucratic and policy battles. Even if some of 
his ideas that were adopted were not adopted in ways that he would 
have approved; containment is one example.

JS:  Right. 

E:  We’re curious about any sort of proposals that you made that 
went to the side of policy or that weren’t enacted in the way you 
wanted them to be. 

JS:  First of all, nothing on the order of containment. I can tell you 
that. Nothing of the sweeping magnitude of the debates and fights 
that they were having. But I would say that we really gamely tried to 
make the case for some pretty meaningful shifts in the way that the 
United States practiced economic statecraft. 

And some examples included creating a development finance 
institution, which the United States does not have but most of our 
major partners and competitors do—the Germans, the British, the 
Chinese, etc. Like thinking about the use of American economic 
leverage beyond financial sanctions and how to have a more system-
atic approach to that. Like thinking about how to integrate domestic 
economic policy priorities and questions with the way we thought 
about foreign economic policy priorities and questions. And those 
tended to be two very distinct conversations. 

There were a number of different proposals being made in this re-
gard that encountered a considerable amount of resistance from the 
economic agencies in the U.S. government, from some quarters in 
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the White House as well, but more often it wasn’t so much that they 
encountered resistance as they encountered the problem that this 
was not the here and now. This was not the issue du jour, or it didn’t 
present an inbox question. 

That was frustrating to me because I think the U.S. continues to 
really lag in terms of being able to compete effectively on a global 
battlefield—not battlefield—on a global field of economic leverage. 
And the Chinese are leaps and bounds ahead of us on this. Now, 
they have certain advantages we don’t have, but we have advantag-
es, too. And that is a big area. 

There are other things I’m proud of. We—the Policy Planning staff—
worked very closely with Ben Rhodes at the White House and others 
on a set of papers around an opening to Cuba. If you go back and 
look at these papers from years before the opening to Cuba ever 
happened, they really laid out the roadmap to where we ultimately 
got.

In my time as head of Policy Planning, we did yeoman’s work on Iran 
nuclear issues. And while the pivot and rebalance has not ended up 
in the way I would have hoped it would, it certainly got off to a really 
good start. And Policy Planning deserves a bit of credit for that. 

So there are things I’m proud of, but also things that we really 
worked hard on that didn’t really get us very far. And of course I think 
that’s too bad, but that’s just in the nature of the job. 

E:  We think you pithily captured the problem and solution proposed 
in “The Long Telegram”: wait for the internal contradictions of the 
Soviet system to bring it down and in the meantime contain the bad 
stuff the Soviet Union might do. If you were to advise on the content 
of a “Long Telegram” for today on Russia, what do you think the key 
elements of that would be?

JS:  That is a great question and I’m going to give you a pass-
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ing-grade answer but probably not something that’s going to get 
honors. That’s spoken as someone who’s in the middle of grading 
final exams right now. 

So number one, I think going back to what I was saying before about 
how Kennan got to his assessment of where the Soviet Union was 
headed and what the United States needed to do about it. He began 
really with the question of what to make of this country and what its 
mindset is and where it was headed. And I think we have to start in 
the same place with modern day Russia. 

And for me, Vladimir Putin, who has consolidated and concentrated 
power in his own person, needs to be understood as having an over-
riding interest in preserving and extending his own power, first and 
foremost; secondly, in restoring the role and relevance of Russia on 
the global stage; and third, in ensuring, as a defensive proposition—
which ends up having very offensive elements to it—that Russia is 
secure in its near abroad and has dominion in one way or another 
over the former Soviet space. 

Starting from that perspective, that that’s what’s driving Putin and 
therefore what’s driving his decision-making. One should understand 
his effort to divide and weaken NATO and the European Union, his 
effort to discredit democracy as an effective form of government, 
his effort to split the Transatlantic Alliance, all in the context of those 
goals—being able to say to his people: see, what we’re doing here 
makes more sense than that totally messy democracy that’s not 
working. That allows him to extend that defensive perimeter because 
he’s weakening the effectiveness of European and American push-
back, etc. 

I think that our basic goal with Russia has to be that (a) we make it 
clear to Putin that we actually mean what we say with the Article 
Five guarantee, that we put skin in the game as we did in the latter 
years of the Obama administration by actually having boots on the 
ground in the Baltics and Poland and other places. And (b) that we 
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figure out a more effective and sustainable way to raise the cost to 
him for his continued disruption of democratic systems and efforts 
to weaken and divide the West.

But (c) that we offer him a path to some form of uneasy coexistence. 
There’s never going to be the friendship one might have hoped for 
in the 1990s and 2000s but the relationship can be more durable, 
sustainable, and certainly de-escalated from where it is right now. 

We should try to do this through an integrated, strategic conversa-
tion at the highest level. I think it’s very hard with Donald Trump, who 
just doesn’t think in these terms. But if you had a different president, 
who sat with his senior security team and Vladimir Putin with his, 
I do think that you could work out a modus vivendi between the 
United States, our European partners, and Russia that would be 
more durable, and would involve, to a certain extent, making it clear 
to Putin that while we will never back off of our values and we will 
always stand up and speak out on human rights, we’re not in the 
business of trying to bring him down. Because I think that is one of 
the aspects of this that has become so destabilizing. 

That’s a 30,000-foot way of thinking about this, but fundamentally 
I think we have to say to Putin: we’re not going to accept a notion 
of just a flat-out sphere of influence, but we’re also going to try to 
understand your defensive interests in your own near abroad. That 
we say to him: we are not going to stand silent in the face of abuses 
of human rights, but we’re also not in the regime-change business in 
Russia. That’s for you and the people of Russia to work through. 

And to say: here’s what’s going to happen to you if you continue 
down the path that you’re on. These are the kinds of steps that we 
are going to be prepared to take in a predictable and consistent way 
that are going to impose very real costs on Putin and Russia if they 
keep going in this direction. 

That would be how I would think about managing that relationship. 
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And you know, I’ll just finish with an anecdote. Bill Burns and I were 
meeting with Sergei Ryabkov, the deputy foreign minister, in the 
context of the Iran negotiation, and we had to convince him that 
Russia should join us in the approach to the Iranians on a particular 
issue related to inspections and verification. And we convinced him, 
you know, we got him on board. 

And then as we were leaving the room, we also had to say, by the 
way, today we just imposed sanctions on Ukraine. Thank you very 
much for your help on Iran. 

And that anecdote goes to show you that there are issues on which 
we are going to have to continue to work with the Russians, includ-
ing not just bilateral issues in our relationship like strategic stability 
but external issues like Iran and its nuclear program, even as we 
engage in this more competitive and adversarial dynamic that I’ve 
just described. 

We have to be mature and sober about how we effectively man-
age the elements of cooperation and the elements of competition 
and pushback and not at any point turn our backs on the kind of 
core proposition of who we are, what values we stand for, who our 
friends are, and how we’re going to stand up for them. 
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George F. Kennan left a vast intellectual and political legacy. 
It would not be an exaggeration to say that we still feel his 

influence on international relations every time policy options vis-à-vis 
a growing U.S.-Russia rivalry are discussed. Kennan’s intellectual im-
pact is no less important, but in many cases scholars and politicians 
still underestimate its significance. Paradoxically, some of his accom-
plishments could be better seen if we separate the highpoint of his 
political influence from the highpoint of his academic achievements. 
In addition, a number of his most striking discoveries pertained not 
to understanding Russia but to American foreign policy. 

Regarding Kennan’s impact on U.S.- Russian relations, historians 

tend to focus on containment (in his “Long Telegram” from 1946 

and subsequent “Sources of Soviet Conduct” from 1947); on 

his later criticism of the arms race and “second Cold War;” and, 

institutionally, on his creation of the Policy Planning division at the 

State Department. Certainly, the United States and the West are 

looking for a new containment strategy toward Putin’s Russia, a 

catchy one-word phrase signaling the creativity of a new generation 

of policy planners. Amid an almost universal cry of a “new Cold 

War,” criticism of a “second Cold War” is surely in order now. The 

analytical capacity of State Department policymakers is not reas-

GEORGE FROST KENNAN 
AND RUSSIAN-AMERICAN 
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suring. Neither is the diminutive influence Russia experts have with 

present-day political leaders. 

The complicated legacy of Kennan sheds new light upon pre-existing 
and current problems in bilateral relations and on foreign-policy deci-
sion-making in general. It is a good time to be re-reading him.

This chapter will challenge the presumption that Kennan’s expertise 
in Russian affairs put him in a position of influence. At the start of 
his career, Kennan’s understanding of Russia was comparatively 
limited and was still flawed in his State Department heyday. He had 
developed a much better knowledge of the USSR by the time a new 
generation of American diplomats was habitually rejecting his advice. 
Indeed, it was Kennan’s very understanding of the Soviet Union that 
made him critical of the later stages of U.S. policy toward that coun-
try, preventing him from maintaining a government position. Ken-
nan’s success in the late 1940s derived not from his knowledge of 
Russia but from policy recommendations that hit at the exact center 
of a policy vacuum in Washington.

Secondly, this chapter will address Kennan’s “system that essen-
tially is not a system,” as Jonathan Knight has put it. It will examine 
Kennan’s particular concept of foreign policy in relation to domestic 
political affairs. In Knight’s words, paraphrasing Kennan: “foreign policy 
cannot be understood apart from domestic forces which prescribe the 
goals of that policy or apart from international forces which hinder the 
achievement of those goals.”97 By equating “domestic forces” with 
“national interests,” Knight places Kennan in the tradition of political 
realism, while “domestic forces” in Kennan’s understanding are dis-
tinct from the realist reading of foreign-policy decision-making. There 
is thus a need to reconsider the relationship between foreign policy 
and domestic affairs in our understanding of Kennan’s thinking.

By the time Kennan arrived in the USSR in 1933 he was probably the 
best-educated authority on Russia among the younger generation of 
American diplomats, an honorific that speaks as much to his capa-
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cious knowledge as to the extremely low level of the Russia-related 
expertise in the State Department at this time. An anecdote that 
Kennan was proud of helps to tell this story. In 1936, Kennan, then 
a secretary of the U.S. Embassy in the Soviet Union, discovered 
dispatches in the embassy’s archives that Neill Brown, an American 
minister to the Russian Empire in 1850–53, had sent to Washington 
decades before. Brown described life in Russia as repugnant and 
Russians themselves as distrustful. He insisted that “secrecy and 
misery characterize everything” and that “all they [Russians] have 
is borrowed. Except their miserable climate.” Brown informed his 
superiors that the Russian government “possesses in an exquisite 
degree the art of worrying a foreign representative without giving 
him even the consolation of an insult.” Kennan used those texts to 
compile a new report and made Ambassador William C. Bullitt sign it 
with some minor changes. He replaced “Russian Empire” with the 
“Soviet Union” and “Czar Nicholas” with “Stalin.” The young diplo-
mat insisted that in other regards the dispatches of 1850s described 
precisely the USSR of 1936. 

Later in his life, Kennan often returned to his discovery. He quoted 
Brown’s dispatches in a lecture at the Foreign Service School in 1938 
and again at the Canadian Defense College in 1948. He read them 
aloud into the Great Seal in the ambassador’s office when in 1952 
counterintelligence found that it had been bugged with a Sovi-
et-made listening device and Kennan was asked to check whether it 
reacted to the ambassador’s voice.98 

This anecdote is intriguing, but it raises real questions about the 
differences between Nicholas I’s Russia and Stalin’s Soviet Union. 

Brown was a former governor of Tennessee with little formal ed-
ucation, no prior diplomatic experience, no knowledge of Russian 
or French. In fact, he commanded no language other than English. 
Was he so brilliant as to find and describe Russia’s core features 
and those destined to survive several czars and a revolution? Edu-



154

ard Stoeckl, the Russian diplomat who served in Washington at the 
same time Brown was in St. Petersburg, described his American 
counterpart as “a person of moderate principles and talents.”99 Brown 
arrived in Russia without his family. His modest salary did not permit 
him to attend aristocratic balls or to invite guests, and as a conse-
quence, he felt lonely and frustrated. Without an international agenda 
he could work with, he devoted his reports to sarcastic commentaries 
on the Russian state and the Russian way of life.100 Brown’s dis-
patches were in fact a series of negative clichés about Russia. Other 
American diplomats such as Charles S. Todd (1841–46) and Thomas 
Seymour (1853–58) offered very different views in their reports. They 
praised Russian university education, described railroad construction, 
and cheered technology transfers from America to Russia. 

Kennan, however, happened to find only Brown’s texts relevant. This 
story proves the suspicion that the George Kennan of the 1930s was 
more eager to identify funny yet superficial resemblances between 
different epochs than to search for the distinctive features of the 
society he lived in as an expert specialist on Russia, as he was often 
called in retrospect.101 Such a view on Russia was determined not by 
empirical analysis or deep knowledge of history and politics. Instead, 
Brown and Kennan (in his borrowing from Brown) relied on their 
perception of the country as a negation of everything Americans val-
ued. Kennan’s elder contemporary, Walter Lippmann, had introduced 
the term “stereotypes” into analysis of foreign relations, and even 
Kennan, with the attention he tried to pay to Russian history and 
literature, could fall victim to stereotyping the country around him, as 
he did during his first tenure in the Soviet capital. 

By February 1946, Kennan had obtained a clearer image of the So-
viet Union. He had realized the limitations of his own understanding 
and especially that of the State Department. He pointedly started 
“The Long Telegram” by warning against a “dangerous degree of 
over-simplification.” The goal and the form of the cable were intended 
to alert Washington to a growing misunderstanding: Soviet leaders 
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use different language, employ different causation, and react different-
ly to international challenges. In this text, Kennan had something of 
value to offer the U.S. government: a blueprint of Soviet views intu-
ited by the American diplomat not through clichés but though Soviet 
political patterns. 

The cable included several sharp observations of Soviet views and 
practices as well as some unsubstantiated findings and doubtful 
generalizations. (Kennan and most of his contemporary Americans 
used the words “Russian” and “Soviet” as synonyms.) For example, 
Kennan concluded his passage on a Soviet “feeling of insecurity” 
with the following highly critical words: the Russians “have learned 
to seek security only in patient but deadly struggle for total destruc-
tion of rival power, never in compacts and compromises with it.” 
This was not a well-founded statement, since Russian czars had 
participated in European diplomacy since Peter the Great, making 
numerous compacts and compromises with their neighbors. Cu-
riously enough, a generation later the revisionist historian of U.S. 
foreign policy Walter LaFeber would remind fellow Americans that 
similar suspicion had followed their own country since its interna-
tional debut in the 18th century. LaFeber quoted British pamphleteer 
William Burke, responding to Benjamin Franklin’s demand for all of 
Canada after the French and Indian War: “It is leaving no medium 
between safety and conquest. It is to suppose yourself never safe, 
whilst your neighbor enjoys any security.”102 John Lewis Gaddis, in 
his magisterial biography of Kennan, quoted his papers from 1947 
and 1948 to show that Kennan was convinced that “the best way to 
avoid another such catastrophe would be to stay stronger than all 
potential adversaries”103—exactly the policy that, when implemented 
by the Soviet Union, was interpreted as proof of its aggressive plans. 
Kennan’s sharp phrasing helped to shape the perceptions of his 
fellow policymakers. 

The most interesting part of “The Long Telegram” came at the end 
of the text, where Kennan compared the USSR to an “unruly and 
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unreasonable individual” and called for the “health and vigor of our 
own society.” He pushed the U.S. government to 

formulate and put forward for other nations a much more 

positive and constructive picture of sort of world we would like 

to see than we have put forward in past. It is not enough to 

urge people to develop political processes similar to our own. 

Many foreign peoples, in Europe at least, are tired and fright-

ened by experiences of past, and are less interested in abstract 

freedom than in security. They are seeking guidance rather than 

responsibilities.104

Kennan gave that advice at a moment when the United States was 
moving beyond its century-old role as an example of democracy and 
beacon of freedom and trying to be a creator of international order 
in a new world of global challenges. The U.S. diplomat in Moscow 
found or coined the word that the world needed, identifying the Sovi-
et Union as the core threat to global security. 

By articulating security in this way, Kennan was responding to the 
crisis in U.S.-Soviet relations. Less obviously but no less importantly, 
he was responding to the identity crisis that Americans themselves 
faced: their state’s rapid rise to superpower status left Washing-
ton policymakers intellectually unarmed and politically vulnerable. 
Kennan sketched a worldview and a plan of action. The word “con-
tainment” was never used in “The Long Telegram.” It first appeared 
in Kennan’s Foreign Affairs article, summing up the policy that the 
United States needed to implement. 

Contrary to Kennan’s intentions, “The Long Telegram” and “The 
Sources of Soviet Conduct” did less to explain what the USSR was 
doing and less to provide a new “positive and constructive picture of 
sort of the world” than to shape a course of action for the U.S. The 
understanding of others’ and one’s own actions are not the same; 
they may not even be determined by one another. 
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In his seminal work The Conquest of America (1984), French-Bulgar-
ian scholar Tsvetan Todorov stressed the relative independence of 
knowledge, judgement, and action in the relations between different 
cultures. An increase in knowledge, for instance, does not neces-
sarily make the other’s values more attractive or alter one’s wish to 
change it. He writes that “knowledge does not imply love, nor the 
converse; and neither of the two implies, nor is implied by, identifica-
tion with the other.”105 Kennan certainly had information and knowl-
edge about Russia to impart to his compatriots. That information, 
however, was not the main factor in the Washington decision-mak-
ing. Kennan did criticize Russia as a country that rejected such no-
tions—dear to Americans—as liberty and democracy; but common 
values are not necessarily a prerequisite for rapprochement, just as 
divergent values do not lead inevitably to conflict. Kennan’s policy 
recommendations were taken seriously and the U.S. policy toward 
the USSR shifted, as did U.S. policy globally. Kennan had hit the bull-
seye by furnishing Washington with a coherent strategy, whether or 
not it was grounded in Soviet realities and whether or not it exposed 
the true goals of Soviet leaders. 

In my view, Kennan’s impact on policy in the late 1940s substan-
tiates the claim of constructivist Cold War historian David Camp-
bell. Campbell argues that, “foreign policy is not the response of 
a pre-given domestic society to an external anarchic realm, but 
rather the means by which the U.S. produces and then reproduces 
itself.”106 The claim sounds radical for any foreign-policy practitioner, 
but it seems George Kennan, in the second half of his life, could find 
something appealing in it. 

Kennan well understood the imbalance between diplomatic advice 
and state reaction. In a lecture about WWI given at the University of 
Chicago in the winter of 1950, he saw in this imbalance a problem 
with democracy:
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I sometimes wonder whether…a democracy is not uncomfort-

ably similar to one of those prehistoric monsters with a body as 

long as this room and a brain the size of a pin: he lies there in 

his comfortable primeval mud and pays little attention to his en-

vironment; he is slow to wrath—in fact, you practically have to 

whack his tail off to make him aware that his interests are being 

disturbed; but, once he grasps this, he lays about him with such 

blind determination that he not only destroys his adversary but 

largely wrecks his native habitat. You wonder whether it would 

not have been wiser for him to have taken a little more interest 

in what was going on at an earlier date and to have seen 

whether he could not have prevented some of these situations 

from arising instead of proceeding from an undiscriminating 

indifference to a holy wrath equally undiscriminating.107 

Diplomats are informants about the environment who attempt—very 
often in vain—to awaken a democracy to an early response, Kennan 
was contending. 

All too well aware personally of what he was writing, Kennan con-
fessed 33 years later that:

since I was at that time [in 1950] even more ignorant than I 

am today of the general history of American diplomacy, I drew 

primarily on my own twenty-four years of diplomatic experi-

ence, and tried to look at the episodes in question from the 

standpoint of the lessons which that experience had taught.108

In 1960, Kennan elaborated on this criticism of American diplomacy, 
writing that “American public opinion has often been something like 
a decade behind the times” in devising “responses to the problem 
of Soviet power.”109 Lagging behind, the public could not react to 
the changing international situation, complicating democratic deci-
sion-making in the foreign policy domain. Kennan explained the mis-
understanding between Russia and the United States in 1917, clearly 
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bearing his own experience of the mid-1940s in mind: “There is, let 
me assure you, nothing in nature more egocentrical than the embat-
tled democracy.…The idea of people wasting time and substance on 
any other issue seems to them preposterous. This explains why Allied 
statesmen were simply unable to comprehend how people in Russia 
could be interested in an internal Russian political crisis when there 
was a war on in the West.”110 A diplomat, Kennan understood that the 
difference in worldviews could not be bridged easily. He often blamed 
democracy for creating this problem.

Having been quickly promoted, Kennan had a rather brief State Depart-
ment career. After retiring from the Foreign Service, he was freer to 
study Russia and the Soviet Union and their history, to criticize imple-
mentation of the containment policy he had devised (without believing 
it would last for decades), and even to became what Gaddis has called 
a “counter-cultural critic.” Kennan did not fit well in the growing field of 
Soviet studies. In 1960, he caustically noted that some of the “profes-
sional ‘sovietologists,’ private and governmental…seem afraid to admit 
to themselves or to others that Stalin is really dead.”111 

He continued, however, to inhabit a political world. He contacted Sovi-
et Ambassador Anatoly Dobrynin and commented in magazine articles 
on Ronald Reagan’s policies toward the USSR. As Kennan’s knowledge 
of Russia grew, it led him to unusual conclusions. Long before the col-
lapse of the Soviet Union, he claimed that at some point the Russian 
people would overthrow the Bolsheviks and become a U.S. ally. 

He would never reclaim the power and influence he had in the 1940s, 
but Kennan wanted to retain his reputation as the country’s number 
one Soviet expert, and to some extent he did. New generations of 
Soviet experts mostly came from academia and learned more about 
U.S.-Soviet relations from books, but Kennan had been a part of those 
relations himself, a position few others could claim.

For scholars of international relations, Kennan remains a towering 
figure within the realist tradition, and realists used containment to 
structure decisions on military deployments and economic assis-
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tance.112 Yet Kennan’s thought was wider and more versatile than any 
single political theory. 

He published Russia and the West Under Lenin and Stalin in 1960. 
This book conveys the same concern that Kennan had expressed 
in the final part of “The Long Telegram”: an urgent need to “for-
mulate and put forward for other nations a much more positive 
and constructive picture of sort of world we would like to see.” In 
the preface to Russia and the West, Kennan gave a rationale for its 
publication, which was to fill a gap in the Western study of Russia’s 
relations with the outside world, “from the foundation of the Soviet 
regime down to the point where history merges with contemporary 
affairs.” Kennan further pointed out that:

Soviet historians have recently been giving elaborate attention 

to certain phases of [this history]. The tendency of their labors 

has been to establish an image of this historical process 

which they conceive to be useful to the present purposes of 

the Soviet Communist Party but which is deeply discreditable 

to Western statesmanship and to the spirit and ideas of the 

Western people generally—so discreditable, in fact, that if the 

Western peoples could be brought to believe it, they would 

have no choice but to abandon their faith in themselves and the 

traditions of their national life.113 

Kennan suggested that that narrative of Soviet-Western relations 
created by Soviet historians could be seen as credible by the peoples 
of the newly fashioned nations. By writing his own book he could pro-
vide a world public with the Western view on the history of Russian 
foreign policy. 

A quarter of century later, in 1985, Kennan finished his introduction for 
the new edition of his 1951 book American Diplomacy with an obser-
vation of the “persistent tendency to fashion our policy towards others 
with a view to feeding a pleasant image of ourselves rather than to 
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achieving real, and desperately needed, results in our relations with 
others.”114 In 1960, Kennan had lamented that a world public could 
believe the Soviet narrative of the Soviet-Western relations; hence the 
need to put forward an attractive “Western view.” In 1985, however, 
Kennan was criticizing Americans for focusing on a “pleasant image” 
of themselves instead of pursuing “real… results.” 

In his criticism first of the Soviet Union and then of the United States, 
the development in Kennan’s understanding of foreign relations can be 
glimpsed. For American politicians, domestic politics always eclipsed 
the international challenges, although foreign policy could capture 
people’s attention during major international crises. For example, 
during WWII it would have been difficult to imagine that domestic 
issues could overtake President Franklin Delano Roosevelt’s “Doctor 
Win-the-War.” Kennan suggested “Containment” not as foreign-policy 
advice but to calm the public mood. By 1960, the containment policy 
Kennan once suggested had turned international relations into an 
arena of strategic balancing where the competition spread from arms 
and economics to worldviews and historical narratives. A new field of 
competition included historians’ narratives in the battle for hearts and 
minds. Kennan’s own academic job had the potential to be an interna-
tional weapon in this way. 

The broadening of the rivalry into spheres other than the arms 

race was the new feature in the decade when Kennan wrote his 

passage about the competition in creating historical explanations of 

the recent events, and that feature definitely continued for another 

30 years. During the Cold War, the need for an attractive narrative 

brought pressing domestic social issues to the fore. Indeed, Cold 

War competition between the U.S. and the Soviet Union incentivized 

both technological (war-related) and social advances in hopes of 

overrunning the competitor. The arms race and the construction of 

international alliances were the most visible form of competition. 

Less visible was the race for better social conditions, for the reformed 

society that could attract the greatest global sympathy.115 
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Years later, Joseph Nye coined the term “soft power,” paying tribute 

to Kennan’s vision. In his words: 

Containment led to success in the Cold War not just because of 

military deterrence but because, as George Kennan designed 

the policy, our soft power would help to transform the Soviet 

Bloc from within. Containment was not a static military doctrine 

but a transformational strategy, albeit one that took decades to 

accomplish. Indeed, Kennan frequently warned against what 

he regarded as the over-militarization of containment and was a 

strong supporter of contacts and exchanges.116

Cold War stability had an unexpected outcome: The primacy of do-
mestic policy and of narratives rooted in domestic policy had margin-
alized international expertise. Kennan was starting to feel that the old 
art of diplomacy was becoming obsolete. Decision-makers could not 
take advice into account if the advice did not respond to domestic 
demand and fit the domestic discourse of the day. The subordina-
tion of foreign relations to a “view to feeding a pleasant image of 
ourselves” adeptly captures identity-construction in foreign policy. 
Kennan could feel vindicated in his earlier warnings against democ-
racy as a system that neglects challenges from the external environ-
ment. Thus, his sharp thought traced the changes in the approach to 
international relations just emerging at the time and shaped them 
into conclusions and political advice that may be later claimed as 
their own by theorists from the neorealist to constructivist schools. 

Going back to Kennan reminds us that we can project into current 
Russian-American relations David Campbell’s definition of foreign 
policy as the means by which the U.S.—and Russia as well, I might 
add—produces and then reproduces itself. From this viewpoint the 
current state of U.S.-Russian relations is the result of perceived 
challenges to the dominant domestic order. Challenges are met by 
identifying them with external threats—Russia or the United States 
respectively—which challenge the respective national ideas. 
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Since Alexis de Tocqueville’s book, Democracy in America, the weak-
ness of democracies in foreign affairs has been a matter of academic 
and political debate. Kennan added his strong opinions to the list of 
arguments skeptical of a democratic foreign policy. Even if Kennan 
exaggerated the problems that a democratic foreign policy creates, 
his characterization of these problems is cogent and salient. Politi-
cians often understand domestic pressures and construct foreign 
threats in a manner relevant to domestic political pressures. The 
skillful diplomat, however, seeks to balance domestic pressures with 
international challenges and to find ways of preserving international 
order in concert with the domestic political realities. 

Kennan’s story was one of marrying his knowledge of Russia with 
his understanding of American politics. His success was based on 
his policy recommendations. Conventional American opinion that 
Kennan “explained what Stalin would do” and recommended the 
appropriate countermeasures presumes that Kennan was right about 
the USSR’s plans and capacities. However, contemporary analyses 
of political history reveal that even in the Soviet Union, plans for 
the future were not so clear; they were always in the making. In 
addition, the U.S. policy of containment was not only a response to 
Soviet conduct; to some extent it shaped that conduct. This mutual 
“reinvention” of the United States and Soviet Union in the early 
stage of the Cold War was to a large extent Kennan’s work. Along 
with Winston Churchill’s “iron curtain,” his policy of containment 
determined the political reference points for decades. 

Containment and the Cold War’s beginning shed light on domestic 
conditions in the United States and the use of the foreign policy that 
followed from those conditions. Kennan’s biography is a case study 
in the difficulty of fulfilling domestic needs without spoiling long-
term relations with an important international partner and without 
transforming it from a partner into an enemy. 
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When I became director of the State Department’s Office of 
Policy Planning, in the second term of the Obama adminis-

tration, I received two gifts from thoughtful friends. The first was an 
early edition of American Diplomacy, inscribed by its author, George 
Kennan, who established the office I would soon be leading. The 
second was a color scan of a memo from Kennan to Under Sec-
retary of State Dean Acheson, dated May 23, 1947. Its cover letter 
was less than a page long and replete with the sort of excuses and 
caveats familiar to anyone who had ever tactfully tried to lower a 
boss’s expectations. “It is only a few days since the Planning Staff, 
with an incomplete and provisional complement of personnel, was 
able to begin to give attention to the substance of its work,” Kennan 
wrote. “Normally I would consider this far too short a time in which 
to consider and make recommendations on matters of such impor-
tance. But I recognize that the need for a program of action on this 
problem is urgent and the best answer we can give today is perhaps 
more useful than a more thoroughly considered study one or two 
months hence.”117

GEORGE KENNAN:  
THE DIPLOMATIC 
LEGACY
Jon Finer
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The subject of the memo that followed was simply stated, even un-
derstated: “it deals with the question of aid to Western Europe.” Yet 
it proposed one of America’s most successful policy initiatives. Offi-
cially called the “European Recovery Program,” it is far better known 
as the Marshall Plan after the secretary of state who announced it to 
the world in a speech just two weeks after Kennan’s self-deprecating 
missive.  

These gifts were the first of many ways I came to understand how 
much the lessons of George Kennan’s life and work motivated, in-
spired, but also overshadowed and humbled, those of his many suc-
cessors. I suspect this has been the case for virtually every Ameri-
can diplomat and particularly those fortunate enough to follow in his 
professional footsteps. Since Kennan established it in the aftermath 
of World War II, the Office of Policy Planning has been providing 
the “best answer(s)” it could to the nation’s greatest international 
challenges often in a matter of days, when months would make for 
an easier task. 

To say that Kennan was a tough act to follow does not do him jus-
tice. On more than a few occasions I joked (admittedly with some 
genuine concern) that the trajectory of Policy Planning from Kennan’s 
tenure to my own was among the clearest examples of American 
decline. 

But there were also extraordinary benefits to succeeding George 
Kennan. In particular, he left myriad invaluable blueprints for how to 
approach the job. In a federal government that can be obsessively 
focused on the day-to-day, or, these days, on the minute-by-minute, 
the Policy Planning staff was intended to be and has remained a rare 
oasis of strategic discourse. George Marshall summed this up best 
in his characteristically pithy advice to Kennan: “avoid trivia.” 

That is easier said than done. Policymaking ultimately boils down 
to setting, articulating, and implementing priorities. Inherently, this 
involves a tug-of-war between what President Eisenhower termed 
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the “urgent” and the “important.” In other words, tasks that must 
be accomplished right away must be balanced against longer-term 
imperatives or else the ship of state will list. In theory, the two doz-
en or so members of the Policy Planning staff are assigned to focus 
on the latter, leaving the former—everything from crisis response to 
press inquiries to the humdrum (but critically important) maintenance 
of foreign relations—to the thousands of other professional diplo-
mats throughout the State Department. In practice, however, when 
Policy Planning has removed itself wholly from this more operational 
business of policymaking, it has risked relegating itself to an after-
thought, an in-house think tank with ideas that rarely make it from 
the director’s desk to the real world. 

It says a lot about how difficult producing actionable ideas can be 
that Kennan, architect of the office and by far its most celebrated oc-
cupant, harbored deep doubts about the success of his undertaking. 
“It occurred to me that it is time I recognized that my Planning Staff, 
started nearly three years ago, has simply been a failure,” he wrote 
in 1950, “like all previous attempts to bring order and foresight to 
the designing of foreign policy by special institutional arrangements 
within the department.”118 History rightly rejects this analysis. And 
from the way Kennan did the job, one can distill and adhere to some 
valuable lessons. 

The first is that, while Kennan had an academic bent, he never lost 
sight of the fact that policy planning is not just about having the best 
ideas. It is the alchemy of ideas and implementation. A thoughtful 
paper on how the United States should help rebuild its postwar 
adversaries might be good enough for a scholar seeking tenure. A 
successful policy planner would know how to use the levers of gov-
ernment, as he did, to turn mere insights into an assistance program 
($100 billion in today’s dollars) that helped turn our bitterest and most 
devastated wartime enemies into some of our closest and most 
prosperous allies. I encouraged members of the Policy Planning 
staff—a roughly equal mix of career foreign service officers, civil 
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servants, and political appointees from outside the government—to 
be entrepreneurs and evangelists for their work, building relation-
ships around the State Department and across agencies, particularly 
among those who would have to carry out our best-laid plans. 

A second lesson drawn from Kennan is that S/P, as it is known inside 
the Department, has the luxury to not only take a step back from the 
day-to-day, but also to take a step back in time, ensuring that a sense 
of history, of triumphs and failures in the past, informs and provides 
context for our policymaking and for the secretary’s speeches. As a 
graduate student, my advisor was Yuen Foong Khong, whose Analo-
gies at War chronicled the use and misuse of history by 20th-century 
foreign-policymakers.119 Khong’s analysis built on that of Ernest May 
and Richard Neustadt, two Harvard professors whose Thinking in 
Time both offered lessons on how to integrate history into policy 
analysis and recounted “horror stories” about how badly that is often 
done.120

In the pantheon of great diplomats, Kennan is one of the few who 
was also an accomplished historian. It is clear that each of his voca-
tions informed the other. In a 1995 essay for Foreign Affairs, Kennan 
resurrected and explicated a relatively obscure 1821 speech by 
then-Secretary of State John Quincy Adams, whose thinking on for-
eign affairs Kennan had long admired. Adams’s admonition that the 
United States “goes not abroad in search of monsters to destroy,” 
which Kennan often cited, had provided some of the historical and 
theoretical underpinning for two of his most celebrated stances—op-
posing the expansion of the Vietnam War and the invasion of Iraq.121  

Contemporary policy debates involve frequent appeals to history, 
employed both to help win internal arguments and, most important-
ly, to get the answer right. In the administration in which I served, 
the dominant historical paradigm was the invasion of Iraq. We were 
led by a president who had been elected in no small part because, 



169

like Kennan, he was an early opponent of it. Barack Obama’s 2002 
speech labeling the prospect of invading Iraq “a dumb war... a rash 
war” months before the invasion was the most important substan-
tive distinction between his candidacy for president six years later 
and that of his main Democratic primary opponent, Hillary Clin-
ton, and general election opponent, John McCain.122 As president, 
Obama drew important lessons from the U.S. experience in Iraq. He 
concluded that difficult adversaries should be engaged, not just con-
fronted; that the United States is stronger as part of a coalition than 
when acting alone; that adhering to international law matters; that 
military quagmires can swallow a presidency, particularly in the Mid-
dle East. These lessons informed many of our major initiatives, from 
drawing down troops from Iraq, to “rebalancing” our focus from the 
Middle East to East Asia, to seeking a nuclear agreement rather than 
war with Iran, to resisting pressure for greater military intervention 
in Syria. In Policy Planning, we tailored our work for Secretary Kerry, 
including papers that became memos he wrote to President Obama. 
We kept these lessons and this historical context very much in mind. 

A third lesson of Kennan’s time in Policy Planning was more of a 
cautionary tale. His diaries and posthumous biographies revealed 
antiquated views on race and an aversion to multiculturalism that, 
while perhaps unexceptional for a white man of his generation, are 
a disappointing aspect of his world view.123 Suffice it to say, an office 
that seeks to generate and implement the best ideas on America’s 
role in the world requires diversity, not just of thought, but of the full 
range of categories that comprise the American experience. 

Fourth, and perhaps the most significant, were Kennan’s reflections 
on the region of the world he knew best. Perhaps the greatest simi-
larity between Kennan’s tenure and my own was that both coincided 
with the rise of Russia (the Soviet Union in his case) as a preeminent 
foreign-policy challenge. The early years of the Obama administra-
tion were characterized by the “reset” in U.S. relations with Russia. 
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The reset allowed us to cooperate on a range of priorities, from 
building pressure on Iran to curtail its nuclear program, to updating 
the START arms control agreement, to facilitating the resupply of 
military operations in Afghanistan through the Northern Distribution 
Network. Far from seeing Russia primarily as an adversary, Presi-
dent Obama even ridiculed his 2012 general election opponent, Mitt 
Romney, for listing Russia as America’s paramount security threat, 
quipping that “the 1980s are calling to ask for their foreign policy 
back.”

But by the beginning of Obama’s second term, tension between 
the United States and Russia was mounting rapidly. Disputes first 
arose over how to manage the Arab Spring uprisings. President 
Putin saw himself as a defender of stability and the status quo in the 
face of destabilizing rebellions. He came to believe that the United 
States had (1) encouraged similar demonstrations in Moscow during 
Russia’s 2012 elections, (2) betrayed Russia by using a UN Security 
Resolution to justify military action that toppled the Libyan govern-
ment, and (3) backed an “extremist” revolution in Syria. 

It was the outbreak of unrest in Ukraine and eventually the fall of its 
government, the annexation of Crimea, and the armed conflict in the 
Donbas that shattered the “reset” for good.

By the time I became director of Policy Planning, the administration 
was preoccupied with two major challenges emanating from Mos-
cow—the conflict in Ukraine, which had entered its third year, and 
the conflict in Syria, which Russia had just inexorably altered by a 
direct military intervention in September of 2015. Those challenges, 
which dominated Secretary Kerry’s myriad engagements with Russia 
over the final year in office, generated the most important work our 
Policy Planning office produced. Sometimes intentionally, sometimes 
unconsciously, we used Kennan as a guide. 

He was the ghost in the room when we assembled eminent his-
torians and other Russia scholars on the State Department’s regal 
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eighth floor, for a dinner with Secretary Kerry to discuss the return of 
the Russia challenge. We sought to channel his insights when draft-
ing a memorandum mimicking what we believed would have been 
President Putin’s guidance to his own policy planners, laying out his 
worldview. And we developed detailed strategic plans for reorienting 
our approach to the Russia relationship, with the goal of handing off 
a more manageable situation to our successors. 

We were soon confronted by a third dispute with Russia—one that 
Kennan would have likely found far less shocking than many in our 
administration did: Moscow’s use of stolen and disseminated infor-
mation, as well as disinformation, to successfully intervene in the 
2016 U.S. presidential election. My staff, which included Russia ex-
perts from inside and outside the government, fixated on this prob-
lem as soon as it emerged and before it was acknowledged publicly. 
We sought, largely unsuccessfully, to push the Department and the 
administration to more quickly consider stricter sanctions and make 
a strong public statement about what we knew. As a last-ditch effort, 
we produced a memo for the president from Secretary Kerry calling 
for a bipartisan commission, modeled on the 9/11 Commission, to in-
vestigate what had happened and to make recommendations about 
how best to protect the country. Never approved, this idea looks 
wiser in hindsight. 

To see how clearly Kennan’s own thinking anticipated virtually all of 
these challenges, one need look no further than the most famous 
of his writings, the so-called “Long Telegram” of 1946.124 Its five 
concrete recommendations, borne of his deep alarm about Jo-
sef Stalin’s creeping authoritarianism, prove similarly prescient as 
the United States slowly came to terms with the threat posed by 
President Vladimir Putin’s Russia. “Our first step,” Kennan wrote in 
the telegram, “must be to apprehend, and recognize for what it is, 
the nature of the movement with which we are dealing. We must 
study it with same courage, detachment, objectivity, and same 
determination not to be emotionally provoked or unseated by it, with 
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which doctor studies unruly and unreasonable individual.”125 By the 
time Russia had reemerged long after the end of the Cold War as a 
critical foreign-policy challenge, the Russia expertise that the U.S. 
government had developed over decades had atrophied, in favor 
of trendier regional specialties like the Middle East and East Asia. 
Russian linguists and cultural sages were in short supply at the State 
Department as well as in the military and intelligence community. It 
is a deficit we are still working to rectify. 

Second, Kennan warned that, “we must see that our public is 
educated to realities of Russian situation. I cannot over-emphasize 
the importance of this. Press cannot do this alone. It must be done 
mainly by Government, which is necessarily more experienced and 
better informed on practical problems involved.”126 As our govern-
ment’s policy focus shifted away from Russia, the American public 
also stopped paying as much attention to Russia as it should have. 
This helps to explain why Russia’s interference in our election was 
so incomprehensible—even unimaginable—to many Americans. 
They no longer remembered, if they had ever known, that Moscow 
had relentlessly engaged in lower-tech, less successful attempts at 
interference in American politics throughout the Cold War. 

Kennan also wisely held up a mirror to American society by arguing 
that we are most vulnerable to Russian meddling when our domes-
tic affairs are in relative turmoil. He wrote in his telegram,

Much depends on health and vigor of our own society. World 

communism is like malignant parasite which feeds only on 

diseased tissue. This is point at which domestic and foreign 

policies meets. Every courageous and incisive measure to 

solve internal problems of our own society, to improve self-con-

fidence, discipline, morale and community spirit of our own 

people, is a diplomatic victory over Moscow worth a thousand 

diplomatic notes and joint communiqués. If we cannot abandon 

fatalism and indifference in face of deficiencies of our own 
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society, Moscow will profit—Moscow cannot help profiting by 

them in its foreign policies.” 

That Moscow’s successful 2016 intervention came amid—and 
sought to exacerbate—a time of great domestic division in the 
United States would have come as no surprise to Kennan and those 
familiar with his work. 

In his fourth piece of Russia-related advice, Kennan anticipated 
what is among the defining foreign-policy questions of our current 
moment. This is how to modernize and restore confidence in liberal 
democracy as a governance mode and in the norms, legal regimes, 
and institutions that comprise the international system established 
after World War II. With Europe and the United States in degrees of 
disarray, fueled by Russian interference, we can no longer take for 
granted that our way of life—the “power of our example,” in Bill Clin-
ton’s famous phrase—will remain more compelling to the world than 
the autocrat’s bargain of greater order and diminished freedom. This, 
too, is something Kennan saw coming, writing in his telegram:

We must formulate and put forward for other nations a much 

more positive and constructive picture of sort of world we would 

like to see than we have put forward in past. It is not enough to 

urge people to develop political processes similar to our own. 

Many foreign peoples, in Europe at least, are tired and frightened 

by experiences of past, and are less interested in abstract 

freedom than in security. They are seeking guidance rather than 

responsibilities. We should be better able than Russians to give 

them this. And unless we do, Russians certainly will. 

Finally, Kennan warned against the inclination, always present in 
American culture, to regress towards the sorts of nationalism, na-
tivism, and autocracy that are hallmarks of the very foreign govern-
ments we should be standing against. His words certainly apply to a 
U.S. administration buttressed by those forces, more enamored with 
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authoritarians than with our fellow democrats around the world and 
willing to compromise core values, such as freedom of the press and 
the independence of political institutions, like the judiciary and intel-
ligence community: “We must have courage and self-confidence to 
cling to our own methods and conceptions of human society. After 
all, the greatest danger that can befall us in coping with this problem 
of Soviet communism, is that we shall allow ourselves to become 
like those with whom we are coping.”127

I left the government on January 19, 2017, but not Kennan’s long 
shadow. One of my first stops after leaving Washington was Prince-
ton, New Jersey, to spend several months at the Institute for Ad-
vanced Study where Kennan was also a post-government transient 
before making it his professional home for many years. The Institute 
is best known for the world-changing work of its scientists, from 
founding director Abraham Flexner (whose seminal essay on “The 
Usefulness of Useless Knowledge” would have made a good title 
for a Policy Planning paper), to Robert Oppenheimer (who led the 
Manhattan Project and recruited Kennan to the Institute), to Albert 
Einstein (who took up residence there upon arriving from Germany), 
to physicist John Nash (whose life story was depicted in the book 
and film, A Beautiful Mind).128 At a time when the Trump administra-
tion was working feverishly to close the nation’s doors to immigrants 
and refugees and pursue energy and environmental policies that re-
ject the very concept of scientific truth, I took solace in an institution 
that had welcomed some of the world’s scientific greatest minds as 
Europe was engulfed by the Second World War. 

Among the non-scientists, Kennan was the Institute’s most notable 
member. On a granite structure overlooking the 600-acre Institute 
Woods, where scholars stroll to clear their minds, his words are 
inscribed alongside those of Flexner and Einstein. While working at 
the Institute, Kennan published more than a dozen books and won 
virtually every prestigious literary accolade, including two National 
Book Awards and two Pulitzer Prizes. “Your gifts are unique in the 
world,” the great Isaiah Berlin wrote to Kennan in 1965.129 
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But it is also clear that Kennan’s life after government wasn’t easy, a 
comforting realization for anyone struggling to find fulfillment amid 
the disorienting transition away from the front lines of public ser-
vice. As Frank Costigliola, who edited Kennan’s diaries, recounts, his 
faculty appointment was initially opposed by the Institute’s mathe-
maticians, who questioned his scholarly credentials. He contemplat-
ed a run for the U.S. Senate from New Jersey but was dissuaded 
by Oppenheimer, who insisted Kennan would have to give up his 
Institute appointment should he pursue elected office. And despite 
his subsequent ambassadorships in Belgrade and Moscow, Kennan’s 
biographers describe an alienation from Washington’s foreign policy 
establishment, whose foundation he had helped build but which mis-
appropriated his ideas in support of approaches he rejected. Kennan 
wrote and spoke often of isolation, even loneliness.130 

In important ways, Kennan remained, to the end of his 101 years, an 
unabashed optimist: he believed in the necessity of remaining en-
gaged in the public debate and in the power of sound policy thinking 
to avoid unnecessary war. At key moments in the history through 
which he lived, Kennan refused to yield to the inevitability of armed 
conflict, even as it seemed to be taking on a momentum of its own. 
For example, in his December 1957 Reith Lectures, delivered at 
Oxford University and broadcast worldwide by the BBC, he warned 
of an overemphasis in the West on military alliances and escalation 
at the expense of softer foreign policy tools, like diplomacy. Amid the 
global obsession with Moscow’s purported preeminence in military 
technology and the arms race spurred by the launch of the Sputnik 
satellite just two months earlier, he argued:

To me it is a source of amazement that there are people who 

still see the escape from this danger in the continued multi-

plication by us of the destructiveness and speed of delivery 

of the major atomic weapons. These people seem unable to 

wean themselves from the belief that it is relative changes 
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in the power of these weapons that are going to determine 

everything. They evidently believe that if the Russians gain the 

slightest edge on us in the capacity to wreak massive destruc-

tion at long range, they will immediately use it, regardless of 

our own power of retaliation. Conversely they seem to feel that 

if we can only contrive to get a tiny bit ahead of the Russians 

we shall in some way have won; our salvation will be assured; 

the road will then be paved for a settlement on our terms….I 

scarcely need say that I see no grounds whatsoever for these 

assumptions.131

A decade later, as President Lyndon B. Johnson sought to build 

support for expanding the Vietnam War, Kennan enraged the White 

House by testifying before the Senate Foreign Relations Committee 

that the United States should instead withdraw from Indochina 

“as soon as this could be done without inordinate damage to our 

prestige or stability in the area.”132 And in 2002, at the dawn of 

the nation’s longest wars, in Iraq and Afghanistan, Kennan told 

an interviewer asking about the wisdom of invading Iraq: “I could 

see justification only if the absence of it would involve a major and 

imminent danger to our own country, or, at worst, to our most 

intimate and traditional allies. Of this I see no evidence.” He contin-

ued: “I have seen no evidence that we have any realistic plans for 

dealing with the great state of confusion in Iraqian [sic] affairs which 

would presumably follow even after the successful elimination of 

the dictator.”133

While Kennan also held more than his share of dubious posi-

tions—such as that it would be a mistake to re-unify East and West 

Germany—there is no denying his prescience, or at least contrarian 

boldness, even after his most influential government positions were 

behind him. Standing so frequently against conventional wisdom 
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could only have deepened his sense of solitude. At least that is what 

his words, inscribed on the sculpture at the Institute for Advanced 

Study, seem to suggest: 

True scholars often work in loneliness, compelled to find 

rewards in the awareness that they have made valuable, even 

beautiful contributions to the cumulative structure of human 

knowledge, whether anyone knows it at the time or not.

That may be true, to a point. But the “valuable, even beautiful” 
contributions of George Kennan, who passed away in 2005, were 
well known throughout his time. And they continue to guide those 
fortunate enough to learn from them.
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George F. Kennan at the Wilson Center
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At the core of the Western strategy for managing the Cold War 
from the late 1940s to the 1980s was an American-led policy 

of “containment” of Soviet power and influence. Its principal author, 
George F. Kennan, diagnosed in Soviet foreign policy an expansionist 
undercurrent, which had the potential to threaten the foundations of 
economic prosperity and political stability on which vital Western in-
terests depended. Accordingly, Kennan advised “a long-term, patient 
but firm and vigilant containment of Russian expansive tendencies,” 
not only in Europe, but globally.134

Containment was a mode of East-West relations that many pre-
sumed would be relegated to the dustbin of history at the end of the 
Cold War. Yet the current period might accurately be dubbed the era 
of “new containment,” as Washington Post columnist Jennifer Rubin 
has called it, with many urging the United States, NATO, and Europe 
once again to contain, constrain, and counter what they view as Rus-
sia’s expansionist policies and malign influence on the world stage.135 

CONCLUSION: 
GEORGE F. KENNAN, 
CONTAINMENT, AND 
THE WEST’S CURRENT 
RUSSIA PROBLEM
Matthew Rojansky and Michael Kimmage

George F. Kennan at the Wilson Center
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Although circumstances around the conflict between Russia and 
the West today differ considerably from those of the Cold War, the 
conflict nonetheless poses a serious threat to European security 
and stability and demands a careful and comprehensive Western 
response. Containment is relevant today, if conceived and practiced 
as Kennan intended—as a primarily non-military strategy focused 
on recognition of the adversary’s vulnerabilities and on the West’s 
capacity to solve pressing problems, while inspiring others to do 
the same. Kennan’s prescription for investment in U.S. expertise on 
Russia is equally salient in light of today’s renewed conflict.

If the West is to benefit once more from Kennan’s insights, it must 
balance the collective political will to maintain a credible deterrent 
with the search for a negotiated settlement of differences, selective 
cooperation, and even eventual reconciliation in Russia-West rela-
tions overall. At a time when European and trans-Atlantic unity has 
been strained by relentless crises, striking this delicate balance will 
be no small challenge.

RUSSIA AND THE WEST IN THE COLD WAR  
AND TODAY

Russia’s military interventions in the post-Soviet neighborhood, 
particularly in Georgia in 2008 and in Ukraine since 2014, have made 
other nearby European states nervous about their own security, 
pushing NATO’s “Article 5” promise of collective defense into the 
spotlight.136 Following high-profile spy scandals and allegations of 
election interference, many in the United States and Europe now 
think of Russian influence per se as a malign force, in much the 
same terms that the West construed Soviet influence during the 
Cold War as inherently threatening.137 Thus, in addition to imposing 
economic, diplomatic, and political sanctions as a direct response to 
Russia’s actions in Ukraine, Western governments have searched out 
and censured Russian investments, diplomatic and cultural activities, 
and links with Russian political actors within the borders of Western 
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countries. All of this is reminiscent of the Cold War’s rivalry not only 
in arms but in ideologies, economics, and diplomacy.138

There are even surprisingly significant stylistic and structural similar-
ities between the current East-West conflict and the Cold War. On 
both sides, demonization of the other has largely replaced reasoned 
dialogue, let alone introspection. As Robert Legvold has argued, 
both sides are now conditioned to thinking of the other side as 
entirely culpable for the current crisis. Each side portrays the other 
as intentionally and nefariously exploiting the situation to damage, 
disadvantage, and undermine the other’s interests.139 In fact, political 
leaders have consistently labeled one another as adversaries, and 
with very few exceptions have embraced simplistic narratives about 
the other’s hostile intent.140

The reemergence of proxy conflicts between Russia and the West is 
the most troubling echo of the Cold War today. Armed clashes that 
involved Russian forces occasionally broke out around the post-Sovi-
et periphery in the 1990s and afterwards, and during the same peri-
od Russia and the West disagreed sharply over the handling of crises 
and conflicts from the Balkans to the Middle East. Yet for the first 
time in decades, the past five years have witnessed not only direct 
military conflict between forces supported, equipped, and trained by 
the West against those backed by Russia in Syria and Ukraine, but 
also numerous close calls between NATO and Russian forces in the 
air and at sea. There is even one documented case of direct ex-
change of fire between U.S. and Russian state-controlled mercenar-
ies in Syria, with hundreds of casualties.141 Rather than isolated inci-
dents in an otherwise harmonious international environment, these 
episodes illustrate the aspiration on both sides to separate friend 
from foe globally and to secure favorable international alignments or 
coalitions reminiscent of the Cold-War geopolitical “blocs.”142

Confrontation between Moscow and Washington has also infused 
the domestic politics and worldviews of both sides. Russia’s inter-
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ference in the 2016 U.S. presidential election and credible charges 
of ongoing Russian intelligence activities aimed at manipulating 
voters and inflaming U.S. public opinion have exacerbated already 
intense partisan warfare in Washington. Strident voices across the 
U.S. political spectrum, in the traditional press and in social media 
echo chambers, seek to score points by denouncing “ties to Russia,” 
however benign, remote, or implausible, as proof of nefarious, even 
treasonous, behavior.143 In and around Capitol Hill, the dissemination 
of lists of Russian, European, and even U.S. entities and individuals 
that might be targeted for future sanctions requires that even the 
most outlandish claims be taken seriously enough to be disproven. 
The domestic political effects of Russia’s ongoing information, cyber, 
and intelligence operations do not yet amount to a new “Red Scare” 
in Washington, but they will do lasting damage.

The current conflict’s domestic political element may be even more 
pronounced on the Russian side. It is certainly more central to Mos-
cow’s domestic political agenda. For more than a decade, and amid 
slowing economic growth and rampant corruption, Vladimir Putin has 
conjured a “siege mentality” of Russia against the hostile, U.S.-led 
West to justify his authoritarian rule.144 Especially with Putin’s popu-
larity declining in the years after his invasion of Ukraine and annex-
ation of Crimea, the Kremlin beats a constant drum of propaganda 
to persuade Russians of their distinctly Eurasian values and identity 
and the need to resist U.S. power.145 If anything, wave upon wave 
of U.S. sanctions have dovetailed with Putin’s own goals of “repa-
triating” Russian wealth and expunging foreign support for Russian 
NGOs. Severing ties between Russia and the West can be a means 
of limiting vulnerability to Western pressure. For Putin, it is also an 
instrument of domestic control.

If mutual isolation is the goal, however, neither side has yet achieved 
it. Despite hostile political climates, strident media narratives, and 
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the proliferation of sanctions and counter-sanctions, Russians and 
Westerners remain more interconnected by trade and by profession-
al, community, and family ties than they were throughout the Cold 
War. Both are deeply engaged with China and the global econo-
my. Ideological elements of the current conflict, while apparent 
in debates over human rights, democratic legitimacy, and interna-
tional law, are still relatively limited by comparison with the Cold 
War’s all-encompassing struggle of free market capitalism versus 
communism.146 Moreover, despite the overall deterioration in rela-
tions, Washington and Moscow have maintained some channels of 
communication and have cooperated successfully on space, Arctic 
issues, counter-terrorism, and even some regional security challeng-
es like Iran’s nuclear program.147

A broad strokes analogy between the current Russia-West conflict 
and the Cold War clearly fails when one factors in the vast dispar-
ity between Russian and Western power today. While Russia has 
recovered from the economic, demographic, and political collapse 
it suffered after losing its East European and Soviet empires in 
1989–91, it is far from the United States in economic, demographic, 
or conventional military terms, much less to NATO or the West as a 
whole. With a far wealthier and more developed China increasingly 
flexing its diplomatic and political muscles, Russia is no longer even 
the predominant power in Eurasia. The only geographic areas in 
which Russia can balance or potentially supersede the West are in 
its immediate post-Soviet periphery and even then only if it applies 
overwhelming force against relatively soft targets, while relying on 
its vast nuclear arsenal to deter a Western response.148

Reminders the Cold War is long in the past offer little comfort to 
governments and societies worried about Russian aggression in 
Europe. Even for those in the West who reject the new Cold War 
paradigm and perceive no direct threat from today’s Russia, a new 
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containment policy might still be justifiable: reassuring nervous 
European neighbors could outweigh the cost of lost partnership and 
engagement with post-Soviet Russia, which might well have been 
illusory from the start. Russia hawks argue that Russian leadership 
has been habitually dishonest about its intentions in Ukraine, Syria, 
and elsewhere, while its state-funded media organs are engaged in 
a systematic global disinformation campaign.149 How, they ask, can 
one work with a regime that one cannot trust?150

THE NEED FOR CONTAINMENT THEN AND NOW

In both his famous “Long Telegram” of 1946 and his equally famous 
“Mr. X” article from the following year, Kennan argued for contain-
ment as the best form of resistance to Soviet expansionism. Kennan 
even described Soviet foreign policy in terms not dissimilar to those 
used in the growing Western consensus about Russian foreign policy 
today. Kennan assessed that the Soviet leadership was ideologically 
driven but pragmatic in its inclination to push outward only when 
“timely and promising,” and to hold back when resistance was en-
countered.151

Accordingly, Kennan called for “the adroit and vigilant application of 
counterforce at a series of constantly shifting geographical and politi-
cal points,” in which he included both Western societies themselves, 
and the wider world in which Soviet and Western interests collid-
ed.152 In Kennan’s view, the danger of an expansionist Soviet foreign 
policy came not only from the Bolsheviks’ distinct ideology but from 
their access to the vast power and potential of Russia itself. 

Although ideological differences are now much less pronounced, 
Kennan’s assessment of the potential disruptive power of Russian 
foreign policy for Western interests should be given careful consider-
ation today. “This political force,” Kennan wrote of the Kremlin in his 
famous telegram, “has complete power of disposition over energies 
of one of world’s greatest peoples and resources of world’s richest 
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national territory, and is borne along by deep and powerful currents 
of Russian nationalism.”153 

While today’s Russia may bring to bear more modest resources in 
terms of wealth, population, and even military potential, it is still a 
force to be reckoned with, one of the world’s two nuclear super-
powers, a major international power broker, and by far the strongest 
national military present in the European theater. Likewise, Russian 
“expansionism” today varies from overt seizure and annexation of 
territory, as in Crimea, to murkier “hybrid” interventions in neigh-
boring states as in Ukraine’s Donbas region or Georgia’s Abkhazia 
and South Ossetia, to the assertion of a right to protect the ethnic 
Russian diaspora living beyond Russia’s borders, from the Baltics to 
Central Asia. Just as Kennan argued regarding Soviet expansionism, 
Russia’s current policy towards its neighborhood is pragmatic and 
flexible but appears inexorably focused on the establishment of a 
sphere of influence, at least in its so-called “near abroad.”154

The Kremlin today has little interest in promulgating its particular 
political ideology of state capitalism and a strong “power vertical” 
or in dominating territory beyond its immediate periphery. Yet it does 
seek to project influence globally in ways not unlike those described 
by Kennan during the Cold War. The main goals of Russian policy in the 
West were, according to Kennan in his “Long Telegram,” “to disrupt 
national self confidence, to hamstring measures of national defense, 
to increase social and industrial unrest [and] to stimulate all forms 
of disunity.” He warned that within Western societies, “poor will be 
set against rich, black against white, young against old, newcomers 
against established residents, etc.”155 As any number of reports from 
Western governments and experts now confirm, these very ap-
proaches are central to Russia’s current information and influence 
operations in the West and worldwide.156

Much has been written in recent years on the topic of Russian-sup-
ported broadcast and online media activity around the world, which 
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Westerners have accused of promoting a deceptive and propagan-
dized narrative.157 Some even cite Kremlin-driven media activities 
as a core component of the so-called “hybrid” threat to Russia’s 
nearest neighbors.158 The Russians themselves argue that their 
international media activity is no different from that of any other 
country and in particular no different from the U.S. media, which has 
for decades enjoyed an outsized international footprint.159 Either way, 
there can be little doubt that Russian-backed TV and radio broadcast-
ing, news agencies and web portals, and apparent armies of paid 
internet “trolls” all operate in the West today to “stir the pot” of 
anti-government political views, and more broadly to undermine pub-
lic confidence in core Western institutions, from national and local 
government to major corporations and prominent NGOs.160

Russia’s media activities in the West are complemented by semi-co-
vert activities aimed at advancing Russia’s interests (i.e. weakening 
the Western sanctions regime) and at establishing connections 
with fringe political groups on both the right and left of the political 
spectrum. These contacts go beyond merely fostering fellow-trav-
eler sentiments among the most vocal critics of the United States, 
NATO, and the established European order to include providing 
direct financial assistance to political parties, and even payoffs to 
individual politicians.161 Kennan’s assessment of Soviet interference 
in the domestic politics of Western countries could have described 
the present conflict: “Where suspicions exist,” he wrote, “they will 
be fanned; where not, ignited. No effort will be spared to discredit 
and combat all efforts which threaten to lead to any sort of unity or 
cohesion.”162

GETTING CONTAINMENT RIGHT

To the degree that Kennan’s containment doctrine entailed vigilance, 
strength, and readiness to deter Russian expansion, it has already 
been widely endorsed and adopted by Western governments, and 
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even by NATO as a whole.163 Yet close attention to Kennan’s writ-
ings suggests he intended containment to entail much more than 
deploying countermeasures and closing Western ranks in response 
to any and every Soviet provocation. Kennan wanted the West, not 
the Kremlin, to control the agenda, believing that the challenge was 
“within our power to solve… without recourse to any general mili-
tary conflict.”164

Kennan’s restraint derived from his analysis of the basic Russian 
approach to power projection. Because the Russians were inclined 
to think of geopolitical competition as a long-term struggle and were 
thus potentially prepared to cede ground on any given issue in the 
face of firm opposition, Kennan thought that deterrence could pre-
vent divergent interests from sliding into general conflict between 
Russia and the West. “If the adversary has sufficient force and 
makes clear his readiness to use it, he rarely has to do so,” Kennan 
reasoned, so that “if situations are properly handled there need be 
no prestige-engaging showdowns.”165

By the same token, Kennan warned against needlessly bombastic, 
blustering responses to the Soviet threat, which he worried the Sovi-
ets might perceive as weakness. Un-strategic action from the West 
might push the Kremlin into a domestic political corner where it was 
forced to escalate:

While the Kremlin is basically flexible in its reaction to political 

realities, it is by no means unamenable to considerations of 

prestige. Like almost any other government, it can be placed 

by tactless and threatening gestures in a position where it 

cannot afford to yield even though this might be dictated by 

its sense of realism. The Russian leaders are keen judges of 

human psychology, and as such they are highly conscious that 

loss of temper and of self-control is never a source of strength 

in political affairs. They are quick to exploit such evidences of 

weakness. For these reasons, it is a sine qua non of successful 
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dealing with Russia that the foreign government in question 

should remain at all times cool and collected and that its 

demands on Russian policy should be put forward in such a 

manner as to leave the way open for a compliance not too 

detrimental to Russian prestige.166

The most difficult dimension of a successful containment strategy 
may also be the most often forgotten or misconstrued from Kennan’s 
original writings. Kennan flipped on its head the Marxist-Leninist 
contention that capitalism contained the “seeds of its own destruc-
tion” to argue that internal contradictions, reactionary leadership, 
and fundamental structural flaws would eventually destroy the Soviet 
system from within.167 Rather than be provoked into rash action in 
the name of preventive security, or pursuing adventurist interven-
tions inside Russia itself, Kennan advised the West to practice stra-
tegic patience. He was confident that much of what was threatening 
about Soviet power would be the cause of its own ultimate demise.

Here Kennan’s insights offer vitally important lessons for Rus-
sia-West relations today. The Soviet leadership’s innate hostility 
toward the West and the wider capitalist world—what Kennan re-
ferred to as the Kremlin’s “aggressive intransigence”—betrayed the 
Bolshevik regime’s paranoia and self-isolation.168 Moreover, Kennan 
wrote, “the very disrespect of Russians for objective truth—indeed, 
their disbelief in its existence—leads them to view all stated facts 
as instruments for furtherance of one ulterior purpose or another.”169 
Western politicians have lamented similar strains of self-isolating and 
deliberately dishonest or manipulative behavior on the part of the 
current Russian leadership.170

Even if it weathers the storm of economic and political isolation it 

has stirred up by its hostile actions in Ukraine, the Russian state in 

the coming decades faces existential challenges entirely of its own 
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making. The first among these is the lack of opportunity for Russia’s 

best and brightest citizens within the current political and economic 

system, which causes continuing emigration of talent and capital, 

and is especially problematic in view of Russia’s low birth rate and 

aging population. The second is the endemic corruption of Russian 

officialdom, from the obscenely wealthy inner circles of the Kremlin 

and the high echelons of state-supported industries, to regional 

elites and even street-level law enforcement. Finally, there is what 

Russians now call the “problem of 2024,” how Vladimir Putin will 

manage to retain or transfer power at the end of his final term as 

president without provoking a succession crisis or even a revolution.

Kennan’s version of containment took account of these very prob-
lems. He judged the Soviet regime as fundamentally weak, despite 
its outwardly strong appearance, arguing that its weakness would 
become evident as it attempted to perpetuate itself and propagate 
new leadership. Of Russians, he wrote: “That they can keep pow-
er themselves, they have demonstrated. That they can quietly and 
easily turn it over to others remains to be proved. Meanwhile, the 
hardships of their rule and the vicissitudes of international life have 
taken a heavy toll of the strength and hopes of the great people on 
whom their power rests.”171 

If the objective of Western policy is to achieve a radical transforma-
tion in Russian policy by altering the composition or the mindset of 
the Russian leadership today, it is doomed to fail. Such an approach 
would clearly overreach in terms of the West’s actual capacity to 
influence events within Russia and its immediate neighborhood. As 
Kennan observed of the Soviet Union in the Cold War, the Russians 
are “still by far the weaker force” when gauged against the West as 
a whole. He argued in his telegram that “their success will really de-
pend on [the] degree of cohesion, firmness and vigor which Western 
World can muster. And this is [a] factor which it is within our power 
to influence.”172
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Effective containment, in Kennan’s view, required not only cohesion for 
the sake of resisting the Kremlin’s “divide and conquer” tactics within 
the Western camp, but also consistency over time and across many re-
lated areas of national life and state policy. He advised the United States 
to “formulate and put forward for other nations a much more positive 
and constructive picture of [the] sort of world we would like to see than 
we have put forward in [the] past. It is not enough to urge people to 
develop political processes similar to our own. Many foreign peoples, 
in Europe at least, are tired and frightened by experiences of [the] past, 
and are less interested in abstract freedom than in security.”173 Far 
from a dated reference to Europe’s exhaustion and vulnerability in the 
aftermath of World War II, Kennan’s words capture the renewed sense 
of vulnerability to internal and external threats in Europe today. They also 
underscore the continuing indispensability of U.S. leadership. 

The West’s challenge in response to Russia’s aggression in Ukraine, 
its exploitation of far-right politics throughout Europe, and its influence 
activities around the globe is not only about defending against such 
measures. The West must strengthen the bulwarks of healthy and 
successful politics, security, and commerce, and it must offer a com-
pelling alternative vision. In Kennan’s words, “It is rather a question of 
the degree to which the United States can create among the peoples 
of the world generally the impression of a country which knows what 
it wants, which is coping successfully with the problems of its internal 
life and with the responsibilities of a world power, and which has a 
spiritual vitality capable of holding its own among the major ideologi-
cal currents of the time.”174 Kennan predicated containment as much 
on Western power, prosperity and liberty as on the need to devise a 
direct response to Soviet power.

THE MISSING PIECE: UNDERSTANDING RUSSIA

In the policy recommendations at the conclusion of his telegram 
Kennan advised Americans to learn much more about Russia, cau-
tioning, “there is nothing as dangerous or as terrifying as the un-
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known.”175 Those words could hardly be truer or more relevant today. 
Yet this absolutely central message of Kennan’s work has all but 
disappeared in the quarter century since the collapse of the Soviet 
Union and the end of the Cold War. Even with Russia constantly in 
the headlines, there has been only limited investment in sustaining 
expertise on Russia in North America and Western Europe over the 
past two decades.

In the United States, Russian area expertise has fallen victim to 
trends promoting quantitative methodology in academia; to across-
the-board cuts to government programs supporting Russian ed-
ucation and research, including cuts of over 50 percent to critical 
language training; and to near complete elimination of advanced 
research fellowships for Americans studying Russia and the region. 
These reductions in the overall pool of academic expertise have been 
reflected inside government as well, where analysts and diplomats 
working in support of policymakers have seen career incentives re-
oriented in favor of other regions, such as the Middle East; or cross-
cutting issues such as counter-terrorism or democracy promotion 
and development have taken precedent.176 The situation in Western 
Europe has been similar, with increasing pressure in recent years for 
area expertise focused on the South, rather than the East.

As a recent study of Russia expertise in the United States conclud-
ed, “Russian studies within the social sciences are facing a crisis.” 
Political science faculties in the top three-dozen U.S. universities 
have together awarded an average of only seven PhDs per year 
with at least a minimum (defined as 25 percent or more) focus on 
Russian area studies. The situation in economics and sociology is 
even more dismal, with a grand total of only four economics and five 
sociology PhDs with a focus on Russia awarded since 2009. Even 
the broader field of Slavic Studies, which includes language, litera-
ture, and culture experts, is in decline, with barely a quarter of its 
PhD graduates from this decade employed in tenure-track teaching 
jobs.177 Given declining interest in Russian studies among incoming 
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students reported for most of the past decade, and the elimination 
of many faculty positions that were previously earmarked for Russian 
specialists, it is no surprise that universities have fewer students en-
rolled in Russia-focused electives and core courses that might equip 
America’s future political, social, and business leaders with even a 
basic knowledge of Russia.

The news is not uniformly negative about Russia expertise in the 
West. Eastern European, Central European and Scandinavian states 
have tended to maintain a much stronger capacity to understand and 
analyze Russia, which has in many cases proven indispensable to 
NATO and the European Union. In fact, the divergence of expertise 
between East and West had become so pronounced by the end 
of the last decade that in many intra-European and Euro-Atlantic 
forums, a de facto division of labor emerged in which representa-
tives of Central and East European member states assumed primary 
responsibility for analyzing and developing collective policy recom-
mendations towards Russia and the former Soviet space. Yet for the 
United States, understanding Russia by proxy is patently inadequate 
to the task at hand.

If we are to follow Kennan’s advice to study Russia with “courage, 
detachment [and] objectivity,” what can we now do to enhance 
Western capacity for developing and implementing an effective, 
comprehensive policy towards Russia? First, the United States and 
Western Europe must restore financial support for the development 
of robust Russian area expertise as a top national security priority.178

Kennan himself underwent his early training in Russian studies at 
the University of Berlin, and then gained close-up expertise on the 
Soviet economy while serving at the U.S. legation in Riga, Latvia. 
Now, as then, universities and research institutions must remain bas-
tions of intellectual freedom, while fostering contacts with govern-
ment and offering timely and policy-relevant insights through publica-
tions, seminars, and media commentary. Kennan’s own academic and 
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professional experience crisscrossing the United States and Europe 
reminds us that the development of Western expertise on Russia 
should be a shared undertaking. Individual institutions and experts 
from North America and all parts of Europe should be encouraged by 
their governments to collaborate.

A few rules of thumb should inform government programs support-
ing scholarship on Russia, and should likewise guide the policy-ori-
ented work of Russia experts themselves. Far too often, the call for 
expertise on Russia from the press, civic groups, private grant-mak-
ers, and government agencies is focused primarily on “understand-
ing Putin” or explaining some specific aspect of “Putin’s Russia.” This 
preoccupation with Putin is echoed in what might be called the “new 
Kremlinology” of think tanks and universities. As one prominent Rus-
sian observer has pointed out, the focus by Westerners on “Putin’s 
Russia” gets it exactly backwards, because the current occupant of 
the Kremlin would be much better understood as “Russia’s Putin.”179 
Though he is certainly an authoritarian ruler, Putin holds onto power 
by coopting and giving voice to broadly held views in Russian soci-
ety, reflective of current and past experiences shared by millions of 
Russians.180

Finally, while close study of Russia can cast considerable light on the 
trends and context influencing elite decision-making, there is gener-
ally little basis for the type of palantir-gazing “Kremlinology” depicted 
in films and spy novels. These approaches also seem to neglect a 
vital lesson of the Cold War, during which not even the most inge-
nious Russia watchers had much success reading the minds of the 
Kremlin elite, much less predicting the most consequential develop-
ments in Soviet foreign policy or within the Soviet Union itself. As a 
former senior U.S. diplomat recalled, even by the summer of 1991, 
most Russia experts in government and universities were expecting 
that during the following year, Moscow would at most slightly relax 
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its control over the Baltic republics, but that the Soviet Union would 
remain intact for a long time to come.181

THE LONG ROAD AHEAD

Kennan’s firsthand analysis of Russia in the early years of the Cold 
War, and his recipe for a sophisticated, sustained containment 
policy, have enjoyed renewed relevance to key elements of the 
recent Western policy response to Russia. Faced with the Russian 
annexation of Crimea and invasion of Eastern Ukraine, the West 
has imposed punitive economic, political, and diplomatic sanctions, 
maintaining a broadly united front against considerable political 
countercurrents, thereby deepening Russia’s self-imposed isolation 
from much of the global economy. Western government assistance 
has also strengthened Ukraine’s ability to defend its sovereignty and 
to conduct extremely difficult but vital reforms aimed at rooting out 
corruption and breaking the monopoly on power of a few oligarchic 
cliques. 

These efforts have hardly had a transformative impact on either Rus-
sian policy or Ukraine’s political, social, and economic hardships, but 
if considered in terms of Kennan’s containment doctrine, they need 
not do so. Rather, Western policy toward Russia today, just as in the 
Cold War, should be oriented towards success over the longer term. 
Strengthening the pillars of the West’s manifold economic, politi-
cal, and cultural accomplishments will attract individuals and whole 
societies caught between the geopolitical forces of Russia and the 
West, and by the same token blunt Russian interventions designed 
to exploit internal weakness, to manipulate civilizational divides (such 
as the divide between Latin and Orthodox Christianity in Europe) or 
to sow divisions within NATO or the European Union. 

The West can also choose not to let Russia set the agenda of tit-for-
tat competition worldwide. This will deny the Kremlin one of its most 
powerful fonts of anti-Western propaganda and leave Russians to 
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decide for themselves whether they are satisfied with their political 
leaders and their country’s role in the world. Targeted and sustained 
investments in enhancing the West’s capacity to understand Rus-
sia can help divorce fact from fantasy and illuminate not only what 
Russians think about their own country and the world, but why they 
think it. 

Today, some in the West might find Kennan’s vision of containment 
unsatisfying. Many already argue that Russia’s military aggression, 
defiance of basic international norms, and attempts at geopolitical 
and even historical revisionism deserve a tougher and more imme-
diate response.182 Kennan faced strenuous opposition from more 
hawkish colleagues, most famously Paul Nitze, who thought about 
the Cold War as “a battle of will and numbers,” and argued for over-
whelming the Soviets with superior capabilities and deployments 
across the board.183

A policy of containment will not succeed if it is perceived as the path 
of least resistance, or if the term is invoked merely to paper over 
internal political differences. If the West is to revive containment as a 
guiding principle of its Russia policy, then it is essential to give it the 
full and consistent application Kennan intended. Only a new contain-
ment doctrine of this kind is the right response to Russia’s current 
challenge.
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on the staff of the National Security Council. He was awarded the 
Presidential Citizens Medal for his contributions to the development 



211

and articulation of U.S. policy during Operations Desert Shield and 
Desert Storm. He is also the author or editor of thirteen books on 
U.S. foreign policy and international relations.

Paul Heer, National Intelligence Officer for East Asia (2007-2015) 

Paul Heer has had a 30-year career as an analyst at the Central Intelli-
gence Agency. He subsequently served as the Robert E. Wilhelm 
Fellow at the Center for International Studies at the Massachusetts 
Institute of Technology, and as an Adjunct Professor at The George 
Washington University’s Elliott School of International Relations. He 
is the author of Mr. X and the Pacific: George F. Kennan and Ameri-
can Policy in East Asia (Cornell University Press, 2018).

Michael Kimmage, Professor of History, The Catholic University of 
America

Michael Kimmage served from 2014 2017 on the Secretary of State’s  
Policy Planning Staff, where he held the Russia/Ukraine portfolio. His 
most recent book, The Abandonment of the West: The History of an 
Idea in American Foreign Policy, is forthcoming with Basic Books in  
April 2020.

Ivan Kurilla , Professor of History and International Relations at the 
European University at St. Petersburg

Ivan Kurilla’s books include (in English) an edited volume with Victoria 
Zhuraleva Russian/Soviet Studies in the United States, Amerikanis-
tika in Russia: Mutual Representations in Academic Projects (Lex-
ington, 2016) and (in Russian) Istoriya, ili Proshloe v nastoyashchem 
[History, or the Past in Present] (EUSP Press, 2017) and Zaklyatye 
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druzia: Istoriya mneniy, fantazii, kontaktov, vzaimo(ne)ponimania Ros-
sii i SShA [Frenemies: History of opinions, fantasies, contacts and 
mutual (mis)understanding of Russia and the United States] (NLO, 
2018).

Matthew Rojansky, Director, Kennan Institute, Wilson Center

Matthew Rojansky is Director of the Kennan Institute at the Wood-
row Wilson Center. An expert on U.S. relations with the states of the 
former Soviet Union, especially Russia, Ukraine, Belarus and Moldo-
va, he has advised governments, intergovernmental organizations, 
and major private actors on conflict resolution and efforts to enhance 
shared security throughout the Euro-Atlantic and Eurasian region. 
Previously, Rojansky was Deputy Director of the Russia and Eurasia 
Program at the Carnegie Endowment for International Peace, where 
he founded Carnegie’s Ukraine Program, led a multi-year project to 
support U.S.-Russia health cooperation, and created a track-two task 
force to promote resolution of the Moldova-Transnistria conflict. Ro-
jansky is an adjunct professor at Johns Hopkins SAIS, and serves as 
U.S. Executive Secretary for the Dartmouth Conference, a track-two 
U.S.-Russian conflict resolution initiative begun in 1960.

Dennis Ross, Counselor and William Davidson Distinguished Fellow, 
The Washington Institute for Near East Policy

Dennis Ross is Counselor and William Davidson Distinguished Fellow 
at The Washington Institute for Near East Policy. Prior to returning 
to the Institute in 2011, he served two years as special assistant to 
President Barack Obama and National Security Council senior direc-
tor for the Central Region, and a year as special advisor to Secretary 
of State Hillary Rodham Clinton. Previously, for more than twelve 
years Amb. Ross played a leading role in shaping U.S. involvement in 
the Middle East peace process and dealing directly with the parties 
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in negotiations. He served as U.S. point man on the peace process 
during both the George H. W. Bush and Bill Clinton administrations. 
Amb. Ross has authored numerous books on the peace process, the 
Middle East, and international relations. His newest book, co-writ-
ten with his Washington Institute colleague David Makovsky, is Be 
Strong and of Good Courage: How Israel’s Most Important Leaders 
Shaped Its Destiny.

 Anne-Marie Slaughter, CEO of New America

Anne-Marie Slaughter is the CEO of New America, a think and action 
tank dedicated to renewing America in the Digital Age. She is also 
the Bert G. Kerstetter ‘66 University Professor Emerita of Politics 
and International Affairs at Princeton University. From 2009–2011 she 
served as director of Policy Planning for the United States Depart-
ment of State, the first woman to hold that position. Upon leaving 
the State Department she received the Secretary’s Distinguished 
Service Award for her work leading the Quadrennial Diplomacy and 
Development Review, as well as meritorious service awards from 
USAID and the Supreme Allied Commander for Europe. Prior to 
her government service, Dr. Slaughter was the Dean of Princeton’s 
Woodrow Wilson School of Public and International Affairs from 
2002–2009 and the J. Sinclair Armstrong Professor of International, 
Foreign, and Comparative Law at Harvard Law School from  
1994-2002.

Jake Sullivan, distinguished fellow at Dartmouth College and a se-
nior fellow at the Carnegie Endowment of International Peace. 

Jake Sullivan served in the Obama administration as Director of Poli-
cy Planning under Secretary of State Hillary Clinton and subsequent-
ly as National Security Adviser to Vice President Joe Biden. 
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Jeremi Suri, Mack Brown Distinguished Chair for Leadership in 
Global Affairs at the University of Texas at Austin, where he is a pro-
fessor in the Department of the History and the Lyndon B. Johnson 
School of Public Affairs. 

Jeremi Suri is the author and editor of nine books on international 
affairs, history, diplomacy, and strategy — most recently: The Im-
possible Presidency: The Rise and Fall of America’s Highest Office. 
Professor Suri also hosts a weekly podcast on history and politics: 
“This is Democracy.” 

John Tefft, Senior Fellow at the RAND Corporation

John Tefft retired from the US Foreign Service in October 2017, after 
a 45-year career that included serving as the United States ambassa-
dor in Russia, Ukraine, Georgia, and Lithuania.  

Grace Kennan Warnecke, writer, award-winning TV producer and 
entrepreneur. 

Grace Kennan Warnecke’s recently published memoir, “Daughter 
of the Cold War,” describes her journey from growing up as the 
daughter of Ambassador George Kennan to an adulthood running 
projects that have involved the United States, Russia, and Ukraine. 
She serves as Chairman of the Board of the National Committee on 
American Foreign Policy and is a member of the Advisory Council of 
the Kennan Institute.
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